ORDINANCE NO. 19-1001

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington, relating to Wireless Communications, adopting
interim land use regulations and official controls pursuant to RCW
35A.63.220 and RCW 36.70A.390 for Small Wireless Facilities and
Eligible Facilities Requests, establishing a work program, declaring
an emergency, adopting findings of fact pursuant to RCW
36.70A.390, and establishing an effective date.

WHEREAS, the City Council acknowledges that the growing use of smart phones and
other personal wireless devices create a substantial need for wireless data transmission and
therefore deems it in the public interest to adopt provisions related to small wireless facilities; and

WHEREAS, on June 26, 2018, the City entered into franchise agreements with Verizon
(Ordinance 18-1022), Mobilitie (Ordinance 18-1023), and AT&T Wireless (Ordinance 18-1024),
to provide for the deployment of small wireless facilities, and those agreements require these
companies obtain permits and approvals consistent with the City’s land use codes; and

WHEREAS, on September 26, 2018, the Federal Communications Commission (FCC)
adopted a declaratory ruling and order that preempts local authority on the siting of small wireless
facilities and sets specific review requirements for small wireless facilities permitting. The
effective date of the new FCC rules is January 14, 2019; and

WHEREAS, the potential conflict between the City’s existing land use review process for
wireless communications and the preemptive federal review requirements for small wireless
facilities create a time sensitive emergency requiring the adoption of an interim zoning ordinance;
and

WHEREAS, the City of SeaTac is authorized to impose interim land use controls for up

to one (1) year if a work plan is developed for related studies providing for such longer periods

pursuant to RCW 35A.63.220 and RCW 36.70A.390; and


kristina
Typewritten Text
19-1001


WHEREAS, the FCC also enacted regulations to implement Section 6409(a) of the
Spectrum Act, specifically the creation of eligible facilities requests governing the modifications
of wireless communications facilities; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of the recent franchise agreements and FCC ruling require
amendments to the City’s zoning code in order to provide for design guidelines and procedures to
be used in the consideration of applications for small wireless facility permits; and

WHEREAS, a public hearing on these interim regulations will be scheduled within sixty
(60) days of ordinance adoption, pursuant to RCW 35A.63.220 and RCW 36.70A.390; and

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Recitals Incorporated. The Recitals set forth above are hereby adopted and
incorporated as Findings of Fact of the City Council.

Section 2. Additional Findings. The Council may adopt further additional findings after
the public hearing is held and evidence presented to the City Council. The City Council further
enters the following additional findings:

. This Ordinance is consistent with and will implement the City’s Comprehensive
Plan and bears a substantial relation to the public health, safety and welfare.

2. This Ordinance is in the best interest of the City’s 29,130 residents.

3. This Ordinance has been processed, reviewed, considered and adopted in material
compliance with all applicable state and local procedural requirements codified in
Chapter 36.70A RCW.

Section 3. Notwithstanding the provisions of SMC 15.480.010, Small Wireless Facilities
and Eligible Facilities Requests shall be regulated through this Ordinance, and not SMC Chapter
15.480.

Section 4. The purpose of this ordinance is to set forth the regulations for the placement,
development, permitting, and removal of small wireless facilities and the processing of eligible
facilities requests. Among the purposes included are to:

A. Minimize potential adverse visual, aesthetic, and safety impacts of small wireless
facilities.



|8

Establish objective standards for the placement of small wireless facilities.

Ensure that such standards allow competition and do not unreasonably discriminate
among providers of functionally equivalent services.

Encourage the design of such small wireless facilities to be aesthetically and
architecturally compatible with the surrounding built and natural environments
where possible.

Encourage the collocation or attachment of small wireless facilities on existing
support structures to help minimize the total number and impact of such structures

throughout the community.

Process Eligible Facilities Requests consistent with federal requirements.

Section 8. In addition to the land use definitions in SeaTac Municipal Code Chapter 15.105
and Section 15.480.020 the following definitions apply to this ordinance; however, should any
term defined in this Section 5 also be defined elsewhere in Title 15 of the SeaTac Municipal Code,
the definition in this Section 5 shall apply:

Definitions.

A.

“Antenna” means any exterior apparatus designed for telephonic, radio, data,
Internet or other communications through the sending and/or receiving of radio
frequency signals including, but not limited to, equipment attached to a tower,
utility pole, building or other structure for the purpose of providing wireless
services.

“Co-location” means (1) mounting or installing an antenna facility on a pre-existing
structure, and/or (2) modifying a structure for the purpose of mounting or installing
an antenna facility on that structure. Provided that, for purposes of Eligible
Facilitiecs Requests, “collocation” means the mounting or installation of
transmission equipment on an eligible support structure for the purpose of
transmitting and/or receiving radio frequency signals for communications
purposes.

“Macro facility” means is a large wireless communication facility that provides
radio frequency coverage for a cellular telephone network. Generally, macro cell
antennas arc mounted on ground-based towers, rooftops and other existing
structures, at a height that provides a clear view over the surrounding buildings and
terrain. Macro cell facilities typically contain antennas that are greater than three
cubic feet per antenna and typically cover large geographic areas with relatively
high capacity and may be capable of hosting multiple wireless service providers.

“Small wireless facility” has the same meaning as defined in 47 CFR 1.6002.



“Structure” means a pole, tower, base station, or other building, whether or not it
has an existing antenna facility, that is used or to be used for the provision of
personal wireless service (whether on its own or comingled with other types of
services).

“Transmission equipment” means equipment that facilitates transmission for any
FCC-licensed or authorized wireless communication service, including, but not
limited to, radio transceivers, antennas, coaxial or fiber-optic cable, and regular and
backup power supply. The term includes equipment associated with wireless
communications services included, but not limited to, private, broadcast, and public
safety services, as well as unlicensed wireless services and fixed wireless services
such as microwave backhaul.

“Unified enclosure” means a small wireless facility providing concealment of
antennas and equipment within a single enclosure.

“Utility pole” means a structure designed and used primarily for the support of
electrical wires, telephone wires, television cable, traffic signals, or lighting for
streets, parking areas, or pedestrian paths.

Section 6. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Small Wireless General Provisions.

A.

Small wireless facilities shall not be considered nor regulated as essential public
facilities.

Small wireless facilities located outside of the public rights-of-way may be either
a primary or a secondary use. A different use of an existing structure on the same
lot shall not preclude the installation of a small wireless facility.

Small wireless facilities located within the public right-of-way pursuant to a valid
franchise are outright permitted uses in every zone of the City but still require a
small wireless facility permit pursuant to this ordinance.

Section 7. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Small Wireless Deployment.

A.

Overview. In order to manage its rights-of-way in a thoughtful manner which
balances the need to accommodate new and evolving technologies with the
preservation of the natural and aesthetic environment of the City, the City of SeaTac
has adopted this administrative process for the deployment of small wireless
facilities. The City and applicant for a franchise and other permits associated with
the deployment of small wireless facilities face challenges in coordinating
applicable legislative and administrative processes under the Federal
Communications Commission (FCC) regulations. A franchise for the use of the
City’s right-of-way is a contract which requires approval by the City Council. The



small wireless permits are issued by the Public Works Director, or his/her designee.
Applicants are encouraged and expected to provide all related applications in one
submittal, unless they have already obtained a franchise.

B. Application Process. The Public Works Director, or his/her designee, is authorized
to establish franchise and other application forms to gather the information required
by these ordinances from applicants and to determine the completeness of the
application process as provided herein. The application shall include Parts A, B,
and C as described in this subsection below.

1, Franchise. The process typically begins with and depends upon approval of
a franchise for the use of the public right-of-way to deploy small wireless
facilities if any portion of the applicant's facilities are to be located in the
right-of-way. A complete application for a franchise is designated as
Part A. An applicant with a franchise for the deployment of small wireless
facilities in the City may proceed to directly apply for a small wireless
facility permit and related approvals (Parts B and C). An applicant at its
option may utilize phased development. Because franchises are required by
federal law to be competitively neutral, the City has established a franchise
format for use by all right-of-way users.

2. Small Wireless Facility Permits. Part B of the application requires
specification of the small wireless facility components and locations as
further required in the small wireless permit application described in SMC
15.490.050.

3. Associated Permit(s). Part C of the application shall attach all associated
permits requirements such as applications or check lists required under the
Critical Areas, Shoreline or SEPA ordinances. Applicants for deployment
of new small wireless poles shall comply with the requirements in this
Chapter.

4. Leases. An applicant who desires to attach a small wireless facility any
utility pole or light owned by the City shall include an application for a lease
as a component of its application. The Public Works Director, or his/her
designee, is authorized to approve leases in the form approved for general
use by the City Council for any utility pole or light pole in the right-of-way.
Leases for the use of other public property, structures or facilities shall be
submitted to the City Council for approval.

Section 8. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Small Wireless Permit Application.
The following information shall be provided by all applicants for a small wireless permit:

A. The application shall provide specific locational information including GIS



coordinates of all proposed small wireless facilities and specify where the small
wireless facilities will utilize existing, replacement or new poles, towers, existing
buildings and/or other structures. Ground-mounted equipment, conduit, junction
boxes and fiber and electrical connections necessary for and intended for use in the
deployment shall also be specified regardless of whether the additional facilities are
to be constructed by the applicant or leased from a third party. Detailed schematics
and visual renderings of the small wireless facilities, including engineering and
design standards, shall be provided by the applicant. The application shall have
sufficient detail to identify:

1. The location of overhead and wunderground public utility,
telecommunication, cable, water, sewer drainage and other lines and
equipment in the rights-of-way along the proposed route;

P The specific trees, structures, improvements, facilities, lines and equipment,
and obstructions, if any, that applicant proposes to temporarily or
permanently remove or relocate and a landscape plan for protecting,
trimming, removing, replacing, and restoring any trees or areas to be
disturbed during construction.

B If the site location includes a replacement light pole, then the applicant must
submit a photometric analysis of the roadway and sidewalk 150 feet
upstream and downstream of the existing light.

4. Compliance with the aesthetic requirements of this Chapter.

The applicant must show written approval from the owner of any pole or structure
for the installation of its small wireless facilities on such pole or structure. Such
written approval shall include approval of the specific pole, engineering and design
standards, as well as assurances that the specific pole can withstand wind and
seismic loads, from the pole owner, unless the pole owner is the City. Submission
of the lease agreement between the owner and the applicant is not required. For
city-owned poles or structures, the applicant must obtain a lease from the City prior
to or concurrent with the small wireless permit application and must submit as part
of the application the information required in the lease for the City to evaluate the
usage of a specific pole.

If the application is for a new or replacement light pole, then the applicant must
provide a photometric analysis.

The applicant can batch multiple small wireless facility sites in one application.
The applicant 1s encouraged to batch the small wireless facility sites within an
application in a contiguous service area.



Any application for a small wireless facility located in the right-of-way adjacent to
a parcel zoned for residential use shall demonstrate that it has considered the
following:

l. Whether a small wireless facility is currently installed on an existing pole
in front of the same residential parcel. If a small wireless facility exists,
then the applicant must demonstrate that no technically feasible alternative
location exists which is not in front of the same residential parcel.

2, Whether the proposed small wireless facility can be screened from
residential view by choosing a pole location that is not directly in front of a
window or views.

Any application for a small wireless permit which contains an element which is not
exempt from SEPA review shall simultaneously apply under Chapter 43.21C RCW
and Chapter 16A.23 SMC. Further, any application proposing small wireless
facilities in the Shoreline jurisdiction (pursuant to SMC Title 18) or in Critical
Areas (pursuant to Chapter 15.700 SMC) must indicate that the application is
exempt or comply with the review processes in such codes.

The applicant shall submit a sworn affidavit signed by an RF Engineer with
knowledge of the proposed project affirming that the small wireless facilities will
be compliant with all FCC and other governmental regulations in connection with
human exposure to radio frequency emissions for every frequency at which the
Small Wireless facility will operate. If facilities which generate RF radiation
necessary to the Small Wireless facility are to be provided by a third party, then the
small wireless permit shall be conditioned on an RF Certification showing the
cumulative impact of the RF emissions on the entire installation. The applicant
may provide one emissions report for the entire small wireless deployment if the
applicant is using the same small wireless facility configuration for all installations
within that batch or may submit one emissions report for each subgroup installation
identified in the batch.

The applicant shall provide proof of FCC and other regulatory approvals required
to provide the service(s) or utilize the technologies sought to be installed.

Construction drawings submitted by the applicant shall depict all existing proposed
improvements related to the proposed location, including but not limited to poles,
driveways, ADA ramps, equipment cabinets, street trees and structures within 250
feet from the proposed site. The construction drawings shall also include the
applicant's plan for electric and fiber utilities, all conduits, cables, wires, handholes,
junctions, meters, disconnect switches and any other ancillary equipment or
construction necessary to construct the small wireless facility.

A professional engineer licensed by the State of Washington shall certify in writing,
over his or her seal, that both construction plans and final construction of the small



wireless facilities and structure or pole and foundation are designed to reasonably
withstand wind and seismic loads as established by the International Building Code.
Further, the construction drawings shall depict all existing proposed improvements
related to the proposed location, including but not limited to poles, driveways, ADA
ramps, equipment cabinets, street trees and structures within 250 feet from the
proposed site. The construction drawings shall also include the applicant's plan for
electric and fiber utilities, all conduits, cables, wires, handholds, junctions, meters,
disconnect switches and any other ancillary equipment or construction necessary to
construct the small wireless facility.

K. A traffic control plan.

L. The small wireless facilities permit shall include those elements that are typically
contained in the right-of-way use permit to allow the applicant to proceed with the
build-out of the small wireless facility deployment.

M. Recognizing that small wireless facility technology is rapidly evolving, the Public
Works Director, or his/her designee, is authorized to adopt and publish standards
for the technological and structural safety of City-owned structures and to formulate
and publish application questions for use when an applicant seeks to attach to City-
owned structures.

Section 9. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Small Wireless Review Process.
A. Review. The following provisions relate to review of applications for a small
wireless facility permit.

1. Only complete applications for a small wireless permit containing all
required submission elements described in Section 8 of this ordinance
shall be considered by the City. Incomplete applications that are not made
complete by the applicant within sixty (60) days of initial submission of
the application materials shall be deemed withdrawn.

2; In any zone, upon application for a small wireless permit, the City will
permit small wireless deployment on existing or replacement utility poles
conforming to the City’s generally applicable development and design
standards of this Chapter, except as provided in subsection B below.

R Vertical clearance shall be reviewed by the Public Works Director, or
his/her designee, to ensure that the small wireless facilities will not pose a
hazard to other users of the rights-of-ways.

4. Small wireless facilities may not encroach onto or over private property
or property outside of the right-of-way without the property owner's
express written consent.



5y The City shall make every reasonable effort, consistent with any applicable
provisions of state or federal law, and the preservation of the City’s health,
safety and aesthetic environment, to comply with the Federal presumptively
reasonable time periods for review of facilities for the deployment of small
wireless facilities to the fullest extent possible.

Eligible Facilities Requests. The design approved in a small wireless facility permit
shall be considered concealment elements and such facilities may only be expanded
upon an Eligible Facilities Request described in Section 16 of this ordinance when
the modification does not defeat the concealment elements of the small wireless
facility.

Review of Facilities. Review of the site locations proposed by the applicant shall
be governed by the provisions of 47 USC 253 and 47 USC 332 and other applicable
statutes, regulations and case law. Applicants for franchises and the small wireless
facility permits shall be treated in a competitively neutral and non-discriminatory
manner with other service providers, utilizing supporting infrastructure which is
functionally equivalent, that is, service providers whose facilities are similarly
situated in terms of structure, placement, or cumulative impacts. Small wireless
facility permit review under this ordinance shall neither prohibit nor have the effect
of prohibiting the ability of an applicant to provide telecommunications services.

Final Decision. Any decision by the Public Works Director, or his/her designee,
shall be final and not be subject to administrative appeals.

Withdrawal. Any applicant may withdraw an application submitted pursuant to
Section 8 of this ordinance at any time, provided the withdrawal is in writing and
signed by all persons who signed the original application or their successors in
interest. When a withdrawal is received, the application shall be deemed null and
void. If such withdrawal occurs prior to the Public Works Director’s, or his/her
designee’s, decision, then reimbursement of fees submitted in association with said
application shall be prorated to withhold the amount of City costs incurred in
processing the application prior to time of withdrawal. If such withdrawal is not
accomplished prior to the Public Works Director’s, or his/her designee’s, decision,
there shall be no refund of all or any portion of such fee.

Section 10. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Small Wireless Permit Requirements.

A.

The grantee of any permit shall comply with all of the requirements within the small
wireless permit.

Small wireless facilities installed pursuant to a small wireless facility permit may
proceed to install the approved small wireless facilities without the need for an
additional right-of-way use permit if construction is commenced within thirty (30)



days of approval by providing email or written notice to the Public Works Director,
or his/her designee. Facilities approved in a small wireless permit in which
installation has not commenced within thirty (30) days of the approval of a small
wireless facility permit shall apply for and be issued a right-of-way use permit to
install such small wireless facilities in accordance with the standard requirements
of the City for use of the right-of-way.

Post-Construction As-Builts. Within thirty (30) days after construction of the small
wireless facility, the grantee shall provide the City with as-builts of the small
wireless facilities demonstrating compliance with the permit and site photographs.

Permit Time Limit. Construction of the small wireless facility must be completed
within six (6) months after the approval date by the City. The grantee may request
one (1) extension to be limited to three (3) months, if the applicant cannot construct
the small wireless facility within the original six (6) month period.

Site Safety and Maintenance. The grantee must maintain the small wireless
facilities in safe and working condition. The grantee shall be responsible for the
removal of any graffiti or other vandalism and shall keep the site neat and orderly,
including but not limited to following any maintenance or modifications on the site.

Section 11. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Modifications to Small Wireless Facilities.

A.

If a grantee desires to make a modification to an existing small wireless facility,
including but not limited to expanding or changing the antenna type, increasing the
equipment enclosure, placing additional pole-mounted or ground-mounted
equipment, or modifying the concealment elements, then the applicant shall apply
for a small wireless facility permit.

A small wireless facility permit shall not be required for routine maintenance and
repair of a small wireless facility within the rights-of-way, or the replacement of an
antenna or equipment of similar size, weight, and height, provided that such
replacement does not defeat the concealment elements used in the original
deployment of the small wireless facility, does not impact the structural integrity of
the pole, and does not require pole replacement. Further, a small wireless facility
permit shall not be required for replacing equipment within the equipment
enclosure or reconfiguration of fiber or power to the small wireless facility. Right-
of-way use permits may be required for such routine maintenance, repair or
replacement consistent with SMC Chapter 11.10.



Section 12. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Small Wireless Consolidated Permit.

A.

The issuance of a small wireless permit grants authority to construct small wireless
facilities in the rights-of-way in a consolidated manner to allow the applicant, in
most situations, to avoid the need to seek duplicative approval by both the public
works and the community and economic development departments. If the applicant
requires a new franchise to utilize the right-of-way, the franchise approval may be
consolidated with the small wireless facility permit review if requested by the
applicant. As an exercise of police powers pursuant to RCW 35.99.040(2), the
small wireless facility permit is not a right-of-way use permit, but instead a
consolidated public works and land use permit and the issuance of a small wireless
facility permit shall be governed by the time limits established by federal law for
small wireless facilities.

The general standards applicable to the use of the rights-of-way described in SMC
Chapter 11.10 shall apply to all small wireless facility permits.

Section 13. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Small Wireless Fees and Other Costs.

A.

Application and Review Fee. Any applicant for a franchise pursuant to this
ordinance shall pay an application and review fee or fee deposit in an amount as
determined by the City Council. This application and review fee covers the actual
costs associated with the City’s initial review of the application; provided, however,
that the applicant shall also be required to pay all necessary permit fees. This
application and review fee shall be deposited with the City as part of the application
filed pursuant to this ordinance.

Other City Costs. All grantees shall, within 30 days after written demand therefor,
reimburse the City for all direct and actual costs and expenses incurred by the City
in connection with any grant, modification, amendment, renewal, or transfer of any
franchise.

Permit Fee. Prior to issuance of a right-of-way permit or small wireless facility
permit, the applicant shall pay a permit fee in an amount as determined by the City
Council, or the actual costs incurred by the City in reviewing such permit
application.

Section 14. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

Design and Concealment Standards for Small Wireless Deployments.

Small wireless facility deployments whether permitted in the right-of way under a franchise
agreement or permitted in accordance with this chapter shall conform to the following
design standards:



A. Small wireless facilities attached to existing or replacement non-wooden light poles
and other non-wooden poles in the right-of-way or non-wooden poles outside of
the right-of-way shall conform to the following design criteria:

Antennas and the associated equipment enclosures (including disconnect
switches and other appurtenant devices) shall be fully concealed within the
pole, unless such concealment is otherwise technically infeasible, or is
incompatible with the pole design, then the antennas and associated
equipment enclosures must be camouflaged to appear as an integral part of
the pole or flush mounted to the pole, meaning no more than six (6) inches
off of the pole, and must be the minimum size necessary for the intended
purpose, not to exceed the volumetric dimensions of small wireless
facilities. If the equipment enclosure is permitted on the exterior of the pole,
the applicant is required to place the equipment enclosure behind any
banners or road signs that may be on the pole, provided that such location
does not interfere with the operation of the banners or signs.

The furthest point of any antenna or equipment enclosure may not extend
more than twenty (20) inches from the face of the pole.

All conduit, cables, wires and fiber must be routed internally in the non-
wooden pole. Full concealment of all conduit, cables, wires and fiber is
required within mounting brackets, shrouds, canisters or sleeves if attaching
to exterior antennas or equipment.

An antenna on top of an existing pole may not extend more than six (6) feet
above the height of the existing pole and the diameter may not exceed
sixteen (16) inches, measured at the top of the pole, unless the applicant can
demonstrate that more space is needed. The antennas shall be integrated
into the pole design so that it appears as a continuation of the original pole,
including colored or painted to match the pole, and shall be shrouded or
screened to blend with the pole except for canister antennas which shall not
require screening. All cabling and mounting hardware/brackets from the
bottom of the antenna to the top of the pole shall be fully concealed and
integrated with the pole.

Any replacement pole shall substantially conform to the design of the pole
it is replacing or the neighboring pole design standards utilized within the
contiguous right-of-way.

The height of any replacement pole may not extend more than ten (10) feet
above the height of the existing pole or the minimum additional height
necessary; provided that the height of the replacement pole cannot be
extended further by additional antenna height,



The diameter of a replacement pole shall comply with the City’s setback
and sidewalk clearance requirements and shall, to the extent technically
feasible, not be more than a 25% increase of the existing non-wooden pole
measured at the base of the pole, unless additional diameter is needed in
order to conceal equipment within the base of the pole, and shall comply
with the requirements in subsection E(4) of this Section.

The use of the pole for the siting of a small wireless facility shall be
considered secondary to the primary function of the pole. If the primary
function of a pole serving as the host site for a small wireless facility
becomes unnecessary, the pole shall not be retained for the sole purpose of
accommodating the small wireless facility and the small wireless facility
and all associated equipment shall be removed.

Wooden pole design standards. Small wireless facilities located on wooden poles
shall conform to the following design criteria:

l.

The wooden pole at the proposed location may be replaced with a taller pole
for the purpose of accommodating a small wireless facility; provided, that
the replacement pole shall not exceed a height that is a maximum of ten (10)
feet taller than the existing pole, unless a further height increase is required
and confirmed in writing by the pole owner and that such height extension
is the minimum extension possible to provide sufficient separation and/or
clearance from electrical and wireline facilities.

A pole extender may be used instead of replacing an existing pole but may
not increase the height of the existing pole by more than ten (10) feet, unless
a further height increase is required and confirmed in writing by the pole
owner and that such height increase is the minimum extension possible to
provide sufficient separation and/or clearance from electrical and wireline
facilities. A “pole extender” as used herein is an object affixed between the
pole and the antenna for the purpose of increasing the height of the antenna
above the pole. The pole extender shall be painted to approximately match
the color of the pole and shall substantially match the diameter of the pole
measured at the top of the pole.

Replacement wooden poles must either match the approximate color and
materials of the replaced pole or shall be the standard new wooden pole
used by the pole owner in the City.

Antennas, equipment enclosures, and all ancillary equipment, boxes and
conduit shall be colored or painted to match the approximate color of the
surface of the wooden pole on which they are attached.

Antennas shall not be mounted more than twelve (12) inches from the
surface of the wooden pole.



10.

1.

Antennas should be placed in an effort to minimize visual clutter and
obtrusiveness. Multiple antennas are permitted on a wooden pole provided
that each antenna enclosure shall not be more than three (3) cubic feet in
volume.

A canister antenna may be mounted on top of an existing wooden pole,
which may not exceed the height requirements described in subsection B(1)
above. A canister antenna mounted on the top of a wooden pole shall not
exceed sixteen (16) inches, measured at the top of the pole, and shall be
colored or painted to match the pole. The canister antenna must be placed
to look as if it is an extension of the pole. In the alternative, the applicant
may propose a side mounted canister antenna, so long as the inside edge of
the antenna is no more than twelve (12) inches from the surface of the
wooden pole. All cables shall be concealed either within the canister
antenna or within a sleeve between the antenna and the wooden pole.

The furthest point of any antenna or equipment enclosure may not extend
more than twenty (20) inches from the face of the pole.

An omni-directional antenna may be mounted on the top of an existing
wooden pole, provided such antenna is no more than four (4) feet in height
and is mounted directly on the top of a pole or attached to a sleeve made to
look like the exterior of the pole as close to the top of the pole as technically
feasible. All cables shall be concealed within the sleeve between the bottom
of the antenna and the mounting bracket.

All related equipment, including but not limited to ancillary equipment,
radios, cables, associated shrouding, microwaves, and conduit which are
mounted on wooden poles shall not be mounted more than six (6) inches
from the surface of the pole, unless a further distance is technically required,
and is confirmed in writing by the pole owner.

Equipment for small wireless facilities must be attached to the wooden pole,
unless otherwise permitted to be ground-mounted pursuant to subsection of
the Section. The equipment must be placed in the smallest enclosure
possible for the intended purpose. The equipment enclosure and all other
wireless equipment associated with the utility pole, including wireless
equipment associated with the antenna and any pre-existing associated
equipment on the pole, may not exceed twenty-eight (28) cubic feet.
Multiple equipment enclosures may be acceptable if designed to more
closely integrate with the pole design and does not cumulatively exceed
twenty-eight (28) cubic feet. The applicant is encouraged to place the
equipment enclosure behind any banners or road signs that may be on the
pole, provided that such location does not interfere with the operation of the
banners or signs.



12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

An applicant who desires to enclose both its antennas and equipment within
one unified enclosure may do so, provided that such enclosure is the
minimum size necessary for its intended purpose and the enclosure and all
other wireless equipment associated with the pole, including wireless
equipment associated with the antenna and any pre-exiting associated
equipment on the pole does not exceed twenty-eight (28) cubic feet. The
unified enclosure may not be placed more than six (6) inches from the
surface of the pole, unless a further distance is required and confirmed in
writing by the pole owner. To the extent possible, the unified enclosure
shall be placed so as to appear as an integrated part of the pole or behind
banners or signs, provided that such location does not interfere with the
operation of the banners or signs.

The visual effect of the small wireless facility on all other aspects of the
appearance of the wooden pole shall be minimized to the greatest extent
possible.

The use of the wooden pole for the siting of a small wireless facility shall
be considered secondary to the primary function of the pole. If the primary
function of a pole serving as the host site for a small wireless facility
becomes unnecessary, the pole shall not be retained for the sole purpose of
accommodating the small wireless facility and the small wireless facility
and all associated equipment shall be removed.

The diameter of a replacement pole shall comply with the City’s setback
and sidewalk clearance requirements and shall not be more than a 25%
increase of the existing utility pole measured at the base of the pole.

All cables and wires shall be routed through conduit along the outside of
the pole. The outside conduit shall be colored or painted to match the pole.
The number of conduit shall be minimized to the number technically
necessary to accommodate the small wireless.

Small wireless facilities attached to existing buildings, shall conform to the
following design criteria:

[

Small wireless facilities may be mounted to the sides of a building if the
antennas do not interrupt the building’s architectural theme.

The interruption of architectural lines or horizontal or vertical reveals is
discouraged.

New architectural features such as columns, pilasters, corbels, or other
ornamentation that conceal antennas may be used if it complements the
architecture of the existing building.



Small wireless facilities shall utilize the smallest mounting brackets
necessary in order to provide the smallest offset from the building.

Skirts or shrouds shall be utilized on the sides and bottoms of antennas in
order to conceal mounting hardware, create a cleaner appearance, and
minimize the visual impact of the antennas. Exposed cabling/wiring is
prohibited.

Small wireless facilities shall be painted and textured to match the adjacent
building surfaces.

Small wireless facilities mounted on cables strung between existing utility poles
shall conform to the following standards.

1.

2.

Each strand mounted facility shall not exceed three (3) cubic feet in volume;

Only one strand mounted facility is permitted per cable between any two
existing poles;

The strand mounted devices shall be placed as close as possible to the
nearest utility pole, in no event more than five (5) feet from the pole unless
a greater instance technically necessary or is required by the pole owner for
safety clearance;

No strand mounted device shall be located in or above the portion of the
roadway open to vehicular traffic;

Ground-mounted equipment to accommodate a shared mounted facility is
not permitted except when placed in pre-existing equipment cabinets; and

Pole mounted equipment shall comply with the requirements of subsections
A and B of this Section.

Such strand mounted devices must be installed to cause the least visual
impact and without excess exterior cabling or wires (other than the original

strand).

Strand mounted facilities are prohibited on non-wooden poles.

General Requirements.

Ground-mounted equipment in the rights-of-way is prohibited, unless such
facilities are placed underground or the applicant can demonstrate that pole
mounted or undergrounded equipment is technically infeasible. If ground-
mounted equipment is necessary, then the applicant shall submit a



10.

concealment element plan. Generators located in the rights-of-way are
prohibited.

No equipment shall be operated so as to produce noise in violation of
Chapter 173-60 WAC.

Small wireless facilities are not permitted on traffic signal poles unless
denial of the siting could be a prohibition or effective prohibition of the
applicant’s ability to provide telecommunications service in violation of 47
USC §§ 253 and 332.

Replacement poles and new poles shall comply with the Americans with
Disabilities Act (ADA), City construction and sidewalk clearance
standards, city ordinance, and state and federal laws and regulations in order
to provide a clear and safe passage within the rights-of-way. Further, the
location of any replacement or new pole must: be physically possible,
comply with applicable traffic warrants, not interfere with utility or safety
fixtures (e.g., fire hydrants, traffic control devices), and not adversely affect
the public welfare, health or safety.

Replacement poles shall be located as near as possible to the existing pole
with the requirement to remove the abandoned pole.

No signage, message or identification other than the manufacturer’s
identification or identification required by governing law is allowed to be
portrayed on any antenna or equipment enclosure. Any permitted signage
shall be located on the equipment enclosures and be of the minimum amount
possible to achieve the intended purpose (no larger than 4x6 inches);
provided that, signs are permitted as concealment element techniques where
appropriate.

Antennas and related equipment shall not be illuminated except for security
reasons, required by a federal or state authority, or unless approved as part
of a concealment element plan.

Side arm mounts for antennas or equipment must be the minimum extension
necessary and for wooden poles may be no more than twelve (12) inches
off the pole and for non-wooden poles no more than six (6) inches off the
pole.

The preferred location of a small wireless facility on a pole is the location
with the least visible impact.

Antennas, equipment enclosures, and ancillary equipment, conduit and
cable, shall not dominate the structure or pole upon which they are attached.



11.

12.

13.

Except for locations in the right-of-way, small wireless facilities are not
permitted on any property containing a residential use in the residential
Zones.

The City may consider the cumulative visual effects of small wireless
facilities mounted on poles within the rights-of-way in when assessing
proposed siting locations so as to not adversely affect the visual character
of the City. This provision shall not be applied to limit the number of
permits issued when no alternative sites are reasonably available nor to
impose a technological requirement on the applicant.

These design standards are intended to be used solely for the purpose of
concealment and siting. Nothing herein shall be interpreted or applied in a
manner which dictates the use of a particular technology. When strict
application of these requirements would unreasonably impair the function
of the technology chosen by the applicant, alternative forms of concealment
or deployment may be permitted which provide similar or greater
protections from negative visual impacts to the streetscape.

Section 15. The following new Section is hereby adopted:

New Poles in the Rights-of-Way for Small Wireless Facilities.
A. New poles, as compared to replacement poles, within the rights-of-way are only
permitted if the applicant can establish that:

1.

The proposed small wireless facility cannot be located on an existing utility
pole or light pole, electrical transmission tower or on a site outside of the
public rights-of-way such as a public park, public property, building,
transmission tower or in or on a non-residential use in a residential zone
whether by roof or panel-mount or separate structure;

pa The proposed small wireless facility receives approval for a concealment
element design, as described in subsection C of this Section;

3. The proposed small wireless facility also complies with the City’s Shoreline
Master Program, SMC Title 18, and SEPA, Chapter 16A.23 SMC, if
applicable; and

4. No new poles shall be located in a critical area or associated buffer required
by the City’s Critical Areas Ordinance (Chapter 15.700 SMC), except when
determined to be exempt pursuant to said ordinance.

B. An application for a new pole is subject to a Type 1 review.
C. The concealment element design shall include the design of the screening, fencing

or other concealment technology for a tower, pole, or equipment structure, and all



related transmission equipment or facilities associated with the proposed small
wireless facility, including but not limited to fiber and power connections.

l. The concealment element design should seek to minimize the visual
obtrusiveness of the small wireless facility. The proposed pole or structure
should have similar designs to existing neighboring poles in the rights-of-
way, including similar height to the extent technically feasible. Any
concealment element design for a small wireless facility on a decorative
pole should attempt to mimic the design of such pole and integrate the small
wireless facility into the design of the decorative pole. Other concealment
methods include, but are not limited to, integrating the installation with
architectural features or building design components, utilization of
coverings or concealment devices of similar material, color, and texture - or
the appearance thereof - as the surface against which the installation will be
seen or on which it will be installed, landscape design, or other camouflage
strategies appropriate for the type of installation. Applicants are required
to utilize designs in which all conduit and wirelines are installed internally
in the structure. Further, applicant designs should, to the extent technically
possible, comply with the generally applicable design standards adopted
pursuant to Section 14 of this ordinance.

2. If the Public Works Director, or his/her designee, has already approved a
concealment element design either for the applicant or another small
wireless facility along the same public right-of-way or for the same pole
type, then the applicant shall utilize a substantially similar concealment
element design, unless it can show that such concealment element design is
not physically or technologically feasible, or that such deployment would
undermine the generally applicable design standards.

Even if an alternative location is established pursuant to subsection (A)(1) and
(A)(2), the Public Works Director, or his/her designee, may determine that a new
pole in the right-of-way is in fact a superior alternative based on the impact to the
City, the concealment element design, the City’s Comprehensive Plan and the
added benefits to the community.

Prior to the issuance of a permit to construct a new pole or ground-mounted
equipment in the right-of-way, the applicant must obtain a site-specific agreement
from the City to locate such new pole or ground-mounted equipment. This
requirement also applies to replacement poles that are higher than the replaced pole,
and the overall height of the replacement pole and the proposed small wireless
facility 1s more than sixty (60) feet.

These design standards are intended to be used solely for the purpose of
concealment and siting. Nothing herein shall be interpreted or applied in a manner
which dictates the use of a particular technology. When strict application of these
requirements would unreasonably impair the function of the technology chosen by



the applicant, alternative forms of concealment or deployment may be permitted
which provide similar or greater protections of the streetscape.

Section 16. The following additional definitions shall only apply to eligible facilities
requests as described in this Section. Should any term defined in this Section also be
defined elsewhere in Title 15 of the SeaTac Municipal Code or in Section 5 of this
ordinance, the definition in this Section 16 shall apply.

Eligible Facilities Requests.
A. Additional Definitions.

l. “Base Station’: A structure or equipment at a fixed location that enables
FCC-licensed or authorized wireless communications between user
equipment and a communications network. The term does not encompass
a tower as defined herein nor any equipment associated with a tower. Base
Station includes, without limitation:

a. Equipment associated with wireless communications services as
well as unlicensed wireless services and fixed wireless services such
as microwave backhaul.

b. Radio transceivers, antennas, coaxial or fiber-optic cable, regular
and backup power supplies, and comparable equipment, regardless
of technological configuration (including Distributed Antenna
Systems (“DAS”) and small wireless networks).

G Any structure other than a tower that, at the time the relevant
application is filed (with jurisdiction) under this section, supports or
houses equipment described in subparagraph (i) and (ii) above that
has been reviewed and approved under the applicable zoning or
siting process, or under another State or local regulatory review
process, even if the structure was not built for the sole or primary
purpose of providing that support.

d. The term does not include any structure that, at the time the Eligible
Facilities Request application is filed with the City, does not support
or house equipment described in subparagraph (1)(2) and (1)(b)
above.

% “Collocation™ The mounting or installation of transmission equipment on
an eligible support structure for the purpose of transmitting and/or receiving

radio frequency signals for communication purposes.

3. “Director”: The Director of the Community and Economic Development
or designee.

20



“Eligible Facilities Request”: Any request for modification of an existing
tower or base station that does not substantially change the physical
dimensions of such tower or base station, involving:

a. Collocation of new transmission equipment;
b. Removal of transmission equipment; or
C. Replacement of transmission equipment.

“Eligible Support Structure”: Any tower or base station as defined in this
section, provided that it is existing at the time the relevant application is
filed with the City.

“Existing”: A constructed tower or base station is existing if it has been
reviewed and approved under the applicable zoning or siting process, or
under another State or local regulatory review process, provided that a tower
that has not been reviewed and approved because it was not in a zoned area
when it was built, but was lawfully constructed, is existing for purposes of
this definition.

“Substantial Change”: A modification substantially changes the physical
dimensions of an eligible support structure if it meets any of the following
criteria:

a. For towers other than towers in the public rights-of-way, it increases
the height of the tower by more than 10% or by the height of one
additional antenna array with separation from the nearest existing
antenna not to exceed twenty (20) feet, whichever is greater; for
other eligible support structures, it increases the height of the
structure by more than 10% or more than ten (10) feet, whichever is
greater;

b. For towers other than towers in the public rights-of-way, it involves
adding an appurtenance to the body of the tower that would protrude
from the edge of the tower more than twenty (20) feet, or more than
the width of the tower structure at the level of the appurtenance,
whichever is greater; for other eligible support structures, it involves
adding an appurtenance to the body of the structure that would
protrude from the edge of the structure by more than six (6) feet;

C. For any cligible support structure, it involves installation of more
than the standard number of new equipment cabinets for the
technology involved, but not to exceed four cabinets; or, for towers
in the public rights-of-way and Base Stations, it involves installation
of any new equipment cabinets on the ground if there are no pre-

21



existing ground cabinets associated -with the structure, or else
involves installation of ground cabinets that are more than 10%
larger in height or overall volume than any other ground cabinets
associated with the structure;

d. It entails any excavation or deployment outside the current site;

€. It would defeat the concealment elements of the eligible support
structure; or

f. It does not comply with conditions associated with the siting
approval of the construction or modification of the eligible support
structure or base station equipment, provided, however, that this
limitation does not apply to any modification that is non-compliant
only in a manner that would not exceed the thresholds identified
above.

8. “Tower”: Any structure built for the sole or primary purpose of supporting
any FCC-licensed or authorized antennas and their associated facilities,
including structures that are constructed for wireless communications
services including, but not limited to, private, broadcast, and public safety
services, as well as unlicensed wireless services and fixes wireless services
such as microwave backhaul and the associated site.

9. “Transmission Equipment”: Equipment that facilitates transmission for any
FCC-licensed or authorized wireless communication service, including, but
not limited to, radio transceivers, antennas, coaxial or fiber-optic cable, and
regular and backup power supply. The term includes equipment associated
with wireless communications services including, but not limited to,
private, broadcast, and public safety services, as well as unlicensed wireless
services and fixed wireless services such as microwave backhaul.

Application. The Director shall prepare and make publicly available an application
form used to consider whether an application is an Eligible Facilities Request. The
application may not require the applicant to demonstrate a need or business case
for the proposed modification.

Qualification as an Eligible Facilities Request. Upon receipt of an application for
an Eligible Facilities Request, the Director shall review such application to
determine whether the application qualifies as an Eligible Facilities Request.

Timeframe for Review. Within sixty (60) days of the date on which an applicant
submits an Eligible Facilities Request application, the Director shall approve the

application unless it determines that the application is not covered by this section.

Tolling of the Time Frame for Review. The sixty (60) day review period begins to

22



run when the application is filed and may be tolled only by mutual agreement by
the Director and the applicant or in cases where the Director determines that the
application is incomplete. The timeframe for review of an Eligible Facilities
Request is not tolled by a moratorium on the review of applications.

1. To toll the timeframe for incompleteness, the Director shall provide written
notice to the applicant within thirty (30) days of receipt of the application,
clearly and specifically delineating all missing documents or information
required in the application.

2. The timeframe for review begins running again when the applicant makes a
supplemental submission in response to the Director’s notice of
incompleteness.

3. Following a supplemental submission, the Director will notify the applicant

within ten (10) days that the supplemental submission did not provide the
information identified in the original notice delineating missing
information. The timeframe is tolled in the case of second or subsequent
notices pursuant to the procedures identified in this sub-section. Second or
subsequent notice of incompleteness may not specify missing documents or
information that was not delineated in the original notice of incompleteness.

Determination That Application Is Not an Eligible Facilities Request. If the
Director determines that the applicant’s request does not qualify as an Eligible
Facilities Request, the Director shall deny the application.

Failure to Act. In the event the Director fails to approve or deny a request for an
Eligible Facilities Request within the timeframe for review (accounting for any
tolling), the request shall be deemed granted. The deemed grant does not become
effective until the applicant notifies the Director in writing after the review period
has expired (accounting for any tolling) that the application has been deemed
granted.

Section 17. Appeals. Small Wireless Facilities Permit decisions, other than administrative
approvals relating to Small Wireless Facilities and Eligible Facilities Requests, are final decisions.
Approvals or denials of a Small Wireless Facility Permit or Eligible Facilities Requests are
administrative approvals and are not subject to appeal. The timely filing of an appeal of a wireless
communication facility permit decision shall stay the effective date of the decision until such time
as the appeal is concluded or withdrawn.

Section 18. Public Hearing. Pursuant to RCW 35A.63.220 and RCW 36.70A.390, the
City Council will hold a hearing on this interim ordinance within sixty (60) days of adoption in
order to take public testimony. The City Council may, in its discretion, adopt additional findings
justifying the interim development regulations after the close of the hearing.

Section 19. Duration of Interim Regulations. The interim amendments adopted by this

23



ordinance shall remain in effect until one (1) year from the effective date and shall automatically
expire unless the same are extended as provided in RCW 36.70A.390 and RCW 35A.63.220 prior
to that date, or unless the same are repealed or superseded by permanent amendments prior to that

date.

Section 20. Planning Commission Work Program. The City of SeaTac Planning
Commission is hereby directed to review the interim regulations in 2019. The Commission shall
make a recommendation on whether said amendments, or some modification thereof, should be
permanently adopted. The SeaTac Planning Commission is directed to complete its review, to
conduct such public hearings as may be necessary or desirable, and to forward its recommendation
to the SeaTac City Council prior to October 31, 2019. The work program shall include input from
wireless carriers, existing franchisees, and SeaTac staff.

Section 21. Declaration of Emergency. The SeaTac City Council hereby finds and
declares that an emergency exists which necessitates that this ordinance become effective
immediately in order to preserve the public health, safety and welfare of the City of SeaTac,
pursuant to RCW 35A.13.190.

Section 22. Corrections. The City Clerk and codifiers of the ordinance are authorized to
make necessary corrections to this Ordinance including, but not limited to, the correction of
scrivener/clerical errors, references, ordinance numbering, section/subsection numbers and any
references thereto.

Section 23. Severability. If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase
of this Ordinance is declared unconstitutional or invalid for any reason, such invalidity shall not
affect the validity or effectiveness of the remaining portions of this Ordinance.

Section 24. Ordinance not to be codified. This Ordinance shall not be codified. The
City Clerk, shall ensure that a copy of this Ordinance be accessible through the City’s Municipal
Code website (https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/SeaTac/).

Section 25. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force and effect
immediately upon passage, as set forth herein.

ADOPTED this Eshﬁ{'/ day of January, 2019, and signed in authentication thereof on

this Ei day of January, 2019.

CITY OF SEATAC

WW?{mﬁ

Erin Sitterley, Mayor

24



ATTEST:

Krigtina Gregg, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Mais {/l-’(uc(a wt, Bartelo

Mary E. Mi¥ante Bartolo, City Attorney

[Effective Date: ///5///9 |

[Interim Regulations on Wireless Communications]

25



ORDINANCE NO. _19-1002
AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington, amending Sections 13.150.060, 13.150.070,
13.150.080, and 13.150.090 of the SeaTac Municipal Code related
to submission of records to the Fire Code Official.
WHEREAS, the Fire Prevention Division receives paper copies of annual confidence
testing reports, which are required by the International Fire Code; and
WHEREAS, the Puget Sound Regional Fire Authority has begun using a new software
program so these annual confidence testing reports may be submitted electronically; and
WHEREAS, the City Council deems it appropriate to clarify that the Fire Code Official
may dictate the form and manner of the submission of the testing and inspection reports;
NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. Chapter 13.150.060 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.150.060. Amendments to the International Fire Code — Chapter 5, Fire Service Features.
The following local amendments to Chapter 5 of the International Fire Code, entitled “Fire Service
Features,” are adopted and incorporated into the International Fire Code:

A. Section 503 of the International Fire Code is adopted.

B. Subsection 503.2.1 is amended to read as follows:
503.2.1 Dimensions. The following minimum dimensions shall apply
for fire apparatus access roads:

1. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of
not less than 20 feet, except for approved security gates in accordance
with section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less
than 13 feet 6 inches.

2. All fire apparatus access road routes shall be approved.

C. Subsection 503.2.3 is amended to read as follows:


kristina
Typewritten Text
19-1002


503.2.3 Surface. Facilities, buildings, or portions of buildings
constructed shall be accessible to fire department apparatus by way of
an approved fire apparatus access road with asphalt, concrete, or other
approved all-weather driving surface capable of supporting the
imposed load of fire apparatus weighing at least 30 tons in accordance
with the King County Road Standards.

D. Subsection 503.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.5 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of
150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved turnaround.

E. Subsection 503.2.6 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.6 Bridges and elevated surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated
surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge or elevated
surface shall be constructed and maintained in accordance with
specifications established by the fire code official and the public works
director, or their designees; at a minimum, however, the bridge or
elevated surface shall be constructed and maintained in accordance
with AASHTO Standard Specifications for Highway Bridges. Bridges
and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry
the imposed loads of 30 tons or more ton fire apparatus, the total
imposed load to be determined by the fire code official. Vehicle load
limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the
fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency
vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed for such use,
approved barriers, approved signs or both shall be installed and
maintained when required by the fire code official.

F. Subsection 503.2.7 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

503.2.7 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads shall not exceed 15 percent
longitudinally and/or 6 percent laterally in grade. Approach and
departure angle for fire access shall be as determined by the fire code
official.

G. A new subsection 503.2.9 is added to read as follows:

503.2.9 Access road width with a hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is
located on a fire apparatus access road, for 20 feet on either side of the
operating nut the minimum road width shall be 26 feet and may be
marked as a fire lane per Section 503.3.

H. Subsection 503.3 is amended to read as follows:



503.3 Marking. Fire apparatus access roads shall be marked whenever
necessary to maintain the unobstructed minimum required width of
roadways. Subject to the fire code official’s prior written approval,
marked fire apparatus access roads, or fire lanes, may be established or
relocated at the time of plan review, pre-construction site inspection,
and/or post construction site inspection as well as any time during the
life of the occupancy. Only those fire apparatus access roads
established by the fire code official can utilize red marking paint and
the term fire lane. Fire lanes shall be marked as directed by the fire
code official with one or more of the following types of marking in
accordance with the City of SeaTac Design and Construction
Standards:

503.3.1 Type 1. Type 1 marking shall be installed to identify
fire lanes on commercial and multi-family developments or as
directed by the fire code official. The following shall apply to
Type 1 marking:

1. Curbs shall be identifiable by red traffic paint with a 6 inch
wide stripe on the top and front, extending the length of the
designated fire lane.

2. Rolled curbs shall be identified by red traffic paint with a 6
inch wide stripe on the upper most portion of the curb,
extending the length of the designated fire lane.

3. Lanes without curbs shall be identified by red traffic paint
with a 6 inch wide stripe on the pavement, extending the
length of the designated fire lane.

4. The words “NO PARKING — FIRE LANE” shall be in 3
inch stroke white letters 18 inches in height, and placed 8
inches measured perpendicular from the red paint stripe on
the pavement. Locations and intervals will be designated by
the fire code official; marking will not exceed 50 feet apart.
In most cases, both sides of the access road shall be marked.
Where long drives are to be marked, the repetition shall
alternate sides of the drive.

503.3.2 Type 2. Type 2 marking shall be installed to identify
fire lanes in one- and two-family dwelling developments, or as
directed by the fire code official. The following shall apply to
Type 2 marking:

1. Type 2 marking requires metal signs stating “NO
PARKING — FIRE LANE” to be installed at intervals or
locations designated by the fire code official; signage will
not exceed 150 feet apart.



2. The signs shall measure 12 inches in width and 18 inches in
height and have red letters on a white background. Bottom
of sign shall be a minimum of 7 feet from the curb. Signs
shall be nominally parallel to the road, facing the direction
of travel.

3. The sign shall be installed on an approved metal post.

Exception: On construction sites, approved portable or
temporary sign posts and bases may be used.

4. Where fire lanes are adjacent to buildings or structures and
when approved or directed by the fire code official, the signs
may be placed on the face of the building or structure.

503.3.3. Type 3. Type 3 marking shall be installed to address
situations where neither Type 1 or 2 marking are effective or as
directed by the fire code official.

1. Specific areas designated by the fire code official shall be
marked with diagonal striping across the width of the fire lane.
Diagonal marking shall be used in conjunction with painted
curbs and/or edge striping and shall run at an angle of 30 to 60
degrees from one side to the other. These diagonal lines shall be
in red traffic paint, parallel with each other, at least 6 inches in
width, and 24 inches apart. Lettering shall occur as with Type 1
marking.

Subsection 503.7 is added to read as follows:

503.7 Establishment of fire lanes. Fire lanes in conformance with this
code shall be established by the Fire Chief or his/her authorized
designee, and shall be in accordance with 503.7.1 through 503.7.9.

503.7.1 Obstruction of fire lanes prohibited. The obstruction
of a designated fire lane by a parked vehicle or any other object
is prohibited and shall constitute a traffic hazard as defined in
State law and an immediate hazard to life and property.

503.7.2 Existing fire lane signs and markings. The following
signs and markings shall be provided:

1. Signs (minimum nine-inch by 16-inch) may be allowed to
remain until there is a need for replacement and at that time the
sign shall the requirements of section 503.3.2



2. Markings may be allowed to remain until there is a need for
repainting and at that time the provisions outlined in 503.3 shall
be complied with.

503.7.3 Maintenance. Fire lane markings shall be maintained
at the expense of the property owner(s) as often as needed to
clearly identify the designated area as being a fire lane.

503.7.4 Towing notification. At each entrance to property
where fire lanes have been designated, signs shall be posted in
a clearly conspicuous location and shall clearly state that
vehicles parked in fire lanes may be impounded, and the name,
telephone number, and address of the towing firm where the
vehicle may be redeemed.

503.7.5 Responsible property owner. The owner, manager, or
person in charge of any property upon which designated fire
lanes have been established shall prevent the parking of vehicles
or placement of other obstructions in such fire lanes.

503.7.6 Violation — Penalty. Any person who fails to mark or
maintain the marking of a designated fire lane as prescribed
herein, or who obstructs or allows the obstruction of a
designated fire lane, other than the parking of a vehicle, shall be
deemed to have committed a Class 2 civil infraction. The
penalty for violation of this section shall be a maximum
monetary penalty of one hundred twenty-five dollars ($125.00),
not including statutory assessments.

503.7.7 Violation — Civil penalty. In addition to, or as an
alternate to, the penalties specified above, the City is authorized
to enforce all provisions of this chapter, specifically including
civil penalties, pursuant to Chapter 1.15 SMC.

503.7.8 Impoundment. Any vehicle or object obstructing a
designated fire lane is declared a traffic hazard and may be
abated without prior notification to its owner by impoundment
pursuant to the applicable State law. The owner or operator shall
be responsible for all towing and impound charges.

A new subsection 503.8 is added to read as follows:

503.8 Commercial and Industrial Developments. The fire apparatus
access roads serving commercial and industrial developments shall be
in accordance with Sections 503.8.1 through 503.8.3.



K.

L.

503.8.1 Buildings exceeding three stories or 30 feet in height.
Buildings or facilities exceeding 30 feet or three stories in
height shall have at least two means of fire apparatus access for
each structure.

503.8.2 Buildings exceeding 62,000 square feet in area.
Buildings or facilities having a gross building area of more than
62,000 square feet shall be provided with two separate and
approved fire apparatus access roads.

Exception: Projects having a gross building area of up to
124,000 square feet that have a single approved fire apparatus
access road when all buildings area equipped throughout with
approved automatic sprinkler systems.

503.8.3 Remoteness. Where two access roads are required, they
shall be placed a distance apart equal to not less than one half
of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the
property or area to be served, measured in a straight line
between accesses or as approved by the fire code official and
the fire chief.

A new subsection 503.9 is added to read as follows:

503.9 Aerial fire apparatus roads. The fire apparatus access roads that
accommodate aerial fire apparatus shall be in accordance with Sections
503.9.1 through 503.9.3.

503.9.1 Where required. Buildings or portions of buildings or
facilities exceeding 30 feet in height above the lowest level of
fire department access shall be provided with approved fire
apparatus access roads that are capable of accommodating fire
department aerial apparatus.

503.9.2 Width. Fire apparatus access roads shall have a
minimum unobstructed width of 26 feet in the immediate
vicinity of any building or portion of building more than 30 feet
in height.

503.9.3 Proximity to building. At least one of the required
access routes meeting this condition shall be positioned parallel
to one entire side of the building. The location of the parallel
access route shall be approved.

A new subsection 503.10 is added to read as follows:



M.

503.10 Multi-family residential developments. The fire apparatus
access roads serving multi-family residential developments hall be in
accordance with Sections 503.10.1 through 503.10.3.

503.10.1 Projects having more than 100 dwelling units.
Multi-family residential projects having more than 100
dwelling units shall be provided with two separate and approved
fire apparatus access roads.

Exception: Projects having up to 200 dwelling units may have
a single approved fire apparatus access road when all buildings,
including nonresidential occupancies, are equipped throughout
with approved automatic sprinkler systems installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

503.10.2 Projects having more than 200 dwelling units.
Multi-family residential projects having more than 200
dwelling units shall be provided with two separate and approved
fire apparatus access roads regardless of whether they are
equipped with an approved automatic sprinkler system.

503.10.3 Remoteness. Where two access roads are required,
they shall be placed a distance apart equal to not less than one
half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension
of the property or area to be served, measured in a straight line
between accesses or as approved by the fire code official and
fire chief.

A new subsection 503.11 is added to read as follows:

503.11 One- and Two-family residential developments with more
than 30 dwelling units. The fire apparatus access roads serving one-
and two-family residential developments with more than 30 dwelling
units shall be in accordance with Sections 503.11.1 and 503.11.2.

503.11.1 Projects having more than 30 dwelling units.
Developments of one- or two-family dwellings where the
number of dwelling units exceed 30 shall be provided with two
separate and approved fire apparatus access roads.

Exceptions:

1. Where there are more than 30 dwelling units on a single
public or private fire apparatus access road and all dwelling
units are equipped throughout with approved automatic
sprinkler systems installed in accordance with Section



903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3 of the International Fire
Code, access from two directions shall not be required.

2. The number of dwelling units on a single fire apparatus
access road shall not be increased unless fire apparatus
access roads will, within a reasonable time, connect with
future development, as determined by the fire code official.

503.11.2 Remoteness. Where two access roads are required,
they shall be placed a distance apart equal to not less than one
half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension
of the property or area to be served, measured in a straight line
between accesses or as approved by the fire code official and
fire chief.

A new subsection 503.12 is added to read as follows:

503.12 Underground structures. Installation of underground
structures under or within 10 feet of fire apparatus access roads shall be
designed using approved criteria. The criteria shall accommodate for
the loading of fire department aerial apparatus unless otherwise
approved.

A new subsection 507.5.2.1 is added to read as follows:

507.5.2.1. Records. Records of all system inspections, tests and
maintenance required by the referenced standard shall be maintained
on the premises for three years; shall be

the fire code official within
30 calendar days of each test, inspection, or maintenance of the system.

A new subsection 507.5.6 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.6. Physical protection. Where fire hydrants are subject to impact
by a motor vehicle, guard posts shall be designed and installed in
accordance with the local water purveyor’s design and construction
standards.

A new subsection 507.5.7 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.7. Fire hydrant. Fire hydrants shall be designed and installed in
accordance with the local water purveyor’s design and construction
standards.

A new subsection 507.5.8 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.8. Backflow prevention. All private fire systems shall be
isolated by an approved method from the local water purveyor.



S. A new subsection 507.6 is amended to read as follows:

507.6. Capacity for residential areas. All hydrants installed in single
family residential areas shall be capable of delivering 1,500 gpm fire
flow over and above average maximum demands at the farthest point
of the installation.

T. A new subsection 507.7 is amended to read as follows:

507.7. Spacing. The spacing of hydrants shall be in accordance with
Sections 507.7.1 through 507.7.5.

507.7.1. Single family. The maximum fire hydrant spacing
serving single family residential areas shall be 600 feet.

507.7.2. Commercial, industrial and multi-family. The
maximum fire hydrant spacing serving commercial, industrial,
multi-family or other areas shall be 300 feet.

507.7.3. Medians. Where streets are provided with median
dividers which cannot be crossed by firefighters pulling hose
lines hydrants shall be provided on each side of the street and
be arranged on an alternating basis.

507.7.4. Arterials. Where arterial streets are provided with four
or more traffic lanes hydrants shall be provided on each side of
the street and be arranged on an alternating basis.

507.7.5. Transportation. Where new water mains are extended
along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection of
structures or similar fire problems, fire hydrants shall be
provided at a spacing not to exceed 1,000 feet to provide for
transportation hazards.

U. A new subsection 507.8 is amended to read as follows:

507.8. Required hydrants. The number of hydrants required for a
property shall be based on the calculated fire flow. The first hydrant
will be calculated for up to 1,500 gpm. An additional hydrant is
required for every 1,000 gpm, or fraction thereof. The required hydrants
shall be within 600 feet of the property on a fire apparatus road, as
measured by an approved method.

V. A new subsection 507.9 is amended to read as follows:

507.9. Notification. The owner of property on which private hydrants
are located and the public agencies that own or control public hydrants



must provide the fire code official with the following written service
notifications in accordance with 507.9.1 and 507.9.2.

507.9.1. In-service notification. The fire code official shall be
notified when any newly installed hydrant is placed into service.

507.9.2. Out-of-service notifications. Where any hydrant is
out of service or has not yet been placed in service, the hydrant
shall be identified as being out of service and shall be
appropriately marked as out of service, by a method approved
by the fire code official.

W. A new subsection 507.10 is amended to read as follows:
507.10. Water main standards. The installation of water mains shall

be in accordance with 507.10.1 and 507.10.2.

507.10.1. Minimum pipe size. All water mains serving fire
hydrants shall be eight (8) inches in diameter for dead-end
mains and six (6) inches inside diameter for circulating mains.

Exception: Hydrant leads less than fifty (50) feet in
length may be six (6) inches in diameter.

507.10.2. Adopted standards. All water mains shall meet
applicable engineering and health standards adopted by the
State of Washington or the water purveyor.

X. A new subsection 507.11 is amended to read as follows:
507.11. Water purveyor authority. Nothing in this section shall be
construed to prohibit water purveyors from imposing more stringent
requirements for the construction of water mains and fire hydrants.

Y. Subsection 508.1 is amended to read as follows:
508.1 General. Where required by other sections of the code and in all
buildings classified as high-rise or those buildings used as an airport
terminal, a fire command center for fire department operations shall be
provided and shall comply with Sections 508.1.1 through 508.1.6.

Z A new section is added to read as follows:
511 Automatic External Defibrillators

AA. A new subsection 511.1 is added to read as follows:

10



511.1 Where required. Automatic External Defibrillators (AED) shall be installed
on Port properties in accordance with 511.1.1 through 511.1.3.

511.1.1 Terminals. AED’s shall be located in all public circulation spaces
and holdrooms with a maximum travel distance of 150 feet.

511.1.2 Accessory Terminal Spaces. A minimum of (1) AED shall be
located in each airline lounge, club, or tenant breakroom designed to serve
more than 50 occupants.

511.1.3 Other Buildings on Port property. A minimum of (1) AED shall
be located in an obvious location such as an elevator lobby/entrance.

Section 2. Chapter 13.150.070 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.150.070. Amendments to the International Fire Code — Chapter 6, Building Services and
Systems. The following local amendments to Chapter 6 of the International Fire Code, entitled

“Building Services and Systems,” are hereby adopted and incorporated into the International Fire
Code:

A. Subsection 606.6 is amended to read as follows:

606.6. Testing of equipment. Refrigeration equipment and systems
having a refrigerant circuit more than 220 pounds of Group Al or 30
pounds of any other group refrigerant shall be subject to periodic testing
in accordance with Section 606.6.1. A written record of the required
testing shall be maintained on the premises for a minimum of three
years; a copy shall be submitted

the fire code official within 30 calendar days of the testing; and a label
or tag shall be affixed to the individual system identifying the date of
the testing. Tests of emergency devices or systems required by this
chapter shall be conducted by persons trained and qualified in
refrigeration systems.

B. Subsection 609.2 is amended to add the following two subsections to read as follows:

609.2.2. Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in
Section 105.6.

609.2.3. Approved drawing. The stamped and approved cook line
drawing shall be displayed adjacent to the suppression system pull
station prior to the final inspection.

C. Subsection 609.3.3.3 is amended to read as follows:

11



609.3.3.3 Records. Records for inspections shall state the individual and
company performing the inspection, a description of the inspection and
when the inspection took place. Records for cleanings shall state the
individual and company performing the cleaning and when the cleaning
took place. Such records shall be completed after each inspection or
cleaning, maintained on the premises for a minimum of three years; a copy
shall be the fire code
official within 30 days of the inspection or cleaning.

Section 3. Chapter 13.150.080 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.150.080. Amendments to the International Fire Code — Chapter 7, Fire and Smoke
Prevention Features. The following local amendments to Chapter 7 of the International Fire
Code, entitled “Fire and Smoke Prevention Features,” are hereby adopted and incorporated into
the International Fire Code:

A Subsection 703.4 is amended to read as follows:
703.4. Testing. Horizontal, vertical sliding and rolling fire doors shall
be inspected and tested annually to confirm proper operation and full
closure. A written record shall be maintained on the premises for a
minimum of three years; a copy shall be
the fire code official within 30 calendar days of
the inspection or test; and a label or tag shall be affixed to the individual
assembly identifying the date of scheduled confidence test.

Section 4. Chapter 13.150.090 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.150.090. Amendments to the International Fire Code — Chapter 9, Fire Protection
Systems. The following local amendments to Chapter 9 of the International Fire Code, entitled
“Fire Protection Systems,” are hereby adopted and incorporated into the International Fire Code:

A. Subsection 901.6.2 is amended to read as follows:

901.6.2. Records. Records of all system inspections, tests and
maintenance required by the referenced standards shall be maintained
on the premises for three years; a copy shall be

the fire code official within 30 calendar
days of each test, inspection, or maintenance of the system; and a label
or tag shall be affixed to the individual system identifying the date of
the scheduled confidence test.

B. Subsection 901.11 is added to read as follows:

901.11. Emergency contacts. It shall be the responsibility of the owner
of a/any monitored fire protection system to provide and maintain a

12



minimum of three emergency contacts that are capable of responding
to the system location with their monitoring company.

C. The following term is added to subsection 902.1:
PROBLEMATIC FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEM.

D. Subsection 903.2 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where required. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided for when one of the following conditions exist:

1. In all buildings without adequate fire flow as required by this code.
Exception: Miscellaneous Group U Occupancies.

2. All new buildings and structures regulated by the International
Building Code 6,000 square feet and greater and requiring 2,000
gallons per minute or more fire flow, or with a gross floor area of
10,000 or more square feet, or where this code provides a more
restrictive floor/fire area requirement, and shall be provided in all
locations or where described by this code.

Exception: Spaces or areas in telecommunications buildings used
exclusively for telecommunications equipment, associated electrical
power distribution equipment, batteries, and standby engines, provided
those spaces or areas are equipped throughout with an automatic smoke
detection system in accordance with Section 907.2 and are separated
from the remainder of the building by not less than 1 hour fire barriers
constructed in accordance with Section 707 of the International
Building Code or not less than 2 hour horizontal assemblies constructed
in accordance with Section 712 of the International Building Code, or
both.

3. Where this code requires the installation of an automatic sprinkler
system to protect an occupancy within an otherwise non-sprinklered
building, then automatic sprinkler protection will be required
throughout the entire building.

4. When the required fire apparatus access roadway grade is 12 percent
or greater.

E. A new subsection 903.2.9.3 is added to read as follows:

903.2.9.3 Speculative use warehouses. Where the occupant, tenant, or
use of the building or storage commodity has not been determined or it
is otherwise a speculative use warehouse or building, the automatic

13



J.

K.

sprinkler system shall be designed to protect not less than Class IV non-
encapsulated commaodities on wood pallets, with no solid, slatted, or
wire mesh shelving, and with aisles that are 8 feet or more in width and
up to 20 feet in height.

A new subsection 903.3.8 is added to read as follows:

903.3.8. Check valve. All automatic sprinkler system risers shall be
equipped with a check valve.

A new subsection 903.7 is added to read as follows:

903.7 Riser Room Access. All risers shall be located in a dedicated
room with an exterior door, interior lighting and heat.

Subsection 907.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

907.1.3 Equipment. Systems and their components shall be listed
and approved for the purpose for which they are installed. All new
alarm systems shall be addressable. Each device shall have its own
address and shall annunciate individual addresses at a UL Central
Station.

A new subsection 907.6.3 is amended to read as follows:

907.6.3 Initiating device identification. The fire alarm system shall
identify the specific initiating device address, location, device type,
floor level where applicable and status including indication of
normal, alarm, trouble and supervisory status, as appropriate.

Exception: Special initiating devices that do not support individual
device identification.

A new subsection 907.8.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

907.8.5.1. Records. Records of all system inspections, tests and
maintenance required by the referenced standards shall be maintained
on the premises for three years; a copy shall be

the fire code official within 30 calendar
days of each test, inspection, or maintenance of the system; and a label
or tag shall be affixed to the individual system identifying the date of
the scheduled confidence test.

A new subsection 907.11 is added to read as follows:

907.11. Latched alarms. All signals shall be automatically “latched”
at the alarm panel until their operated devices are returned to normal
condition, and the alarm panel is manually reset.

14



L. A new subsection 907.12 is added to read as follows:

907.12 Resetting. All fire alarm panels shall be reset only by an
approved person.

907.12.1. Reset Code. The reset code for the fire alarm panel
or keypad shall be 3-7-1-2-3-4. The reset code shall not be
changed without approval of the fire code official.

M. A new subsection 907.13 is added to read as follows:

907.13 Fire Alarm Control Panel. All fire alarm control panels
shall be located in the riser room designed and installed in
accordance with Section 903.7 or an approved location.

N. Subsection 909.20.2 is amended to read as follows:

909.20.2 Written record. The records shall include the date of the
maintenance, identification of the servicing personnel and
notification of any unsatisfactory condition and the corrective action
taken, including parts replacement. The written record of smoke
control system testing and maintenance shall be maintained on the
premises for three years; copy shall be

the fire code official within 30 days
of each test or maintenance of the system; and a label or tag shall be
affixed to the individual system identifying the date of the scheduled
testing.

0. Subsection 912.5 is amended to read as follows:

912.5 Signs. Fire department connections shall be clearly identified
in an approved manner.

All fire department connections shall have an approved sign
attached below the Siamese clapper. The sign shall specify the type
of water-based fire protection system, the structure, and the building
areas served.

Section 5. Should any section, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance,
or its application to any person or circumstance, be declared unconstitutional or otherwise invalid
for any reason, or should any portion of this ordinance be pre-empted by state or federal law or
regulation, such decision or pre-emption shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of
this Ordinance or its application to other persons or circumstances.

Section 6. This Ordinance shall be effective five (5) days after passage and publication
as required by law.

15



ADOPTED this o&#ﬁay of

41/(,}‘11 , 2019, and signed in

authentication thereof on this _gQ {é}%&y of M% 2019.

ATTEST:

Kristina Gregg, City Clerk

Approved as to form:

Maky ottt Beusato

Mary M irgnte Bartolo, City Attorney

[Effective Date: 5// q / / q |

[Amend Fire Code—Inspection Reports]

CITY OF SEATAC

Chin Sottrlus

Erin Sitterléy, Mayor

16



ORDINANCE NO. _19-1003

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington authorizing and providing for the acquisition of certain
properties for the City street/road system specifically the Des Moines
Memorial Drive South and South 200th Street Intersection
Improvement project (Public Works Project ST-065); declaring public
use and necessity for specific land and property to be condemned;
authorizing the City Attorney to file a Petition for condemnation in King
County Superior Court; and authorizing payment therefore from the
City’s 307 Transportation Fund.

WHEREAS, the Des Moines Memorial Drive South and South 200th Street Intersection
Improvement Project (“Project”) will consist of building road improvements at the intersection of
Des Moines Memorial Drive South and South 200'" Street and more specifically the construction
of a traffic signal system, turn lanes, curbs, gutters, sidewalk, bike lanes, storm drainage,
conversion of utilities to underground, utility lines, street lighting, and paving; and

WHEREAS, the Project is contained in the City’s 2019 Transportation Improvement Plan
(TIP), the 2019-2024 Capital Improvement Plan (CIP), and the Capital Facilities Element of the
City’s Comprehensive Plan; and

WHEREAS, certain easements, lands, and properties must be acquired in order to provide
the necessary rights-of-way for construction and operation of the Project; and

WHEREAS, public use and necessity require that the property and property rights herein
identified be condemned, appropriated, and taken for public use for Project purposes as it may now
or hereafter declare in the public interest; and

WHEREAS, in the event that negotiated acquisition is not fully successful in advance of

the anticipated commencement of construction, it is essential that the City initiate condemnation

proceedings; and

Page - 1


kristina
Typewritten Text
19-1003


WHEREAS, notice of the planned final action set forth herein was provided in accordance
with RCW 8.25.290;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. Acquisition of easements or real property identified and depicted in Exhibit
A, which is attached and made a part of this Ordinance, is necessary to the public use for the Des
Moines Memorial Drive South and South 200" Street Intersection Improvement project.

Section 2. Reservation. Nothing in this Ordinance limits the City in its identification

and acquisition of property and property rights necessary for its system of streets and roads, and
utility improvements therein. The City reserves the right to acquire other or different properties

for the Project.

Section 3. Prosecution. The City’s Legal Department, at the direction of the City
Attorney, is hereby authorized to commence condemnation proceedings, pursuant to law. In
conducting said condemnation proceedings, the City’s Legal Department and/or City Manager is
hereby authorized to enter into any agreements necessary to effectuate the property acquisition
described in the Ordinance, including any stipulations necessary for the purpose of minimizing
damages, including but not limited to, the modification of the interest to be acquired by the City.
The Public Works Director, in consultation with the City’s Legal Department, is authorized to
make minor amendments to the legal description and depiction of easements or real property being

acquired by the City as described in Exhibit A, as may be necessary to correct scrivener’s errors

and/or to conform the legal description to the precise boundaries of the property required for the

Project.

Page - 2



Section 4. Funding. Compensation to be paid to the owners of the aforesaid property

and costs of litigation, shall be paid from the City’s 307-Transportation CIP Fund.

Section 5. Codification. This Ordinance shall not be codified in the SeaTac Municipal

Code.

Section 6. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days

after passage and publication as required by law.

ADOPTED this [i day of Z(:i '(2 4 ( 2% J . 2019, and signed in
authentication thereof on this Z& day of Mﬂﬂ ,2019.

CITY OF SEATAC

QMW\

Erin Sitterley, Mayor

ATTEST:

W@dmm

Kribtina Gregg, City Clerk

Approved as to Form:

(s

Mary E. Mirante Bartolo, City Attorney

[Effective Date: 6{/57“5!// q |

[Des Moines Memorial Drive South and South 200th Street Intersection Improvement projeet]

Page - 3



Exhibit A to the Ordinance



EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 3917400095
Owners Name: Alan and Susan Chamberlain
Temporary Construction Easement

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

KNIGHTS 2ND ADD TO DES MOINES LOTS 11-12-13 BLK 8 LESS CO RD TGW LOTS 11-12-
13 BLK 7 TGW POR UNDESG POR OF SEELEYS ADD TO DES MOINES W OF 12TH AVE S
& S OF DESMOINES WAY SBET SLN OF LOT 13 & N LN OF LOT 11 PROD E TGW PORS
OF VAC STS & ALLEYS ADJ

PLat Block: 7 & 8

Plat Lot: VAC 11-12-13

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF EASEMENT AREA

That portion of said Parcel described above lying West of the following described line:

BEGINNING at a point on the Southerly line of said Parcel and 7.50 feet Easterly of the
Westerly line of said Parcel, measured perpendicular to said Westerly line;

THENCE Northerly, parallel with said Westerly line a distance of 26.82 feet and the TERMINUS
of the herein described line.

Contains: 207.5 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT ‘B’

ALAN AND SUSAN CHAMBERLAIN
TAX PARCEL NO. 391740-—0095

CITY OF SEATAC
DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION

0 15 30 60 TAX PARCEL NO. 391740-0095
TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
EXHIBIT 'B’

1"=30’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 3917400100
Owners Name: Palacios M. DeCaudra
Temporary Construction Easement

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR’S PARCEL

KNIGHTS 2ND ADD TO DES MOINES TGW POR VAC ST & ALLEY ADJ
PLat Block: 8 VAC
Plat Lot: 14-15-16

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF EASEMENT AREA

That portion of said Parcel described above lying West of the following described line:
BEGINNING at a point on the Northerly line of said Parcel and 7.50 feet Easterly of the Westerly
line of said Parcel, measured perpendicular to said Westerly line;

THENCE Southwesterly to a point on the Southwest corner of said Parcel and the TERMINUS
of the herein described line.

Contains: 203.8 Square Feet, more or less.



~—

—

EXHIBIT 'B'

D,
\ Es MOINES MEMO

—

TERMINUS

PALACIOS M. DECAUDRA
TAX PARCEL NO. 391740-0100

CITY OF SEATAC
DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION

0 15 30 60 TAX PARCEL NO. 391740-0100

ﬁ TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
EXHIBIT 'B’

1"=30'




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 768620212003
Owners Name: Pedro Bucio Leon and Karina Gonzalez
Temporary Construction Easement

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

LOTS 7, 8 AND 9 OF VACATED BLOCK 39 OF SEELEY’S ADDITION TO DES MOINES,
ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF, RECORDED IN VOLUME 4 OF PLATS, PAGE 59, IN
KING COUNTY, WASHINGTON, LYING SOUTHERLY OF SOUTH 200TH STREET;

EXCEPT THE SOUTHERLY 187.5 FEET THEREOF;

SITUATE IN THE COUNTY OF KING, STATE OF WASHINGTON.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF EASEMENT AREA
The Northerly 3.00 feet of the Easterly 30.00 feet of said Parcel.

Contains: 90.2 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT 'B’

~ S. 200TH sT
°
i 30’
T —tee——— '\.’
15" | 301
| i |
| | [_ 30’ o
| | |
| PEDRO BUCIO LEON AND l w
| ] KARINA GONZALEZ |
| | TAX PARCEL NO. | i
768620—2120—03 T
N
CITY OF SEATAC
DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION
i w5y - TAX PARCEL NO. 768620-2120
1 TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
==|_|1"=30' EXHIBIT '8’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 3917400300
Owners Name: Ken Marquardt and Emily Marquardt
Right of Way Acquisition

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

THAT PORTION OF VACATED BLOCK 16, OF KNIGHT'S SECOND ADDITION TO DES
MOINES LYING EASTERLY OF DES MOINES HIGHWAY; AND ALL OF VACATED BLOCKS
17 AND 18; ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 5 OF PLATS,
PAGE 3, IN KING COUNTY, WASHINGTON,;

TOGETHER WITH ALL THAT PORTION OF VACATED 12TH STREET LYING EASTERLY OF
DES MOINES HIGHWAY BETWEEN SAID BLOCKS 16 AND 17; AND

TOGETHER WITH THE VACATED ALLEY BETWEEN SAID BLOCKS 17 AND 18;
EXCEPT THE FOLLOWING:

THE EASTERLY 60 FEET OF THE SOUTHERLY 100 FEET OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED
TRACT AS MEASURED ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE OF SAID BLOCK 18;

EXCEPT THAT PORTION OF SAID DESCRIBED MAIN TRACT DEEDED TO KING COUNTY

FOR SOUTH 200TH STREET BY DEED RECORDED UNDER RECORDING NUMBER
4899154,

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY ACQUISITION AREA

That portion of said Parcel described above lying Southerly of the following described line:

BEGINNING at a point on the Easterly line of said Parcel and 13.00 feet Northerly of the
Southerly line of said Parcel, measured perpendicular to said Southerly line;

THENCE North 87°00°55" West parallel with said Southerly line a distance of 118.00 feet;
THENCE North 02°59'05” East a distance of 4.00 feet;

THENCE North 76°55'45" West a distance of 27.21 feet to the beginning of a 28.50 foot radius
tangent curve concave to the Northeast;

THENCE Northwesterly along the arc of said curve a distance of 43.48 feet, through a central
angle of 87°24'11", to a point on the Westerly line of said Parcel, said point being tangent to the
Easterly Right of Way Line of Des Moines Memorial Drive; said point being the TERMINUS of
the herein described line, said point also being North 10°28'26” East along the westerly line of
said parcel a distance of 54.00 feet from the Southwest corner of said Parcel.

Contains 2,911 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHBIT 'B’

[ @ / i
w
| £ & | l
o /S KEN & EMILY MARQUARDT
/ /In / TAX PARCEL No. |
/ = /g 391740—0300 _
0 / BLOCK 16, KNIGHT'S 2ND ‘ o
CLDU / / ADD'T VOL 5 PG 3 _ | i
1 30" / 5
/ | ~TermiNS I-'E
/ 4.QO' _ | (o]
/ w N2'59'05"E -

A=87" 24 117
27,
T 27

I
CONTAINS:
2,911 SQ.FT.+
N87'00'55"W _ 118.00° FO.B

%f%ﬂ%ﬂﬁ

)
<

ll______________

=

: : . —_
PARCEL 3 .
(@]
71‘—\—\___%700551“: ™
! S.200THST, |
S o
/ T
/ | |
/ ! | |
CITY OF SEATAC
DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION
o 25 50 100 TAX PARCEL NO. 391740-0300
b RIGHT—OF—-WAY ACQUISITION
o EXHIBIT 'B’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 3917400300
Owners Name: Ken Marquardt and Emily Marquardt
Temporary Construction Easement

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

Real property in the County of King, State of Washington, described as follows:
THAT PORTION OF VACATED BLOCK 16, OF KNIGHT'S SECOND ADDITION TO DES
MOINES LYING EASTERLY OF DES MOINES HIGHWAY; AND ALL OF VACATED BLOCKS

17 AND 18; ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 5 OF PLATS,
PAGE 3, IN KING COUNTY, WASHINGTON,;

TOGETHER WITH ALL THAT PORTION OF VACATED 12TH STREET LYING EASTERLY OF
DES MOINES HIGHWAY BETWEEN SAID BLOCKS 16 AND 17; AND

TOGETHER WITH THE VACATED ALLEY BETWEEN SAID BLOCKS 17 AND 18;
EXCEPT THE FOLLOWING:

THE EASTERLY 60 FEET OF THE SOUTHERLY 100 FEET OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED
TRACT AS MEASURED ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE OF SAID BLOCK 18;

EXCEPT THAT PORTION OF SAID DESCRIBED MAIN TRACT DEEDED TO KING COUNTY

FOR SOUTH 200TH STREET BY DEED RECORDED UNDER RECORDING NUMBER
4899154.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF EASEMENT AREA

The Northerly 7.00 feet of the Southerly 20.00 feet of the Easterly 37.00 feet of the Westerly
176.21 feet of said Parcel described above;

TOGETHER WITH the Southerly 3.00 feet of that portion of said Parcel described above lying
Northerly of the following described line:

BEGINNING at a point on the Easterly line of said Parcel and 13.00 feet Northerly of the
Southerly line of said Parcel, measured perpendicular to said Southerly line;

THENCE Westerly, parallel with said Southerly line a distance of 118.00,

THENCE Northerly, perpendicular to said Southerly line a distance of 4.00 feet;

THENCE Northwesterly to a point 27.21 feet Easterly of the Westerly line of said Parcel and
21.77 feet Northerly of the Southerly line of said Parcel, both of which are measured
perpendicular to their respective line;

THENCE Northwesterly on a 28.50 foot radius curve concave to the Northeast, said curve being
Tangent to said described line and Tangent to the Easterly Right of Way Line of Des Moines
Memorial Drive to a point on the Westerly line of said Parcel and 54 feet Northerly of the



Southerly line of said Parcel, measured along said Westerly line and the TERMINUS of the
herein described line.

TOGETHER WITH the Westerly 3.00 feet of the Northerly 117.70 feet of said Parcel described
above.

Contains 1,069 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT 'B'

KEN & EMILY
MARQUARDT TAX
PARCEL No.
391740-0300

BLOCK 16, KNIGHT'S [
2ND ADD'T VOL 5 PG 3

CITY OF SEATAC

DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION

0 25' 50’ 100’ TAX PARCEL NO. 391740-0300

| | | | TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
- EXHIBIT 'B’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 7686202080
Owners Name: Tien Van Pham and Minh Thi Nguyen
Right-of-Way Acquisition

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

VACATED LOTS 1, 2, 3 AND 4, BLOCK 39, (SOMETIMES DESCRIBED AS THE NORTH
100 FEET OF VACATED BLOCK 39), SEELEY'S ADDITION TO THE CITY OF DES MOINES,
ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 4 OF PLATS, PAGE 59, IN
KING COUNTY, WASHINGTON; EXCEPT COUNTY ROAD;

TOGETHER WITH THE WEST HALF OF THAT PORTION OF VACATED TARBELL STREET
ADJOINING SAID PREMISES;

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY ACQUISITION AREA

That portion of said Parcel described above lying South of the following described line:

COMMENCING at the Southwest corner of said Parcel;

THENCE North along the Westerly line of said Parcel 9.29 feet to the POINT OF BEGINNING of
the herein described line;

THENCE Southeasterly 130.31 feet to a point on the Easterly line of said Parcel, said point
being Northerly 2.42 feet from the Southeast corner of said Parcel, said point being the
TERMINUS of the herein described line.

Contains: 843 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT 'B’

TIEN VAN PHAM & MINH THI NGUYEN |
TAX PARCEL No. 768620-2080

BLOCK 39, SEELEY'S ADDITION
VOL 4 PG 59

12TH LN. S.

~——————————————

_.
o

R/W ACQUISITION
/ CONTAINS: 843 SQ.FT.x

N
¢
/ % 130.31" TERMINUS j_‘
) \-sW. COR PARCEL —_“_‘_‘—*————————gq___:i
S.E. COR PARCEL

o
o
)

— =

\

&
[e)]
[
S. 200TH ST I
o)
_
. o
I B 'L
| l A
(Y
CITY OF SEATAC
DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION
0 15 30 60’ TAX PARCEL NO. 768620-2080
é—J RIGHT—OF—=WAY ACQUISITION
T EXHIBIT 'B’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 7686202080
Owners Name: Tien Van Pham and Minh Thi Nguyen
Temporary Construction Easement

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

Real property in the County of King, State of Washington, described as follows:

VACATED LOTS 1, 2, 3 AND 4, BLOCK 39, (SOMETIMES DESCRIBED AS THE NORTH

100 FEET OF VACATED BLOCK 39), SEELEY'S ADDITION TO THE CITY OF DES MOINES,
ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 4 OF PLATS, PAGE 59, IN
KING COUNTY, WASHINGTON; EXCEPT COUNTY ROAD:;

TOGETHER WITH THE WEST HALF OF THAT PORTION OF VACATED TARBELL STREET
ADJOINING SAID PREMISES;

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF EASEMENT AREA

The South 3.00 feet of that portion of said Parcel described above lying North of the following
described line:

BEGINNING at a point on the Westerly line of said Parcel, said point being Northerly 9.29 feet
from the Southwest corner of said Parcel:

THENCE Southeasterly to a point on the Easterly line of said Parcel, said point being 2.42 feet
Northerly from the Southeast corner of said Parcel, , said point being the TERMINUS of the
herein described line.

Contains: 391 Square Feet, more or less.



———_—

12TH LN. S.

EXHIBIT 'B’

— _ — o _
| |
| |
| TIEN VAN PHAM & MINH THI NGUYEN :
| TAX PARCEL No. 768620—2080
BLOCK 39, SEELEY'S ADDITION
| VOL 4 PG 59
l |
| |
P.0.B. b |
_L ™~
TERMINUS | <
N
p——— - :
2 L —
(o))
=]
S. 200TH ST T T T A
N5}
|
——— oL
! ] T
| | o
F
CITY OF SEATAC
DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION
0 15' 30' 60' TAX PARCEL NO. 768620—2080
H TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
- EXHIBIT '8’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 768620216004
Owners Name: SL Pacific, Inc.
Right-of-Way Acquisition

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

THE NORTH 100 FEET OF BLOCK 40, SEELEY'S ADDITION TO THE CITY OF DES MOINES
(VACATED), ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 4 OF PLATS,
PAGE 59, IN KING COUNTY, WASHINGTON;

EXCEPT THAT PORTION CONVEYED TO KING COUNTY FOR ROAD PURPOSES UNDER
KING COUNTY RECORDING NUMBER 4896411;

TOGETHER WITH THAT PORTION OF VACATED SOUTH 199TH STREET ADJOINING
THAT ATTACHED BY LAW UNDER KING COUNTY ORDINANCE NO. 4403.

SITUATE IN THE CITY OF SEATAC, COUNTY OF KING, STATE OF WASHINGTON.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY ACQUISITION AREA

That portion of said Parcel described above lying South of the following described line:

COMMENCING at the Southwest corner of said Parcel;

THENCE North along the Westerly line of said Parcel 12.49 feet to the POINT OF BEGINNING
of the herein described line;

THENCE Southeasterly 100.68 feet to a point on the Easterly line of said Parcel, said point
being Northerly 9.71 feet from the Southwest corner of said Parcel, said point being the
TERMINUS of the herein described line.

Contains: 1,115 Square Feet, more or less.



I S

12TH AVE. S.

20’

EXHIBIT 'B’

|

|

|

|

l

| SL PACIFIC INC.
| TAX PARCEL No. 768620-2160
|

|

|

|

|

l

|

BLOCK 40, SEELEY'S ADDITION
VOL 4 PG 59

CONTAINING: 1,115 SQ.FT.k

12TH LN. S.

1’ 100.68’ TERMINUS i
S.W. COR PARCEL T ————
S.E. COR PARCEL .

I .

. R
S. 200TH ST I
B ST -

CITY OF SEATAC

DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION

TAX PARCEL NO. 768620-2160
RIGHT-OF—WAY ACQUISITION

EXHIBIT '8’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 768620216004
Owners Name: SL Pacific, Inc.
Temporary Construction Easement

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

Real property in the County of King, State of Washington, described as follows:

THE NORTH 100 FEET OF BLOCK 40, SEELEY'S ADDITION TO THE CITY OF DES MOINES
(VACATED), ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 4 OF PLATS,
PAGE 59, IN KING COUNTY, WASHINGTON;

EXCEPT THAT PORTION CONVEYED TO KING COUNTY FOR ROAD PURPOSES UNDER
KING COUNTY RECORDING NUMBER 4896411;

TOGETHER WITH THAT PORTION OF VACATED SOUTH 199TH STREET ADJOINING
THAT ATTACHED BY LAW UNDER KING COUNTY ORDINANCE NO. 4403.

SITUATE IN THE CITY OF SEATAC, COUNTY OF KING, STATE OF WASHINGTON.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF EASEMENT AREA

BEGINNING at a point on the Westerly line of said Parcel, said point being 12.49 feet Northerly
from the Southwest corner of said Parcel;

THENCE Northerly, along the said Westerly line a distance of 6.52 feet;

THENCE Easterly a distance of 28.00 feet to a point 19.72 feet Northerly of the Southerly line of
said Parcel and 28.00 feet Easterly of the Westerly line of said Parcel, both of which are
measured perpendicular to their respective line;

THENCE Southeasterly to a point on the Easterly line of said Parcel, said point being Northerly
12.71 feet from the Southwest corner of said Parcel;

THENCE Southerly along said Easterly line to a point 9.71 feet Northerly of the Southwest
corner of said Parcel;

THENCE Northwesterly to the point of beginning.

Contains: 603 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT 'B’

|
|
| " T I B
| | |
o »
T ;’ l |
2 o
| & | SL PACIFIC INC. | o |
A TAX PARCEL No. 7686202160 @
BLOCK 40, SEELEY'S ADDITION I 2
| | VOL 4 PG 59 | l
- 5|
o u
| 20' I ’ ,
|, i I_ 28.00’ | |
| e - . |
© o 3.13 |
RRETE Nyt =y
——— ] |
_____ T L
R R
o o 5
= M
S.200THST. ™
—— ——
] .
CITY OF SEATAC
DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION
0 15 30' 60" TAX PARCEL NO. 768620—-2160
ﬁ TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
o= EXHIBIT '8’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 294600-0009
Owners Name: John D. Vanderlin
Right of Way Acquisition

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR’S PARCEL

That portion of lots 2 through 6, in blocks 1 and 60, grove addition to town of Des Moines,
according to the plat thereof recorded in volume 4 of plats, page 83, records of King County,
Washington, and of vacated street, described as follows:

Beginning on the Southerly line of lot 2, block 60, at a point 120.00 feet Westerly of the
southeast corner of lot 2, block 61, of said plat;

Thence Northerly parallel with the Easterly line of said block 61 to the Southerly line of south
200th street as conveyed to king county, Washington for street purposes by deed recorded
under recording no 4903723;

Thence Westerly along said Southerly line to the Easterly line of Des Moines way;,
Thence Southerly along said Easterly line to the Southerly lane of Iot 2 in said block 1;
Thence Easterly to the point of beginning;

Situate in the County of King, State of Washington.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF AQUISITION AREA

BEGINNING at the Northwest Corner of said Parcel;
THENCE South 10°28'26” West along the West line of said Parcel a distance of 31.50 feet;

THENCE South 79°31'34" East, perpendicular to said West line, a distance of 3.00 feet to a line
parallel with said West line;

THENCE North 10°28'26" East along said parallel line a distance of 10.12 feet to the beginning
of a 16.00 foot radius curve to the right;

THENCE Easterly along the arc of said curve a distance of 21.01 feet, through a central angle
of 75°14'54”;

THENCE North 85°43°20" East a distance of 22.15 feet to a line parallel with and 5.00 feet
Southerly, measured perpendicular to the North line of said Parcel;

THENCE North 02°59°'05” East along said parallel line a distance of 4.00 feet to a line parallel
with and 1.00 feet Southerly, measured perpendicular to said North line;

THENCE South 87°00'55” East along said parallel line a distance of 91.88 feet to the East line
of said Parcel;

THENCE North 00°36'46" East along said East line a distance of 1.00 feet to the Northeast
Corner of said Parcel;



THENCE North 87°00'55” West along said North line a distance of 127.84 feet to the POINT OF
BEGINNING.

Contains: 456 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT 'B’

T — —
— e
—_—
—_—
—— —.

E o
M
N _ _ ) S. 200TH ST.
< - T T —— -
g :
= / o :
W P.0.B i "
S | N8700's5"w 12784
&’J / g S87°00'55"E  91.88" T
2 Qo 4.00' L=
! ey 22.15’ N2'59°05"F NO'36'46°E
5 o L=21.01’
= » R=16.00’
n 10.12"  A=7514'54" |
w N10°28'26"E !
/
Q 30" 3.00'
j / S79°31'34"E
JOHN D VANDERLIN |
, / TAX PARCEL NO. 294600—0009 f
/ BLOCKS 1 AND 60, THE
/ / GROVE ADD'T VOL 4 PG 83
I
/ | '
[ |
: [
1
CITY OF SEATAC

DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION

0 15’ 30’ 60' TAX PARCEL NO. 294600-0009

| | | | RIGHT—OF—-WAY ACQUISITION
EXHIBIT 'B’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 294600-0009
Owners Name: John D. Vanderlin
Temporary Construction Easement

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

That portion of lots 2 through 6, in blocks 1 and 60, grove addition to town of Des Moines,
according to the plat thereof recorded in volume 4 of plats, page 83, records of King County,
Washington, and of vacated street, described as follows:

Beginning on the Southerly line of lot 2, block 60, at a point 120.00 feet Westerly of the
southeast corner of lot 2, block 61, of said plat;

Thence Northerly parallel with the Easterly line of said block 61 to the Southerly line of south
200th street as conveyed to king county, Washington for street purposes by deed recorded
under recording no 4903723;

Thence Westerly along said Southerly line to the Easterly line of Des Moines way;
Thence Southerly along said Easterly line to the Southerly lane of lot 2 in said block 1;
Thence Easterly to the point of beginning;

Situate in the County of King, State of Washington.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF EASEMENT AREA

COMMENCING at the Northeast Corner of said Parcel;

THENCE South 00°36'46” West along the East line of said Parcel a distance of 1.00 feet to the
POINT OF BEGINNING;

THENCE North 87°00'55” West a distance of 91.88 feet, parallel to the North line of said Parcel;
THENCE South 02°59'05” West a distance of 4.00 feet;

THENCE South 85°43'20” West a distance of 22.15 feet;

THENCE South 04°16'40” East a distance of 3.00 feet;

THENCE North 85°43'20” East a distance of 24.79 feet;

THENCE North 02°59'05” East a distance of 3.64 feet to a line parallel to the North line of said
Parcel,

THENCE South 87°00°'55” East along said parallel line a distance of 89.00 feet to the East line
of said Parcel;

THENCE North 00°36’46" East along said East line a distance of 3.00 feet to the POINT OF
BEGINNING.



TOGETHER WITH the following:
COMMENCING at the Southwest Corner of said Parcel;

THENCE North 09°38°26” East along the West line of said Parcel a distance of 12.00 feet to the
POINT OF BEGINNING;

THENCE Easterly, perpendicular to said West line, a distance of 5.00 feet to a line parallel with
said West line;

THENCE North 09°38'26” East along said parallel line a distance of 20.00 feet;
THENCE Westerly, perpendicular to said West line, a distance of 5.00 feet to the said West line;

THENCE South 09°38'26” West along said West line a distance of 20.00 feet to the POINT OF
BEGINNING.

Contains: 453 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT 'C’

/ / Q& PROPOSED %
L/ R/W LINE =
o
/
S
/ |
I
/ JOHN D VANDERLIN
/ TAX PARCEL NO. 294600-0009
5'
f~—~
I
S 5 I
N
|
|
CITY OF SEATAC
DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION
0 15' 30’ 60' TAX PARCEL NO. 294600—0009

| TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT

EXHIBIT 'C’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 391740032001
Owners Name: Abel Lucatero Zamora and Silvia Ochoa Equihua
Right-of-Way Acquisition

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR'S PARCEL

THE SOUTHERLY 100.00 FEET (AS MEASURED ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE OF BLOCK
18) OF THE EASTERLY 60.00 FEET IN (WIDTH) OF THAT PORTION OF VACATED BLOCKS
17 AND 18 AND VACATED ALLEY BETWEEN, LYING NORTHERLY OF SOUTH 200TH
STREET IN KNIGHT'S 2ND ADDITION TO DES MOINES, AS PER PLAT RECORDED IN
VOLUME 5 OF PLATS, PAGE 3, RECORDS OF KING COUNTY;

TOGETHER WITH THE SOUTH 100 FEET (AS MEASURED ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE
OF SAID BLOCK 18) OF THAT PORTION OF THE SOUTHEAST 1/4 OF THE NORTHEAST
1/4 OF SECTION 5, TOWNSHIP 22 NORTH, RANGE 4 EAST W.M., IN KING COUNTY,
WASHINGTON , LYING WEST OF SEELEY'S ADDITION TO THE CITY OF DES MOINES, AS
PER PLAT RECORDED IN VOLUME 4 OF PLATS, PAGE 59, RECORDS OF KING COUNTY,
WASHINGTON, AND LYING EASTERLY OF SAID BLOCK 18 AND NORTHERLY OF SAID
SOUTH 200TH STREET,

SITUATE IN THE CITY OF SEA-TAC, COUNTY OF KING, STATE OF WASHINGTON,

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF RIGHT-OF-WAY ACQUISITION AREA

The South 13.00 feet of said Parcel described above.

Contains: 801 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT 'B’

-
|

12TH AVE. S.

ABEL LUCATERO ZAMORA &
SILVIA OCHOA EQUIHUA TAX
PARCEL No. 391740-0320

\ BLOCK 18, KNIGHT'S 2ND
| ADD'T VOL 5 PG 3
I

Tl ,
CONTAINS: 20

| 801 SQ.FT.+

T e ——

—_———
—_———
—_———
———
———

—_—————
—_————
_——

CITY OF SEATAC

DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION

0 15’ 30" 60’ TAX PARCEL NO. 391740-0320

ﬁ RIGHT-OF—WAY ACQUISITION
EXHIBIT 'B’




EXHIBIT “A”

Parcel No.: 391740032001
Owners Name: Abel Lucatero Zamora and Silvia Ochoa Equihua
Temporary Construction Easement

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF GRANTOR’S PARCEL

Real property in the County of King, State of Washington, described as follows:

THE SOUTHERLY 100.00 FEET (AS MEASURED ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE OF BLOCK
18) OF THE EASTERLY 60.00 FEET IN (WIDTH) OF THAT PORTION OF VACATED BLOCKS
17 AND 18 AND VACATED ALLEY BETWEEN, LYING NORTHERLY OF SOUTH 200TH
STREET IN KNIGHT'S 2ND ADDITION TO DES MOINES, AS PER PLAT RECORDED IN
VOLUME 5 OF PLATS, PAGE 3, RECORDS OF KING COUNTY;

TOGETHER WITH THE SOUTH 100 FEET (AS MEASURED ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE
OF SAID BLOCK 18) OF THAT PORTION OF THE SOUTHEAST 1/4 OF THE NORTHEAST
1/4 OF SECTION 5, TOWNSHIP 22 NORTH, RANGE 4 EAST W.M,, IN KING COUNTY,
WASHINGTON , LYING WEST OF SEELEY'S ADDITION TO THE CITY OF DES MOINES, AS
PER PLAT RECORDED IN VOLUME 4 OF PLATS, PAGE 59, RECORDS OF KING COUNTY,
WASHINGTON, AND LYING EASTERLY OF SAID BLOCK 18 AND NORTHERLY OF SAID
SOUTH 200TH STREET,;

SITUATE IN THE CITY OF SEA-TAC, COUNTY OF KING, STATE OF WASHINGTON.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF EASEMENT AREA

The North 3.00 feet of the South 16.00 feet of said Parcel Described above.

Contains: 186 Square Feet, more or less.



EXHIBIT 'B'

12TH AVE. S.

SILVIA. OCHOA EQUIHUA TAX

PARCEL No. 391740-0320

BLOCK 18, KNIGHT'S 2ND

| |

\ |

ABEL LUCATERO ZAMORA & ,

|

| ADD'T VOL 5 PG 3 Il
|

|

l

|

|

|

P 20

J
T —
ﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁ | ‘e |
N L
PROPOSED N

R/W LINE

30’

—_——
—_—
—_——
—_——,——
————

CITY OF SEATAC

DES MOINES MEMORIAL DRIVE AND
SOUTH 200TH STREET INTERSECTION

TAX PARCEL NO. 391740-0320

& TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
EXHIBIT 'B’

.‘ u=30!




ORDINANCE NoO. __19-1004

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington authorizing and providing for the acquisition of certain
properties for the City street/road system specifically the Military Road
South and South 152" Street project (Public Works Project ST-125);
declaring public use and necessity for specific land and property to be
condemned; authorizing the City Attorney to file a Petition for
condemnation in King County Superior Court; and authorizing payment
therefore from the City’s 307 Transportation Fund.

WHEREAS, the Military Road South and South 152" Street Project (“Project”) will
consist of building road improvements along Military Road South and South 152" Street and more
specifically the construction of a traffic signal system, turn lanes, curbs, gutters, sidewalk, bike
lanes, storm drainage, conversion of utilities to underground, utility lines, street lighting, and
paving; and

WHEREAS, the Project is contained in the City’s 2019 Transportation Improvement Plan
(TIP), the 2019-2024 Capital Improvement Plan (CIP), and the Capital Facilities Element of the
City’s Comprehensive Plan; and

WHEREAS, certain easements, lands, and properties must be acquired in order to provide
the necessary rights-of-way for construction and operation of the Project; and

WHEREAS, public use and necessity require that the property and property rights herein
identified be condemned, appropriated, and taken for public use for Project purposes as it may now
or hereafter declare in the public interest; and

WHEREAS, in the event that negotiated acquisition is not fully successful in advance of

the anticipated commencement of construction, it is essential that the City initiate condemnation

proceedings; and

Page - 1


kristina
Typewritten Text
19-1004


WHEREAS, notice of the planned final action set forth herein was provided in accordance
with RCW 8.25.290;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. Acquisition of easements or real property identified and depicted in Exhibit
A, which is attached and made a part of this Ordinance, is necessary to the public use for the
Military Road South and South 152" Street project.

Section 2. Reservation. Nothing in this Ordinance limits the City in its identification

and acquisition of property and property rights necessary for its system of streets and roads, and
utility improvements therein. The City reserves the right to acquire other or different properties

for the Project.

Section 3. Prosecution. The City’s Legal Department, at the direction of the City
Attorney, is hereby authorized to commence condemnation proceedings, pursuant to law. In
conducting said condemnation proceedings, the City’s Legal Department and/or City Manager is
hereby authorized to enter into any agreements necessary to effectuate the property acquisition
described in the Ordinance, including any stipulations necessary for the purpose of minimizing
damages, including but not limited to, the modification of the interest to be acquired by the City.
The Public Works Director, in consultation with the City’s Legal Department, is authorized to
make minor amendments to the legal description and depiction of easements or real property being

acquired by the City as described in Exhibit A, as may be necessary to correct scrivener’s errors

and/or to conform the legal description to the precise boundaries of the property required for the

Project.

Page - 2



Section 4. Funding. Compensation to be paid to the owners of the aforesaid property

and costs of litigation, shall be paid from the City’s 307-Transportation CIP Fund.

Section S. Codification. This Ordinance shall not be codified in the SeaTac Municipal

Code.

Section 6. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days

after passage and publication as required by law.

ADOPTED this 492 day of Q d} { ‘:{’2 > , 2019, and signed in
authentication thereof on this _/ :Q g day of M 42 }lg ‘Jz 2 , 2019,

CITY OF SEATAC

(o Sqreedon

Erin Sitterley, @l_ij}(‘ r J

ATTEST:

Mmm

Kridtina Gregg, City Clerk

Approved as to Form:

[Effective Date: 2/927/// Cj

[Military Road South and South 152" Street project|

Page - 3



Exhibit A to the Ordinance



EXHIBIT A
LEGAL DESCRIPTION FOR TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
KING COUNTY PARCEL NO. 0041000403

THAT PORTION OF LOT 6, BLOCK 3, FIRST ADDITION TO ADAMS HOME TRACTS, PER PLAT
THEREOF RECORDED IN VOLUME 12 OF PLATS, PAGE 50, RECORDS OF KING COUNTY,
WASHINGTON, BEING IN THE SOUTHWEST QUARTER OF THE NORTHWEST QUARTER OF
SECTION 22, TOWNSHIP 2<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>