City Ordinances Archive

Note: To find a particular ordinance, click on the Bookmarks tab on the left side of
this screen



ORDINANCE NO. ___10-1016

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington, authorizing the City Manager to contract with the Seattle
Southside Visitor Services (SSVS) to implement a SeaTac-specific
tourism campaign, and amending the 2010 Annual City Budget for the
related expenditures.

WHEREAS, the SeaTac City Council has reviewed agenda bill #3237, which proposes
that the City contract with the Seattle Southside Visitor Services (SSVS) to implement a SeaTac-
specific on-line tourism and lodging marketing campaign; and

WHEREAS, the rationale for funding this project is to assist the tourism sector to
recover more rapidly from the recent economic downturn; and

WHEREAS, the cost of the proposed project is estimated at approximately $90,060; and

WHEREAS, funding for this effort was not provided for in the Hotel/Motel Tax Fund in
the 2010 Annual City Budget; and

WHEREAS, an amendment to the City’s Annual City Budget is necessary to provide

additional budgetary authority to fund this expenditure;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. The City Manager is authorized to enter into a contract with SSVS implement a
SeaTac-specific on-line tourism and lodging marketing campaign.

Section 2. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total Hotel/Motel
Tax Fund #107 expenditures by $90,060.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after passage and
publication as required by law. '

Page - 1



ADOPTED this _ /M4 day of L7/}")4,(/0\ , 2010, and signed in authentication

thereof on this // % dayof _ 2072 ¢ . , 2010.

CITY OF SEATAC

0 WKUJ

Gent Fisher, Deputy Mayor

ATTEST:

Approved as to Form:

/Y ﬂ»"ﬁ%//z@bj@%% Mi’?ﬁffiﬁ*/@

Mary E. Mifafite Bartolo, City Attorney
[Effective Date: 5 -Ad~/0 |

[Contract with SSVS for SeaTac-specific tourism campaign and 2010 Budget Amendment]

Page - 2



ORDINANCE NO. 10-1017
AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of
SeaTac, Washington, adding new Sections 15.10.157 and
15.10.158 to the SeaTac Municipal Code and amending

Sections 15.10.249 and 15.12.020 of the SeaTac Municipal
Code related to Crisis Diversion Facilities.

WHEREAS, it is appropriate to amend the City’s development regulations
regarding essential public facilities and residential uses; and

WHEREAS, the Growth Management Act requires regular review and update of
development regulations which implement the City’s Comprehensive Plan; and

WHEREAS, regular review and update of the Zoning Code ensures that
development regulations are responsive to the needs of the City; and

WHEREAS, in reviewing the Zoning Code, certain development regulations
have been identified as requiring definition, clarity, amendment or addition; and

WHEREAS, the Planning Commission has reviewed the aforesaid changes to
development regulations, has held a public hearing for the purpose of soliciting public
comment in regard to Zoning Code changes, and has recommended the amendments and
additions for adoption by the Council;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. A new Section 15.10.157 is hereby added to the SeaTac Municipal Code
to read as follows:

15.10.157 Crisis Diversion Facility (CDF)
A residential treatment facility for individuals 18 vears or older that
diverts individuals from jails or hospitals suffering from mental illness
and/or chemical dependency. A CDF is licensed by the Washington State
Department of Health and certified by the Washington State Department
of Social and Health Services, provides temporary shelter, operate 24/7

Page 1



and hold individuals for up to 72 hours. One (1) Crisis Diversion Facility
may be collocated with one (1) Crisis Diversion Interim Facility.

Section 2. A new Section 15.10.158 is hereby added to the SeaTac Municipal Code
to read as follows:

15.10.158 Crisis Diversion Interim Facility (CDIF)
A residential treatment facility that provides temporary shelter, additional
on site mental illness and/or chemical dependency treatments administered
by mental health care professionals, operates 24/7, and individuals may
stay at the facility for up to two weeks. A CDIF is licensed by the
Washington State Department of Health and certified by the Washington
State Department of Social and Health Services. One (1) Crisis Diversion
Interim Facility may be collocated with one (1) Crisis Diversion Facility.

Section 3. Section 15.10.249 is hereby amended to the SeaTac Municipal Code to
read as follows:

15.10.249 Essential Public Facility
A facility providing public services, or publicly funded services that is
difficult to site or expand and which meets any of the following criteria:
meets the Growth Management Act definition of an essential public
facility (EPF), at RCW 36.70A.200, as now existing or hereafter amended,
is on the State, King County or City list of essential public facilities,
serves a significant portion of the County or region, or is part of a County-
wide or multi-County service system, and is difficult to site or expand.
Essential public facilities include, but are not limited to, the following:
airports, State and local correction facilities, State educational facilities,
State and regional transportation facilities, landfills, solid waste handling
facilities, sewage treatment facilities, major communication facilities and
antennas (excluding wireless telecommunications facilities); and in-patient
facilities such as group homes (excluding those facilities covered by the
Washington Housing Policy Act), mental health facilities, secure
community transition facilities (SCTF), crisis diversion facility, crisis
diversion interim facility, and substance abuse facilities, including opiate
substitution treatment facilities.

Section 4. Section 15.12.020 is hereby amended to the SeaTac Municipal Code to
read as follows: '

15.12.020 Residential Uses

ZONES:

P - Parks NB — Neighborhood BP ~ Business Park
Business
O/C/MU —

MHP — Mobile Home Park CB - Community Business Office/Commercial/Mixed Use

Page 2



UL — Urban Low density
UM - Urban Medium

Density

UH - Urban High Density

ABC ~ Aviation Business
Center

| - Industrial

O/CM - Office/Commercial
Medium
P — Permitted Use; C — Conditional Use Permit

T - Townhouse

USE

LAND USE

ZONES

P

MHP

UL

um

UH

NB

CcB

ABC

O/CM

BP| O/C/MU

RESIDENTIAL USES

001

Single Detached
Dwelling Unit

P(1,7,9)

P(1,7,9,13)

P*(13)

001.1

Single Attached -
Dwelling Unit

P*

P*

002

Duplex

P*

003

Townhouses

P*

P*

P*

004

Multi-Family

P*(10)

P*(8)

C*(8)

P*(8)

P*(12)

005

Senior Citizen Multi

T|V|T0| T

P*

P*

P*

P*

P'k

006

Manufactured/Modular
Home

P(9)

P(9)

P(9)

006.1

Mobile Home
(nonHUD)

P(9)

007

Bed and Breakfast/
Guesthouse

P(2)

P(2)

P*(2)

P(2)

C*

P*(2)

008

Community
Residential Facility |

P(3)

P(3)

P*(3)

P(3)

P*(3)

P*(3)

P*(3)

008a

Community
Residential Facility |l

P*

P'k

P*

P*

P (12)

008b

Transitional Housing

C*(14)

P*(14)

P*(14)

C*(14)

008¢c

Halfway House

c*(11)

c*(11)

c(11)

008d

Crisis Diversion

Facility

C (15)

008e

Crisis Diversion

Interim Facility

Cc (15

EIO EIO
o o

009

Overnight Shelter

C*(11)

c*(11)

C*(11)

610

Convalescent Center/
Nursing Home

P*

P*

P*

P*

011

Mobile Home Park

C(4)

C(4)

C*(4)

013

College Dormitory

P*

P*

P*

P* | P*(6)

USE

LAND USE

ZONES

MHP

UL

Uum

UH

NB

cB

ABC

o/cMm

BP|O/C/MU

ACCESSORY USES

018

Home Occupation

P(6) -

P*(6)

P*(6)

P*(6)

Page 3




USE

LAND USE ZONES

019

Shed/Garage } [P(S) IP(5) !P*(5), ! f l ] ! ‘

*See Chapters 15.13 and 15.35 SMC for additional development standards.

(1)
(2

€)

(4)

(5)

(6)
)

(8)
(9)
(10)

(1

(12)

(13)

(14)

(15)

Accessory dwelling units permitted. See Chapter 15.37 SMC for standards.
Standards for Bed and Breakfast:

a. Number of guests limited to six (6), with no more than three (3) bedrooms;
b. Parking area for three (3) nonresident vehicles, and screened;

c. Proof of King County Health Department approval;

d. Breakfastis only meal served for paying guest.

Standards for Community Residential Facilities I:

a. No more than five (5) nonsupport people, unless as modified pursuant to requirement
(3)(e)™;

b. No more than two (2) support people**;

c. Any parking spaces in excess of two shall be screened and not visible from public
streets;

d. In UL zone, house shall be a single-family structure compatible with the surrounding
area; in UM zone, house shall maintain residential character;

e. Reasonable accommodation shall be made for persons with disabilities as required by
State and Federal law. See SMC 15.12.018 for accommodation procedure.

**(a) and (b) do not apply to State-licensed adult family homes and foster family homes.

A park outside established or proposed mobile home park zone is permitted after approval
through the CUP process.

Limited to one thousand (1,000) gsf and a twenty (20) foot height limit (highest point), except
as allowed under SMC 15.13.105(B).

See Chapter 15.17 SMC for standards and limitations.

Efficiency unit permitted within primary dwelling, not exceeding twenty-five percent (25%) of
gross square fest of dwelling.

Ground floor uses must be retail, service, or commercial uses as described in SMC
15.13.107.

See Chapter 15.26 SMC for additional development standards.

For new development and redevelopment residential projects that are located in the UH-
UCR zone, at least fifty percent (50%) of the buiiding’s ground floor shall be a retail,
service, or commercial use as described in SMC 15.13.107.

As part of the CUP process a threshold determination will be made as to whether an
essential public facility (EPF) siting process is needed. See SMC 15.22.035. These
requirements shall not be construed to limit the appropriate use of schools and other
facilities for emergency shelters in disaster situations.

Permitted only as part of a mixed use development, as described in SMC 15.35.620, and
arranged on-site as described in SMC 15.35.610.

Small Iot single-family development allowed subject to design standards in SMC
15.19.760.

Must have adequate on-site and program management, and satisfactory written policies
and procedures, including those describing tenant selection, assistance, denial or
termination, and housing safety standards. Screening must not allow as residents persons
who have been classified as Class lll sexual offenders.

Subject to a Conditional Use Permit (CUP) and Essential Public Facility (EPF) siting

process.

Page 4




Section 5. The City Clerk is directed to forward a copy of this Ordinance to the
Washington State Department of Commerce within ten (10) days after adoption, and to
the King County Assessor.

Section 6. If any provision of this Ordinance or its application to any person or
circumstance is held invalid, the remainder of the Ordinance or the application of the
provision to other persons or circumstances shall not be affected.

Section 7. The Ordinance shall be effective five (5) days after passage and
publication.

ADOPTED this&% day of “F7lieq 2010, and signed in authentication
thereof on thiseAZB#A__ day of W&g _ ., 2010.

CITY OF SEATAC

viiderson, Mayor

ATTEST:

K istrioa v nts

Kristina Gregg, City Clerk UV

Approved as to Form:

7 7
%///%Z//// /////@/5/%"7 y

Mary Mira?t’é Bartolo, Ci%//ﬁttomey

[Effective Date_ o — O =80 /D ]

[Crisis Diversion Facilities Code Amendments]

Page 5



ORDINANCE NO. 10-1018

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington, amending Chapters 13.110, 13.160, 13.170, 13.210,
and 13.220; Sections 13.100.060, 13.100.100, 13.150.010,
13.150.020, 13.150.050, and 13.150.110; and repealing Chapter
13.230 of the SeaTac Municipal Code related to Buildings and
Construction.

WHEREAS, the City has, pursuant to its municipal authority, adopted certain Codes as
amended by the State of Washington, as the Building and Construction Codes of the City; and

WHEREAS, those Codes are generally adopted and amended by the State of
Washington every three years pursuant to the provisions of RCW 19.27, and municipalities are
required to adopt those changes by July 1, 2010; and

WHEREAS, certain Codes were recently amended by the State, and thus it is appropriate
for the City to update its Mﬁnicipal Code accordingly; and

WHEREAS, the City’s Building Department and Fire Department have reviewed the

2]

recent amendments to the City’s Building and Construction Codes and the proposed amendment
by the State; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to continue to regulate Buildings and Construction,
which will provide necessary safety and construction standards; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that fire lanes enhance the health and safety of the
public;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. Section 13.100.060 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.100.060 Permits.

Page 1



A. Except for those items specifically exempt in each of the technical codes, no building,
structure or building service equipment regulated by the technical codes shall be erected,
constructed, enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, removed, converted or demolished
unless a separate, appropriate permit for each building, structure or building service equipment
has first been obtained from the Building Official. Exemptions from permit requirements of the
technical codes shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any
manner in violation of the provisions of those codes or any other laws or ordinances of the City
of SeaTac or the State of Washington.

B. Emergency Repairs. Where equipm‘eht replacéments and repairs must be performed in an
emergency situation, the permit application shall be submitted within the next working business
day to the Building Official.

C. Repairs. Application or notice to the Building Official is not required for ordinary repairs to
structures, replacement of lamps or the connection of approved portable electrical equipment to
approved permanently installed receptacles. Such repairs shall not include the cutting away of
any wall, partition or portion thereof, the removal or cutting of any structural beam or load-
bearing support, or the removal or change of any required means of egress, or rearrangement of
parts of a structure affecting the egress requirements; nor shall ordinary repairs include addition
to, alteration of, replacement, or relocation of any standpipe, water supply, sewer, drainage, drain
leader, gas, soil, waste, vent or similar piping, fire suppression, electric wiring, mechanical or
other work affecting public health or general safety.

D. Application for Permit. In order to obtain a permit for work regulated by this title, the
applicant shall first file a completed application in writing on a form furnished by the City for
that purpose. Along with the application, the applicant shall also submit related application and
construction documents to include all other data, plans, specifications, calculations and
information as required by the City or by the State of Washington. No action or review will be
taken by the City if the application or application and construction documents are incomplete.

E. Action on Application. The Building Official shall review or cause to be reviewed
applications and any required construction documents for permits and amendments thereto
within a reasonable time after filing. If the application or the construction documents do not
conform to the requirements of pertinent laws, the Building Official shall reject such application
in writing, stating the reasons therefore. If the Building Official is satisfied that the proposed
work conforms to the requirements of the technical codes and laws and ordinances applicable
thereto, and all required fees associated with the permit have been paid to the City, the Building
Official shall issue a permit as soon as practicable.

F. Time Limitation of Application. Aﬂ—aﬁﬁhea&eﬁqfeiu&ﬁefmﬁdfer—aﬂy—emﬁesed%eﬂeshal%e

da. ad ta hava haan alandanad ama hyvoades
geemed—tonaveoeen—aoanaonea TS

davae aftar tha data o in
aayS—aiter—tne—aate-oi—hings
I I d a
S, -

aﬁd—}aﬁﬂﬁab}e—wﬁe—demeﬂs&afeed» 1 Appllcatlons for Wthh no perm1t is 1ssued W1th1n 18-

months following the date of application shall expire by limitation and plans and other data

Page 2



submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed in accordance with
state law.

2. Applications may be canceled for inactivity, if an applicant fails to respond to the
department’s written request for revisions, corrections, actions or additional information within
90 days of the date of request. The building official may extend the response period beyond 90
days if within the original 90 day time period the applicant provides and subsequently adheres to
an approved schedule with specific target dates for submitting the full revisions, corrections or
other information needed by the department.

G. Validity of Permit. The issuance or granting of a permit shall not be construed to be a permit
for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of the technical codes or of any
other ordinance of the City of SeaTac. Permits presuming to give authority to violate or cancel
the provisions of the technical codes or other ordinances of the City of SeaTac shall not be valid.
The issuance of a permit based on construction documents and other data shall not prevent the
Building Official from requiring the correction of errors in the construction documents and other
data. The Building Official is also authorized to prevent occupancy or use of a structure when in
violation of this code or other ordinances of the City of SeaTac.

H. Explratlon of Permlts 1 Every—pefmﬁ—rsweé—sh&l%beeemeﬂﬁva}m&&esﬁheweﬂeeﬂ%he—s&e

Every permit 1ssued shall expire two vears from the date of issuance. The bulldlng official may
approve a request for an extended expiration date where a construction schedule is provided by
the applicant and approved prior to permit issuance.

eeﬂdmeﬁs—ef—weh—pefmﬂ— Everv perm1t that has been exmred for one year or less may be

renewed for a period of one vear for an additional fee as long as no changes have been made to
the originally approved plans. For permits that have been expired for longer than one year., a new
permit must be obtained and new fees paid. No permit shall be renewed more than once.

3. Electrical, mechanical and plumbing permits shall expire at the same time as the associated
building permit except that if no associated building permit is issued. the electrical. mechanical
and/or plumbing permit shall expire 180 days from issuance.

43. The Building Official may grant—in—writing—ene{H-six{6month-extension—The-extension
shal-be-requested-tn-writing-and-justifiable-eause-demenstrated-a 30-day extension to an expired

permit for the purpose of performing a final inspection and closing out the permit as long as not
more than 180 days has passed since the permit expired. The 30-day extension would commence
on the date of written approval. provided no changes have been made or will be made in the
plans or scope of work. If work required under a final inspection is not completed within the 30-
day extension period, the permit shall expire. However. the building official may authorize an
additional 30-day extension if conditions outside of the applicants control exist and the applicant

is making good effort to complete the permitted work. An-expired-permit-may-be-renewed-and

Page 3



[. Suspension or Revocation. The Building Official is authorized to suspend or revoke a permit
issued under the provisions of this title whenever the permit was issued in error or on the basis of
incorrect, inaccurate, or incomplete information, or in violation of any ordinance or regulation or
any of the provisions of the technical codes.

J. Placement of Permit. The permit shall be kept on the site of the work until the completion of
the project.

Section 2. Section 13.100.100 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.100.100 Appeals.

A. With-the-exeeption-of-the-Fire-Code—aAll references in the technical codes to the Board of
Appeals shall be deemed to refer to the Hearing Examiner system of Chapter 1.20 SMC. The

Hearing Examiner shall have no authority relative to interpretation of the administrative
provisions of the technical codes nor shall the Hearing Examiner be empowered to waive
requirements of the technical codes.

B. Appeals to a decision by the Fire Chief shall be made to the Fire—Code—Beard—of
AppealsHearing Examiner. All references in the fire code and adopted International Fire Code to
the Fire Code Board of Appeals shall be deemed to refer to the Hearing Examiner system of
Chapter 1.20 SMC. :

Section 3. Chapter 13.110 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 13.110
BUILDING CODE

Sections:

13.110.010 Building Code.

13.110.020 International Building Code.
13.110.030 International Residential Code.
13.110.040 International Performance Code.
13.110.050 International Existing Building Code.
13.110.060 Copies on file.

13.110.010 Building Code.
The International Building Code, International Residential Code, International Performance
Code and the International Existing Building Code, as adopted and amended by this chapter,

shall collectively be referred to as the Building Code.

Page 4



13.110.020 International Building Code.

The 20096 Edition of the International Building Code, as published by the International Code
Council, as amended by the Washington State Building Code Council and published in Chapter
51-50 WAC, as now or hereafter amended, is hereby adopted by reference with the following
additions and exceptions:

A. Appendixes E and H are hereby adopted.

AB. The following is added to Section 504, Height Modifications:
504.2.1 Five story type VA buildings allowed.

Type VA buildings with B, M, R-1 and R-2 occupancies may be increased to five stories in
height in accordance with all of the following:

1. The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1; and

2. The building is equipped with a complete, approved fire alarm and detection system; and

. The fire sprinkler alarm system is provided with annunciation for each floor; and

(O8]

4. The building does not exceed 60 feet in height; and

5. The vertical exit enclosures shall be smoke proof enclosures in accordance with Section
909.20; and

6. Special inspection is provided for the lateral support portion of the structural system; and

7. The building must comply with all other apphcable provisions of Title 13 of the SeaTac
Municipal Code.

13.110.030 International Residential Code.

The 20096 Edition of the International Residential Code, as published by the International Code
Council, as amended by the Washington State Building Code Council and published in Chapter
51-51 WAC, as now or hereafter amended, is hereby adopted.

A. Appendixes G and R are adopted.

AB. Table R301.2, Climate and Geographic Design Criteria, is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Ground/Roof Snow Load: 25 psf

Page 5



Wind Speed: 85 mph

Topographic Effects: No

Seismic Design Category: D2
Subject to Damage From:

Weathering: Moderate

Frost Line Depth: 18 inches
Termite: Slight to Moderate
Decay: Slight to Moderate

OutsideWinter Design Temperatures: 24F Heat:; 83F Cool. 45

Ice Shield Underlayment Required: No

Flood Hazards: FEMA # 530320

Air Freezing Index: 50
Mean Annual Temperature: 51.4
BC. Sections R105.2 (1) and (7) areis hereby amended to read as follows:

1. One-story detached accessory structures constructed under the provisions of the IRC used as
tool and storage sheds. tree supported play structures. plavhouses and similar uses. provided the
floor area does not exceed 200 square feet (18.58 m?2).

7. Prefabricated swimming pools provided they meet one of the following conditions:
a. The pool is less than 24 inches deep.

b. The pool walls are entirely above ground and the capacity does not exceed 5,000
gallons.

€D. AnewSeetionThe following is added to R405.1.1 is-hereby-added-to read as follows:

R405+-+-Drainage. Provisions shall be made for the control and drainage of water around and
under buildings.

Adequate provisions shall be made to insure that under floor spaces remain free of running or
standing water by the installation of drains. Additional drains are required in foundations to

Page 6



relieve water from under floor spaces where it is determined by the Building Official that such
drainage is required. Drain pipes shall be of sufficient size to adequately convey water to an
approved location, but shall be a minimum size of 4 inches. Provisions shall be made to prevent
the drainage system from becoming blocked.

13.110.040 International Performance Code.

The 20096 Edition of the International Performance Code, published by the International Code
Council, as now or hereafter amended, is hereby adopted.

13.110.050 International Existing Building Code.

The 20096 Edition of the International Existing Building Code, published by the International
Code Council, as now or hereafter amended, is hereby adopted.

13.110.060 Copies on file.

At least one (1) copy of the adopted editions of the International Building Code, International
Residential Code, International Performance Code and the International Existing Building Code
shall be on file in the office of the Building Official on behalf of the City Clerk.

Section 4. Section 13.150.010 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.150.010 International Fire Code.

The 20096 Edition of the International Fire Code, as published by the International Code
Council, as amended by the Washington State Building Code Council, and as published in
Chapter 51-54 WAC, as now or hereafter amended, is adopted by reference with the following
additions and exceptions:

A. Appendixes A, B, C, E, F.-and G, and H are adopted. Appendix D is not adopted.

B. Section 109.3, Violation penalties, is hereby amended to read as follows:
109.3 Violation Penalties.

Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of
the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty
of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than one thousand (1,000) dollars
or by imprisonment of not more than 90 days, or both such fine and imprisonment.
Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed
a separate offense.

C. Section 111.4, Failure to comply, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Page 7



111.4 Failure to comply.

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work
order, except such work as that person is directed, by the City, to perform or remove
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than one hundred
($100.00) dollars or more than double the amount of the permit fee.

D. Section 503, Fire Apparatus Access Roads, is adopted.

E. The following is added to Section 903, Automatic Sprinkler Systems:
903.2.20 Additional Requirements.

In addition to the requirements set forth in this Code, all structures that have a gross
floor area of six thousand (6,000) square feet or more shall have an approved
automatic fire sprinkler system installed throughout. For purposes of determining
gross floor area, the installation of fire walls shall not be considered as creating
separate buildings.

903.2.20.1 Exceptions—Remodeling existing structures.

It is provided that existing structures and structures undergoing remodeling or
improvement are exempt from the provisions of section, provided:

1. There is no increase in floor area, or

2. The area to be improved does not exceed 50% of the total floor area including
mezzanines, or

3. There is no change of occupancy or use, and

4. A fire alarm and detection system meeting all applicable requirements for the
occupancy is installed.

903.2.20.2 Exceptions—Other.

The following new and existing structures are exempt from the provisions of this
section:

1. Group R-3 Occupancies.

[\]

. Detached one and two family dwellings regulated by the Residential Code.

~

3. Portions of structures used as open parking garages, as defined in Section 406.3.2
of the International Building Code, when there are no other occupancies above the
garage and any structures adjacent to the garage are separated by an assumed
property line and protected as required by the International Building Code.

F. The following is added to Section 907, Fire Alarms and Detection Systems:

Page 8



907.2.30 Additional Requirements.

All structures that have a gross floor area of three thousand (3,000) square feet or
more shall be required to have an approved automatic fire alarm and detection system
throughout. For purposes of determining gross floor area, the installation of fire walls
shall not be considered as creating separate buildings.

907.2.30.1 Exceptions:

1. Group R-3 Occupancies.
2. Detached one and two family dwellings regulated by the Residential Code.
3. Group U Occupancies.

4. Occupancies protected throughout by an approved monitored automatic fire
sprinkler system may, in the judgment of the Fire Chief, allow for deletion of heat
detectors from the system.

The provisions of this subsection shall apply to all buildings whose assessed
valuation, according to county records, has increased by more than fifty percent
(50%) within a five (5) year period due to the added value of additions, alterations
and repairs. When the first permit application is submitted to add, to alter or to repair
an existing building, the assessed valuation of the building at the time of the complete
application is submitted shall be considered the base figure for assessed valuation for
the following five (5) year period. The increased assessed valuation shall be
determined by comparing that base figure with the cumulative total permit fees
valuations for the addition, alteration and repair projects undertaken during the five
(5) year period.

Any additions to an existing structure shall be considered new construction and shall
be subject to the provisions of this subsection.

Section 5. Section 13.150.020 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.150.020 Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the adopted edition of the International Fire Code as published by the
International Code Council shall be on file in the office of the Building Official on behalf of the
City Clerk.

Section 6. Section 13.150.050 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.150.050 Marking of fire lanes.
After the Fire Chief or authorized designee makes the determination that a fire lane shall be
established on anv property. the owner. manager, or person in charge of such property shall

Page 9



install and maintain the signs and markings required for the fire lane. All designated fire lanes
shall be clearly marked in the following manner:

A. Vertical curbs shall be painted red on the top and side, extending the length of the designated
fire lane. If no curb exists, the outer edge of the fire lane shall be marked with a six (6) inch wide
red stripe.

B. The side of the red curb, or the flat surface of the red striping, shall be marked at fifty (50)
foot intervals with the words “NO PARKING —~ FIRE LANE.” These words shall bc nprinted in

white letters, three (3) inches in height.

C. Fire lane signs shall be installed along the designated fire lane, shall be spaced fifty (50) feet
or portion thereof apart, and shall be posted on or immediately adjacent to the curb. The top of
fire lane signs shall be not less than four (4) feet nor more than six (6) feet from the ground.
Signs may be placed on a building when approved by the Fire Chief, or designee. When posts are
required, they shall be a minimum of two (2) inch galvanized steel or four (4) inch by four (4)
inch pressure-treated wood. Signs shall be placed so they face the direction of the vehicular
travel.

D. Fire lane signs shall be constructed pursuant to the following illustration and specifications:
Letters Specifications:

The words “No Parking” shall be three (3) inches in height.

NO
PARKING

FIRE LANE

The words “Fire Lane” shall be two (2) inches in height.
Sign Specifications:

1. Fire lane signs shall be reflective.

2. The background shall be white and the letters shall be red.

3. Fire lane signs shall measure eighteen (18) inches in height and twelve (12) inches in
width.

Section 7. Section 13.150.110 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

13.150.110 Property owner responsibility.

Page 10



The owner, manager, or ’person in charge of any property upon which designated fire lanes have
been established shall install and maintain the signs and markings required for the fire lane and
prevent the parking of vehicles or placement of other obstructions in such fire lanes.

Section 8. Chapter 13.160 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:
Chapter 13.160
MECHANICAL CODE

Sections:
13.160.010 International Mechanical Code.
13.160.020 Copy on file.

13.160.010 International Mechanical Code.

The 20096 Edition of the International Mechanical Code, as published by the International Code
Council, as amended by the Washington State Building Code Council and as published in
Chapter 51-52 WAC, as now or hereafter amended, is adopted.

13.160.020 Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the adopted editions of the International Mechanical Code shall be on
file in the office of the Building Official on behalf of the City Clerk.

Section 9. Chapter 13.170 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as

follows:
Chapter 13.170
PLUMBING CODE

Sections:
13.170.010  Uniform Plumbing Code and Uniform Plumbing Code Standards.
13.170.020 Copy on file.

13.170.010 Uniform Plumbing Code and Uniform Plumbing Code Standards.

A. The 20096 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code, as published by the International
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, as amended by the Washington State
Building Code Council and as published in Chapter 51-56 WAC, as now or hereafter amended,
is adopted.

B. The 20096 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code Standards, as published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, as amended by the Washington
State Building Code Council and as published in Chapter 51-57 WAC, as now or hereafter
amended, is adopted.

13.170.020 Copy on file.

Page 11



At least one (1) copy of the adopted editions of the International Plumbing Code and Plumbing
Code Standards shall be on file in the office of the Building Official on behalf of the City Clerk.

Section 10.  Chapter 13.210 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:
Chapter 13.210
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

Sections:
13.210.010.. International Prmpprfy Maintenance Code

13.210.020 Copy on file.
13.210.010 International Property Maintenance Code

The 20096 Edition of the International Property Maintenance Code, as published by the
International Code Council, is adopted with the following exceptions:

A. References to the Board of Appeals in Section 111 shall be deemed to refer to the Hearing
Examiner system of Chapter 1.20 SMC.

B. Subsection 301.3, Vacant buildings and land, is repealed in its entirety and replaced by the
following:

301.3 Vacant Buildings. All vacant buildings and premises thereof must comply with this Code.
Vacant buildings shall be maintained in a clean, safe, secure and sanitary condition provided
herein so as not to cause a blighting problem or otherwise adversely affect the public health,
safety or quality of life.

301.3.1 Appearance. All vacant buildings must appear to be occupied, or appear able to be
occupied with little or no repairs.

301.3.2 Security. All vacant buildings must be secured against outside entry at all times. Security
shall be by the normal building amenities such as windows and doors having adequate strength
to resist intrusion. All doors and windows must remain locked. There shall be at least one
operable door into every building and into each housing unit. Exterior walls and roofs must
remain intact without holes.

301.3.2.1 Architectural (Cosmetic) Structural panels. Architectural structural panels may be used
to secure windows, doors and other openings provided they are cut to fit the opening and match
the characteristics of the building. Architectural panels may be of exterior grade finished
plywood or Medium Density Overlaid plywood (MDO) that is painted to match the building
exterior or covered with a reflective material such as plexi-glass.

Exception. Untreated plywood or similar structural panels may be used to secure windows, doors
and other openings for a maximum period of 30 days.

Page 12



301.3.2.2 Security fences. Temporary construction fencing shall not be used as a method to
secure a building from entry.

Exception. Temporary construction fencing may be used for a maximum period of 30 days.

301.3.3 Weather protection. The exterior roofing and siding shall be maintained as required in
Section 304.

301.3.4 Fire Safety.

301.3.4.1 Fire protection systems. All fire suppression and alarms systems shall be maintained in
a working condition and inspected as required by the Fire Department.

301.3.4.2 Flammable liquids. No vacant building or premises or portion thereof shall be used for
the storage of flammable liquids or other materials that constitute a safety or fire hazard.

301.3.4.3 Combustible materials. All debris, combustible materials, litter and garbage shall be
removed from vacant buildings, their accessory buildings and adjoining yard areas. The building
and premises shall be maintained free from such items.

301.3.4.3 Fire inspections. Periodic fire department inspections may be required at intervals set
forth by the fire chief or his designee.

301.3.5 Plumbing fixtures. Plumbing fixtures connected to an approved water system, an
approved sewage system, or an approved natural gas utility system shall be installed in
accordance with applicable codes and be maintained in sound condition and good repair or
removed and the service terminated in the manner prescribed by applicable codes.

301.3.5.1 Freeze protection. The building’s water systems shall be protected from freezing.

301.3.6 Electrical. Electrical service lines, wiring, outlets or fixtures not installed or maintained
in accordance with applicable codes shall be repaired, removed or the electrical services
terminated to the building in accordance with applicable codes.

301.3.7 Heating. Heating facilities or heating equipment in vacant buildings shall be removed,
rendered inoperable, or maintained in accordance with applicable codes.

301.3.8 Interior floors. If a hole in a floor presents a hazard, the hole shall be covered and
secured with three-quarter (3/4) inch plywood, or a material of equivalent strength, cut to overlap
the hole on all sides by at least six (6) inches.

301.3.9 Termination of utilities. The code official may, by written notice to the owner and to the

appropriate water, electricity or gas utility, request that water, electricity, or gas service to a
vacant building be terminated or disconnected.

Page 13



301.3.9.1 Restoration of Service. If water, electricity or gas service has been terminated or
disconnected pursuant to Section 313.9, no one except the utility may take any action to restore
the service, including an owner or other private party requesting restoration of service until
written notification is given by the code official that service may be restored.

301.3.10 Notice to person responsible. Whenever the code official has reason to believe that a
building is vacant, the code official may inspect the building and premises. If the code official
determines that a vacant building violates any provision of this section, the code official shall

_notify in writing, the owner of the building, or real property upon which the building is located,

or other person responsible, of the violations and required corrections and shall be given a time
frame to comply.

301.3.10.1 Alternate requirements. The requirements and time frames of this section may be
modified under an approved Plan of Action. Within 30 days of notification that a building or real
property upon which the building is located, is in violation of this Section, an owner may submit
a written Plan of Action for the code official to review and approve if found acceptable. A Plan
of Action may allow:

1) Extended use of non-architectural panels
2) Extended use of temporary security fencing
3) Extended time before the demolition of a building is required

4) For substandard conditions to exist for a specific period of time, provided the building is
secured in an approved manner. When considering a Plan of Action, the building official shall
take into consideration the magnitude of the violation and the impact to the neighborhood.

301.3.11 Enforcement. Violations of this section shall be enforced according to the provisions
and procedures of Chapter 1.15 of the SeaTac Municipal Code and subject to the monetary
penalties contained therein.

301.3.11.1 Abatement. A building or structure accessory thereto that remains vacant and open to
entry after the required compliance date is found and declared to be a public nuisance. The code
official is hereby authorized to summarily abate the violation by closing the building to
unauthorized entry. The costs of abatement shall be collected from the owner in the manner
provided by law.

301.3.11.2 Unsafe buildings and equipment. Any vacant building or equipment therein, declared
unsafe is subject to the provisions of Section 108 and the demolition provisions of Section 110.

13.210.020 Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the adopted edition of the International Property Maintenance Code shall
be on file in the office of the Building Official on behalf of the City Clerk.

Page 14



Section 11.  Chapter 13.220 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:
Chapter 13.220
ENERGY CODE

Sections:
13.220.010 Washington State Energy Code.
13.220.020 Copy on file.

13.220.010 Washington State Energy Code.

The Washington State Energy Code, 20096 Edition, as amended by the Washington State
Building Code Council and as published in Chapter 51-11 WAC, as now or hereafter amended,
is adopted.

13.220.020 Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the adopted edition of the Washington State Energy Code shall be on file
in the office of the Building Official on behalf of the City Clerk.

Section 12. Chapter 13.230 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

Chapter-13.230

Section 13.  If any provision of this Ordinance or its application to any person or circumstance
is held invalid, the remainder of the Ordinance or the application of the provision to other
persons or circumstances shall not be affected.

Section 14.  This Ordinance shall be effective July 1, 2010.

Page 15



ADOPTED this % day of ﬂa/ne, 2010, and signed in

authentication thereof on this § YA_ Qyof [)M/ﬂ— ,2010.
CITY OF SEATAC

ATTEST:

Mary M1rag£e’§artolo C1ty Attoriey ey

[Effective Date: 7-2/=/0 ]

[2010 Building Code Amendments]

Page 16



ORDINANCE NO. 10-1019

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington, amending the 2010 Annual City Budget for
miscellaneous items.

WHEREAS, the SeaTac City Council has reviewed Agenda Bill # 3230 submitted by the
Finance and Systems Department which details recommended increases and decreases in various
revenue and expenditure line items in the 2010 Annual City Budget; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has deemed it appropriate to remove the budgeted
amounts for various capital expenditures related to the SeaTac/Airport Station Area from the
2010 Budget; and

WHEREAS, amendment to the City’s 2010 Budget is necessary to provide additional
appropriation authority to fund certain expenditures identified in Agenda Bill #3230;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total General Fund
#001 revenues by $42,786 and increase expenditures by $28,001.

Section 2. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to decrease the total Port of
Seattle ILA Fund #105 expenditures by $8,600,000.

Section 3. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to decrease the total Hotel/Motel
Tax Fund #107 expenditures by $593,376.

Section 4. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total Facility
Repair & Replacement Fund #110 expenditures by $16,410.

Section 3. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total Des Moines
Creek Basin ILA Fund #111 expenditures by $164,760.

Section 6. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total LTGO City
Hall Bond Fund #201 expenditures by $303.

Page - 1



Section 7. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total Hotel/Motel
Tax Bond Fund #203 expenditures by $305.

Section 8. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total 2009 LTGO
Refunding Bond Fund #206 revenues by $610.

Section 9. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total Municipal
CIP Fund #301 revenues by $8,800 and increase expenditures by $28,700.

Section 10.  The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total
Transportation CIP Fund #307 revenues by $98,472.

Section 11.  The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to decrease the total Light Rail
Station Areas CIP Fund #308 revenues by $9,193,376 and decrease expenditures by $9,193,376.

Section 12.  The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total Surface
Water Management Fund #403 revenues by $48,502.

Section 13.  This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after passage and
publication as required by law.

ADOPTED thism day of , 2010, and signed in authentication

thereof on this Q'_’&Lf day of O et ,2010.

CITY OF SEATAC

oy o

Terry erson, Mayor

d»’lﬁ (Lot

ATTEST:

Kristina Gregg, Cit

Approved as to Form:

Moty Pudandte Batto lo
Mary Mirdhte Bartolo, City Attorney
[Effective Date: _ 72-03-/0 ]

[2010 Budget Amendment for Miscellaneous Items]

Page - 2



ORDINANCE NO. __10-1020

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington, approving the low bidder for re-roofing of City Hall,
authorizing the City Manager to enter into a contract with Access
Services, and amending the 2010 Annual City Budget.

WHEREAS, the SeaTac City Hall roof replacement was originally scheduled to be
replaced in the year 2014 in the 2010 — 2015 Capital Improvement Program (CIP), but staff
recommends replacing the roof in 2010 in conjunction with the cooling tower replacement
scheduled for 2010 in the 2010 — 2015 CIP because the flat roof is leaking at various spots; and

WHEREAS, as this expenditure was not included in the 2010 Annual City Budget,
amendment to the 2010 Budget is necessary to provide additional appropriation authority to fund

this expenditure as identified in Agenda bill #3250;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. The 2010 Annual City Budget shall be amended to increase the total Municipal
Capital Improvements Fund #301 expenditures by $314,375.

Section 2. The City Council accepts the low bid of Access Services for the City Hall roof
replacement project. The City Manager is authorized to enter into a contract with Access
Services for the work.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after passage and

publication as required by law.

Page -1



ADOPTED this 422% day of 0&,4\ , 2010, and signed in authentication

J
thereof on thlsm day of O u jﬂ , 2010.
Y

CITY OF SEATAC

nderson, Mayor

ATTEST:

Approved as to Form:

Moty Voiancty Buitolo

Mary E. M&z’ante Bartolo, City Attorney

[Effective Date: . 03/ 07’/ /O

[City Hall Roof Project and Budget Amendment]

Page - 2



ORDINANCE NO. ___10-1021

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington transferring surplus real property to the South
Correctional Entity.
WHEREAS, the City Council approved a Memorandum of Understanding with the
South Correctional Entity (SCORE) on June 9, 2009, that provided that the City Council would
consider transferring 18" Avenue South (“the property”) to the Port of Seattle, so that the Port
could allow SCORE to access the site of a new jail facility currently being constructed; and
WHEREAS, the transfer of 18™ Avenue South was addressed in the 2005 ILA between
the City and the Port, and the City has been compensated by the Port for the property; and
WHEREAS, the City vacated 18™ Avenue South by Ordinance 09-1022, and therefore
the property is no longer City right-of-way, although the property is still owned by the City; and
WHEREAS, the City Council previously adopted Ordinance 09-1027, which declared
that the property is surplus to the needs of the City; and
WHEREAS, a Settlement Agreement dated August 19, 2010 between the Port of Seattle
and SCORE states that the Port will assign all rights in 18" Avenue South to SCORE, and
therefore it is appropriate for SeaTac to deed the property directly to SCORE,;
NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:
Section 1. The real property formerly known as 18™ Avenue South, located between South
208™ Street and South 200" Street, and that is more particularly identified in Exhibit A and

Exhibit B to this Ordinance shall be transferred, upon acceptance, to the South Correctional
Entity.

Page - 1



Section 2. The City Manager is hereby authorized to execute any documents on behalf of the
City to effectuate the transfer of property to the South Correctional Entity as set forth in Section 1
of this Ordinance.

Section 3. Sections 2 and 3 of Ordinance 09-1027 are hereby repealed.

Section 4. If any provision of this Ordinance or its application to any person or circumstance is
held invalid, the remainder of the act or the application of the provision to other persons or
circumstances shall not be affected.

Section 5. This Ordinance shall not be codified and shall be in full force and effect five (5)
days after passage and publication as required by law.

ADOPTED this /544 day of Oc&f@ﬁ%/’ , 2010, and signed in
authentication thereof on this /YA dayof (0 Cﬁé er , 2010.
CITY OF SEATAC

ATTEST:

Kristina Gregg, City’€lerk

Approved as to Form:

Mary E. eréﬁte Bartolo Cxt/y Attorney

[Effective Date: /& - A3 ~/O ]

[Property transfer to SCORE—former 18™ Avenue]

Page - 2



18TH AVE S

1 &TH AVE RIGHT OF WAY - "1

EXHIBIT MAFP
Sw TSECTION 4, TOWNSHIP 22 NORTH, RANGE 4 EAST, W.M.
CITY OF DESMOINES, KING COUNTY, WASHINGTON

AILYOVA HIG0Z

~— 09

‘; ray
W
z
e
m
N Q T T T T T -
s Rl & !
<
> p > '
g - [w) B e
al I FoTm T TANENDE S o]
= JE r--ﬂ'_-T-_,JJEiﬁiﬁNufﬁ.,__q
P i i 1 1
ol Z N e
© o Lo-do - HAVENIVOGD NG, L
¥ i ¥ i T 1T T TS
1] i
i i
¥ i)

i —
] |
| |
| |
! |
| |
| |
ﬂ | |
-

!
» 1
o ROl [
2 | SULLINGERS 137 Ag?m,' s
l 2 D
| it

PROPOSED 18TH AVE S. VACATION

! SCALE: 1"=300 FEET

Vv 11g9IHX4



Exhibit B

Description

All that portion of the 60-foot former right-of-way known as 18" Avenue South lying southerly of South
200" Street and northerly of South 208" Street. Situated in the Southwest Quarter of Section 4,
Township 22 North, Range 4 East, W.M., City of SeaTac, King County, Washington.

This portion of the 18" Avenue South right-of-way was vacated by SeaTac Ordinance 09-1022.



ORDINANCE NO. 10-1022

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington adding a new Chapter 1.35 of the SeaTac Municipal Code
related to the City Logo.

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to regulate the use of the City logo;
NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,

WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. A new Chapter 1.35 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby created to read as
follows:

Chapter 1.35
City Logo
Sections:

1.35.010 Legislative findings.
1.35.020 Definition.

1.35.030 Official use.
1.35.040 Violation.

1.35.050 Permission for use.

1.35.010 Legislative findings.

The City Council finds that the logo of the City of SeaTac is a symbol of the authority of the City
and is a valuable asset of its population. It is the intent of the City Council to ensure that only
appropriate uses are made of said City logo.

1.35.020 Definition.

Unless the context clearly requires otherwise, the definition in this section applies throughout
this chapter. "City logo" or "logo" means the logo depicted below with "City of SeaTac" and
depicting an airplane with a city skyline and mountain in the background. The City logo may
appear with or without “Est. 1990 to represent the year the City incorporated.

Page - 1



1.35.030 Official use.
Use of the city logo shall be for official purposes as specifically set forth below:

A. The following uses have been explicitly and expressly approved without the need for further
City consent:

1. Use of logo on any official City of SeaTac document, including but not limited to stationery,
letterhead, report and report covers, envelopes, memorandums, faxes, employee and elected
officials’ business cards, name tags, and name plates;

2. Use of logo by Seattle Southside Visitor Services, Enterprise Seattle, the Southwest King
County Economic Initiative, and the State of Washington for their marketing materials, on their
website, and in their printed materials that are used in recruitment, expansion and retention
efforts for marketing for business attraction and development;

3. Use of logo by the Southwest King County Chamber of Commerce for City of SeaTac
promotion including for the City’s general promotion through the Chamber’s map;

4. Use of logo by an entity approved by the City Manager for apparel or other merchandise
purchased by City employees and elected officials, provided those purchases are transacted while
those employees and elected officials are still serving in their City capacities; and

5. Use of logo by those officially involved with and for the planning of City sponsored festivals
and events, such as the International Festival and accompanying parade, including but not limited
to event decorations, promotional materials, advertisements, posters, and temporary signs.

B. If requested, the City logo may be used for other specific events that benefit the City of
SeaTac community, upon approval as set forth in SMC 1.35.050.

C. The City logo shall not be used on or in connection with any advertising or promotion for any
product, business, organization, service, or article, whether offered for sale for profit or offered
without charge, without approval of the City Manager as set forth in SMC 1.35.050. The logo
shall not be used in connection with any election issue, or campaign related thereto.

D. It is a violation of this chapter to use any symbol that imitates the logo or that is deceptively
similar in appearance of the logo, or in any manner that would be an improper use of the logo
itself.

Page - 2



1.35.040 Violation.

Any person who willfully violates this chapter is guilty of a misdemeanor. The city’s right to
prosecute under this section shall not affect its rights to pursue civil or injunctive relief under
federal or state laws, or any other relief available under the law.

1.35.050 Permission for use.

Any request for use of the City logo not approved as set forth in SMC 1.35.030 (A) shall be
submitted in writing to the City Clerk in advance of the date needed. The City Manager, shall
decide whether the requested use shall be approved by the City. The City Clerk shall send written
response to the requestor within three business days of the decision by the City Manager.

Section 2. If any provision of this Ordinance or its application to any person or circumstance
is held invalid, the remainder of the Ordinance or the application of the provision to other
persons or circumstances shall not be affected.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after passage and
publication as required by law.

ADOPTED this __s&%#A dayof __ O¢+2be~ ., 2010, and signed in
authentication thereof on this _ /R ¥A day of O tober , 2010.
CITY OF SEATAC

Terry derson Mayor

ATTEST:

276 t0 é %%5 égﬁ‘,%a (2/2 C Lk
Kristina Gregg, City

Approved as to Form:

Mate, Mot Banrots

Mary E. Mikdnte Bartolo, City Attorney

[Effective Date: _/¢~-23 =/ ]

[Use of City Logo]

Page - 3



ORDINANCE NO. 10-1023

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington amending sections 9.05.050 and 9.05.060 of the SeaTac
Municipal Code related to parking infractions.

WHEREAS, the City Council finds it appropriate to increase the monetary penalties for
parking infractions related to commercial and wide vehicle parking; and

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. Section 9.05.050 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

9.05.050 Commercial parking prohibited.

It is a parking infraction, with a monetary penalty of fiftytwo hundred dollars ($5200.00), for any
person to park a commercial vehicle which is more than eighty (80) inches wide overall on any
street or alley in residentially zoned areas (zones UH, UM, UL, and MHP, as designated by
Chapter 15.11 SMC) between the hours of midnight and six a.m.

Section 2. Section 9.05.060 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

9.05.060 Parking wide vehicles on certain streets.

It is a parking infraction, with a monetary penalty of fifertwo hundred dollars ($5200.00), for any
person to park any vehicle, as defined in RCW 46.04.670, which is ninety (90) inches wide or
wider on or along any City street, road, alley or right-of-way other than 12th Place South between
16th Avenue South and 12th Avenue South, 12th Avenue South between 12th Place South and
South 192nd Street, South 192nd Street between 12th Avenue South and 16th Avenue South, and
16th Avenue South between South 192nd Street and 12th Place South; provided, that this section
shall not apply to momentary stops and parking for loading, unloading and making deliveries to
residences and businesses in the vicinity, or instances when an emergency exists and the vehicle
is parked no longer than necessary. It is further provided that this section shall not be construed
to grant any person a right to park any vehicle in any location in the City, and this section does
not relieve the driver or operator of any vehicle of the responsibility to park a vehicle in a safe
manner and in accordance with applicable traffic codes.

Page - 1



Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after passage and
publication as required by law.

ADOPTED this __ /R¥A. dayof ()@ fober” | 2010, and signed in

authentication thereof on this _ /R¥A day of OC St ,2010.

CITY OF SEATAC

(CCatloan

Terry Apdérson, Mayor

ATTEST:

‘22201 : e, Yo, (lest.
Kristina Gregg, City”Clerk
Approved as to Form:

WA i o Mt dt T B tbrle

Mary E. Mirégke Bartolo, City Attorney

[Effective Date: _ /0~ 33 /0 ]

[Wide Vehicle Parking Ordinance]

Page - 2



ORDINANCE NO. __10-1024
AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of
SeaTac, Washington, amending Sections 15.12.060,
15.14.060, 15.15.030, 15.35.150, and 15.38.150, and
adding Sections 15.10.078.06, 15.10.078.06.01,
15.10.078.08, 15.10.101, 15.10.238, 15.10.239,
15.10.239.02, 15.10.239.03, 15.10.239.04, 15.10.239.05,
15.10.239.06, 15.10.239.07, 15.10.401, 15.10.418,
15.10.423, 15.10.470.07, 15.10.510.02, and adding a new
Chapter 15.40 to the SeaTac Municipal Code related to
“Electric Vehicle Infrastructure” (EVI).
WHEREAS, during the 2009 session the Washington State Legislature passed
House Bill 1481 (HB 1481), an Act relating to electric vehicles. The Bill addressed
electric vehicle infrastructure including the structures, machinery, and equipment
necessary and integral to support an electric vehicle, including battery charging stations,
rapid charging stations, and battery exchange stations; and
WHEREAS, the purpose of HB 1481 is to encourage the transition to electric
vehicle use and to expedite the establishment of a convenient and cost-effective electric
vehicle infrastructure that such a transition necessitates. The Legislature agreed that the
development of a convenient infrastructure to recharge electric vehicles is essential to
increase consumer acceptance of these vehicles. The State’s success in encouraging this
transition will serve as an economic stimulus to the creation of short-term and long-term
jobs as the entire automobile industry and its associated direct and indirect jobs transform
over time from combustion to electric vehicles; and
WHEREAS, the Revised Code of Washington (RCW) 35.63.126 requires that

the City of SeaTac must allow electric vehicle infrastructure as a use in all areas except

those zoned for residential or resource use or critical areas; and

Page 1



WHEREAS, greenhouse gas emissions related to transportation constitute more
than fifty percent of all greenhouse gas emissions in the State of Washington; and

WHEREAS, The use of electricity from the Northwest as a transportation fuel
instead of petroleum fuels results in significant reductions in the emissions of pollutants,
including greenhouse gases, and reduces the reliance of the state on imported sources of
energy for transportation; and

WHEREAS, with the potential emerging market for plug-in electric vehicles,
new industry standards have been adopted to ensure universal compatibility between
vehicle manufacturers. Broad-based installation of new universally compatible charging
stations is intended to ensure that plug-in electric vehicles will be a viable alternative to
gasoline-powered vehicles; and

WHEREAS, it is apiaropriate to amend the City’s development regulations
regarding electric vehicle infrastructure; and

WHEREAS, the Growth Management Act requires regular review and update of
development regulations which implement the City’s Comprehensive Plan and conform
with State law; and

WHEREAS, regular review and update of the Zoning Code ensures that
development regulations are responsive to the needs of the City; and

WHEREAS, the Planning Commission has reviewed the aforesaid changes to
development regulations, has held a public hearing for the purpose of soliciting public
comment in regard to Zoning Code changes, and has recommended the amendments and

additions for adoption by the Council,

Page 2



NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,

WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. Section 15.12.060 of the
read as follows: :

15.12.060 Retail/Commercial Zones

ZONES:

P -~ Park

UM - Urban Medium Density

UH — Urban High Density

UH-UCR - Urban High-Urban Center Residential
NB -~ Neighborhood Business

CB-C - Urban Center

P — Permitted Use; C — Conditional Use Permit

SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to

ABC - Aviation Business Center

| - Industrial/Manufacturing

O/CM - Office/Commercial Medium
O/C/IMU - Office/Commercial/Mixed Use
T - Townhouse

ZONES
o/C O/CIM
USE # LAND USE P |MHP| UL | UM UH NB | CB | ABC | M BP U T
RETAIL/COMMERCIAL
USES
101 Hotel/Motel and Cc* P P> p* p* c* c*
Associated Uses
102 | Forest Products P(3) {P*(3) C(1) | P*(6)
103 | Hardware/Garden P P* P*(6) P*(9)
Material
104 | Department/\Variet P P* 1P*2) P*(6) P*(9)
y Store
105 |Food Store P*8) |P P |P*(2) P*(6) P*(9)
106 Agricultural Crop P P pP* P P
Sales (Farm Only) (12)
106.1 | Produce Stand P p* P P o C
107 Auto/Boat Dealer P* P C*(6)
108 Auto Supply Store P pP* P C*(6) C*(9)
109 Gasoline/Service P pP* P
Station
109.1 | Mobile Refueling | P(10 | P(10 | P(10 |P(10 |P(10) |P(10 |P(11 | P(11 |P(11 | P(10)|P(11 | P(10) |P(10
Operation ) ) ) ) ) ) ) ) ) )
109.2 | Auto Repair c P P

Page 3




109.3 | Automotive P p p p
Service Center (13)

110 Apparel/Accessory p* P*(2) p* P(9)
Store ‘

111 Furniture Store P* p* P(9)

12| Fast C*24 |P@) [P [P [P |P6) |P*(2) | P*(49)
Food/Restaurant )

112.1 | Retail Food Shop P*@8) |P P* |P* P* P*(2) | P*(9)

112.2 | Tavern P@®) |P* p* c*

113 Drug Store P pP* pP* P*(G) P*(Z) P*(Q)

114 Liquor Store p* p* c*

115 | Antique/Secondha P p* P*(6) P*(9)
nd Store

116 Sporting Goods p* P*(2) P*(6) P*(9)
and Related Stores

117 Media Material P*7) |P P* | P*2) p* P*9)

118 | Jewelry Store P P*  1P*2) P*(6) P*(9)

119 Hobby/Toy Store P p* P*(2) P*(6) P*(9)

120 | Photographic and P P 1P*2) P*(6) P*(9)
Electronic Store

121 | Fabric Store P*|P%2) P*(6) P*(9)

122 Florist Shop P*7) |P p* P*(2) P*(6) P*(9)

123 | Pet Store P* |P*(2) P*(6) P*(9)

124 | Wholesale/Bulk cr |c* P C*(6) P*(9)
Store

125 Beauty Salon cx8) |P p* p* c*(6) P*(9)

125.1 | Laundromat P*7) | P p* p* P* P*9)

125.2 | Espresso Stand P*2) |P pP* p* p p* p* P*(9)

125.3 | Comm. Marine c pP* P p*
Supply

126 Other Retail Uses c P* Cc* P* o]

127 | Adult C*5)| C*B) [ C(8)

Entertainment

Page 4




128 Electric Vehicle P P P P P(14) |P P P P P P(2)|P(2) P
Infrastructure (15) |(15) [(15) |(15) (15

* See Chapters 15.13 and 15.35 SMC for additional development standards.

(1) Forest product related businesses shall provide the following:
a. Minimum of ten (10) acres;
b. Access to major arterial; and
c.  Minimum thirty (30) foot buffers around the perimeter of property (Type II landscaping).

(2)  Accessory to primary use not to exceed twenty percent (20%) of primary use.

(3)  Temporary forest product sales related to holidays. Merchandise limited to Christmas trees, wreaths, herbs and
associated decorations.

(4)  No fast food restaurants or drive-through facilities allowed.

(5) See SMC 15.29.010.

(6)  Permitted as part of a mixed use development.

(7)  Small, resident-oriented uses only, as part of a residential mixed use project.

(8)  Small, resident-oriented uses only.

(9) Permitted as part of a mixed use development, as described in SMC 15.35.610.

(10) Permitted only to refuel heavy equipment at a construction site, subject to the criteria under SMC 15.13.103.

(11)  Subject to the criteria under SMC 15.13.102.

(12) No permanent retail sales structures permitted. Retail sales allowed on a seasonal basis for no more than 90 days
in a calendar year. Wholesale sales permitted year round only for products produced/grown on site.

(13) Accessory to primary use not to exceed twenty percent (20%) of primary square footage.

(14) _Battery charging stations only, limited in use only to the tenants or customers of the development located on-site.

(15)

Restricted electric vehicle charging stations only.

Section 2. Section 15.14.060 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to

read

as follows:

15.14.060 Landscaping Standards for Retail/Commercial Uses

BUILDING
SIDE/REAR
FACADE IF PARKING
BUFFER FOR
USE STREET > 30 FT. SIDE/REAR NON LOT
LAND USE FRONTAGE [HIGH OR > [YARDS LANDSCAPE
# ) i COMPATIBLE
(Type/Width)[50 FT. (Type/Width) ZONES STANDARDS
WIDE i APPLICABLE*
) (Type/Width)
(Type/Width)
RETAIL/COMMERCIAL USES
101 |Hotel/Motel and /10 ft. IV/5 ft. 11/5 ft. 1120 ft. (SF) Yes
Associated Uses
102 |Forest Products [1/10 ft. IV/5 ft. 1/5 ft. I/10 ft. (RES) |Yes
103 |Hardware/Garden IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. 11/5 ft. 11710 ft. (RES) |Yes
Material
104 |Department/Variety IV/10 ft. IV/5 t. /s ft. 11/10 ft. (RES) |Yes
Store
105 |Food Store IV/10 ft. 1IV/5 ft. 1I/5 ft. 1i/10 ft. (RES) |Yes
106 |Agricultural Crop Sales|lll/5 ft. - /5 ft.=** 11110 ft, Yes***

Page 5§




(Farm Only) (RES)***
106.1|Produce Stand IV/5 ft. - IV/5 ft. - -
107 |Auto/Boat Dealer [11/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. 1/20 ft. (RES) |Yes
108 |Auto Supply Store /10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. I/10 ft. (RES) [Yes
109 |Gasoline/Service /5 ft. 1IV/5 ft. 11175 ft. 1110 ft. Yes

Station (RES)**

109.2 | Automobile Repair 11110 ft. IV/5 ft. 11/5 ft. 1120 ft. (SF) Yes
109.3|Automobile Service

Center /10 ft. IVI/5 ft. /5 ft. 1120 ft. (SF)  |Yes
110 |Apparel/Accessory 111/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes

Store
111 |Furniture Store IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. 1110 ft. (SF) |Yes

{112 |Fast Food/Restaurant |IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. I11/5 ft. 1110 ft. (RES) |Yes
112.1|Retail Food Shop IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. [1/5 ft. [1/10 ft. (SF) |Yes
112.2{Tavern V10 ft. IV/5 ft. 11/5 ft. 11110 ft. (SF) |Yes
113 |Drug Store IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. 11/5 ft. 11110 ft. (SF) |Yes
114 |Liquor Store VM0 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes
115 |Antique/Secondhand |IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes

Store
116 |Sporting Goods and  |IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /s ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes

Related Store
117 |Media Material IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. HI/5 ft. 11710 ft. (SF) |Yes
118 |Jewelry Store IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. 15 ft. 11110 ft. (SF) |Yes
119 |Hobby/Toy Store IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes
120 |Photographic and IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. (/5 ft. 1110 ft. (SF) |Yes

Electronic Store
121 |Fabric Store IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes
122 |Florist Shop IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. 11/5 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes
123 |Pet Store IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes
124 |Wholesale/Bulk Store |IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. 11110 ft. (SF) |Yes
125 |Beauty Salon IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. 1175 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes
125.1|Laundromat IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. [/10 ft. (SF) |Yes
125.3|Commercial Marine V10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. 110 ft. (SF)  |Yes

Page 6




Supplies

126 |Other Retail Uses IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /5 ft. /10 ft. (SF) |Yes
127 |Adult Entertainment IV/10 ft. IV/5 ft. /6 ft. - Yes
128 |Electric Vehicle 1I/5 ft. 1\V/5 ft. [1/5 ft. I/10 ft. (RES) |Yes

Infrastructure — Battery

Exchange Station and

Level 3 Rapid
Charging Station Only

(6]

*See SMC 15.14.090.
**See SMC 15.13.109.
*** Does not apply in the residential zone.
(SF) Adjacent to single-family (UL or UM) zones for buffering purposes. See SMC 15.14.057.
(RES) Adjacent to single-family or multi-family zones (UL, UH-900/1800, or MHP) for buffering
purposes.

(1) Required for rapid charging station only if it is a primary use on the property.

Section 3.

read as follows:

Section 15.15.030 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to

15.15.030 Parking Space Requirements for Residential Uses

USE
#

LAND USE

MINIMUM SPACES REQUIRED

RETAIL/COMMERCIAL USES

101 |Hotel/Motel and Associated Uses

Basic Guest and Employee (no shuttle service) |.9 per bedroom

Basic Guest and Employee (with shuttle service) |.75 per bedroom

with restaurant/lounge/bar 1 per 150 gsf

with banquet/meeting room 1 per 150 gsf

Retail: 15,000 gsf or less 1 per 1,000 gsf

Retail: greater than 15,000 gsf 1.5 per 1,000 gsf
102 | Forest Products 1 per employee
103 |Hardware/Garden Material 1 per 250 sf of leasable space
104 | Department/Variety Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space
105 |Food Store

Page 7




at least 15,000 sf

1 per 250 sf of leasable space

less than 15,000 sf

3, plus 1 per 300 sf

106 | Agricultural Crop Sales (Farm Only) 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

106.1| Produce Stand 1 per 250 sf of gross floor area, plus 1 per
employee

107 |Auto/Boat Dealer 1 per 300 sf of building, plus 1 per employee

108 |Auto Supply Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

109 | Gasoline/Service Station

without grocery store attached 1 per employee, plus 1 per service bay
with grocery store attached 1 per employee, plus 1 per 200 sf of store

area

109.2| Automobile Repair 2 spaces per service bay

109.3| Automotive Service Center 4 spaces, plus 6 stacking spaces

110 |Apparel/Accessory Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

111 | Furniture Store 1 per 300 sf of building

112 | Fast Food/Restaurant 1 per'150 sf of Ieaéable'space (plus 5
stacking spaces with drive-through)

112.1| Retail Food Shop 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

112.2| Tavern 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

113 | Drug Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

114 | Liquor Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

115 | Antique/Secondhand Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

116 | Sporting Goods and Related Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

117 | Media Material 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

118 |Jewelry Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

119 |Hobby/Toy Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

120 |Photographic and Electronic Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

121 | Fabric Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

122 | Florist Shop 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

123 | Pet Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

124 | Wholesale/Bulk Store 1 per 250 sf of leasable space

125 |Beauty Salon 1 per 200 sf of gross floor area

Page 8




1 per 150 sf of gross floor area, plus 3 stacking
125.2| Espresso Stand . .
spaces with drive-through
) ] 1 per 1,000 sf of gross floor area, plus 1 space per
125.3| Commercial Marine Supply
employee
126 | Other Retail Uses 1 per 250 sf of gross floor area
127 | Adult Entertainment
1 per employee
Electric Vehicle Infrastructure — Battery i ) .
i ] .65 spaces per rapid charging station space for
128 |Exchange Station and Rapid Charging N ) ] .
Station Ol customers waiting to use rapid charging station
ation Only
(Required only if the use is the primary use on the
property)
Section 4. Section 15.35.150 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to

read as follows:

15.35.150 Retail/Commercial Uses

15.35.150 Retail/Commercial Uses (City Center Area)
ZONES:

P — Park

UM — Urban Medium Density
UH — Urban High Density
UH-UCR - Urban High-Urban Center Residential
NB — Neighborhood Business

ABC — Aviation Business Center
| — Industrial/Manufacturing
O/CM - Office/Commercial Medium

O/C/MU - Office/Commercial/Mixed Use

T — Townhouse

CB-C - Urban Center
P — Permitted Use; C — Conditional Use Permit
ZONES
USE UH- CB-
# LAND USE P [UM UH UCR|NB| C |ABC| | |O/CMm|O/C/MU

RETAIL/COMMERCIAL
USES

101 | Hotel/Motel and C(11,12,13,14) P P P P C
Associated Uses

102 |Forest Products PB)|PR) |P3) |C(1) |P(3)

103 |Hardware/Garden P P P®) |P(6)
Material

Page 9




104 | Department/Variety P |P P P@®) |[P(®6)
Store
105 |Food Store P(8) P®) |P |P P P@) |P(6)
106 | Agricultural Crop P |P
Sales (Farm Only)
107 | Auto/Boat Dealer P(2) P C(2)
108 |Auto Supply Store P |P(8) P C(6) |C(6)
109 | Gasoline/Service c |P P
Station
109.1| Mobile Refueling P(©9)|P©9)|P(9) P(9) |P(9)|P(10)|P(10)| P(10)| P(10) | P(9) P(9)
Operation
110 | Apparel/Accessory P(7) P(6) P P(2) P®6) |P(©)
Store
111 | Furniture Store P(6) P P@®) |[P(®)
112 |Fast C(2,4) P(4,6) P P P P(4,6) | P(4,6)
Food/Restaurant
112.1| Retail Food Shop P(8) P@®) (P |P P P@®) |P(6)
112.2| Tavern P@®) |P(8)|P P P@®) |C
113 |Drug Store P(7) P®) |P |P P P®6) |P(6)
114 | Liquor Store P P C
115 | Antique/Secondhand PG) |P |P P®) |P(6)
Store
116 | Sporting Goods and P®6) |P |P P P®) |P®)
Related Stores
117 |Media Material P(7) P@®) |P |P P P@®) |P(®)
118 | Jewelry Store P(7) P@®) |P |P P P®) |P(6)
119 | Hobby/Toy Store P(7) P®) |P |P P P(@6) |P(®)
120 | Photographic and PG) |P |P = P®) |P(6)
Electronic Store
121 |Fabric Store P(7) P(6) P P P®) |P(6)
122 | Florist Shop P(7) P6) (P |P P P@®) |P(®)
123 | Pet Store P(6) P P®) |P(®)
124 | Wholesale/Bulk c c P c®) |P®)

Page 10




Store

125 |Beauty Salon P(8) P@) (P |P P ~|C®B) |P®)

125.1| Laundromat P(7) P P |P P P(6)

125.2| Espresso Stand P(2) P P P P P P P(B)

125.3| Comm. Marine Cc |P P
Supply

126 | Other Retail Uses P(7) P®) |C |P C P C

127 | Adult Entertainment C(5) |C(5) |C(5)

128 |Electric Vehicle 121(_6) Pfl_6) P5) p@s) (P p p p P P 121_6)
Infrastructure

(1) Forest product related businesses shall provide the following:
a. Minimum of ten (10) acres;
b. Access to major arterial; and
c.  Minimum thirty (30) foot buffers around the perimeter of property (Type Il landscaping).
(2) Accessory to primary use not to exceed twenty percent (20%) of primary use.
(3) Temporary forest product sales related to holidays. Merchandise limited to Christmas trees, wreaths,
herbs and associated decorations.
(4) No fast food restaurants with drive-through facilities allowed.
(5) See SMC 15.29.010.
(6) Permitted as part of a mixed use development, as described in SMC 15.35.610.
(7) Small, resident-oriented uses only, as part of a residential mixed use project.
(8) Small, resident-oriented uses only. _
(9) Permitted only to refuel heavy equipment at a construction site, subject to the criteria under SMC
15.13.103.
(10) Subject to the criteria under SMC 15.13.102.
(11) Only allowed on UH zoned properties south of S. 184th Street.
(12) The maximum height allowed is thirty (30) feet.
(13) The maximum number of hotel rooms may not exceed one hundred thirty (130) rooms.
(14) Conference or meeting facilities may not be expanded.
(15) _Battery charging stations only, limited in use only to the tenants or customers of the development
located on-site.
(16) Restricted electric vehicle charging stations only.

Section 5. Section 15.38.150 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

15.38.150 Retail/Commercial Uses

ZONES:
UL — Urban Low Density CB-C - Urban Center
UM — Urban Medium Density T — Townhouse

UH - Urban High Density

UH-UCR - Urban High-Urban Center Residential
P — Permitted Use; C - Conditional Use Permit; Blank Cell Means Use Prohibited

Page 11




ZONES

USE # LAND USE UL | UM | UH |UH-UCR|CB-C| T
RETAIL/COMMERCIAL USES
101 Hotel/Motel and Associated Uses C(8) |P#4) P
102 Forest Products P(2)
103 Hardware/Garden Material P
104 Department/Variety Store P
105 Food Store P®) |P(4) P
106 Agricultural Crop Sales (Farm Only) P
107 Auto/Boat Dealer
108 Auto Supply Store P4)
109 Gasoline/Service Station
109.1 . | Mobile Refueling Operation P9) |P(9) |P(9) P(10) | P(9)
110 Apparel/Accessory Store P(5) |P(4) P‘
111 Furniture Store P(4) P
112 Restaurant c(1) (P& P
112.1 | Retail Food Shop P@©) |P@) P
112.2 |Tavern P(4) P
113 Drug Store P(5) [P(4) P
114 Liguor Store P
115 Antique/Secondhand Store P(4) P
116 Sporting Goods and Related Stores P(4) P
117 |Media Material P(5) |P4) P
118 | Jewelry Store P(5) |P#) P
119 Hobby/Toy Store P(5) |P(4) P
120 Photographic and Electronic Store P(4) P
121 Fabric Store P(5) |P(4) P
122 Florist Shop P(5) |P(4) P
123 Pet Store P(4) P
124 Wholesale/Bulk Store C
125 Beauty Salon P@®) [P(4) P

Page 12



125.1 | Laundromat P®) |P®B) |P P

125.2 |Espresso Stand (7) P P P

125.3 | Comm. Marine Supply P

126 Other Retail Uses P(5) [P(4) P

127 Adult Entertainment C(3)

128 Electric Vehicle Infrastructure PU2IP(12)(P1DP (1) |P P(12)

(1) Accessory to primary use not to exceed twenty percent (20%) of primary use.

(2) Temporary forest product sales related to holidays. Merchandise limited to Christmas trees, wreaths,
herbs and associated decorations.

(3) See SMC 15.29.010.

(4) Permitted as part of a mixed use development, as described in SMC 15.38.610.

(5) Small, resident-oriented uses only, as part of a residential mixed use project.

(6) Small, resident-oriented uses only.

(7) Walk-up only.

(8) Conditional use with greater than or equal to fifty percent (50%) residential use.

(9) Permitted only to refuel heavy equipment at a construction site, subject to the criteria under SMC
15.13.103.

(10

Permitted only to refuel heavy equipment at a construction site, subject to the criteria under SMC

15.13.102.

D

Battery charging stations only, limited in use only to the tenants or customers of the development

Jocated on-site.
(12) Restricted electric vehicle charging stations only.

Section 6. A new Section 15.10.078.06 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

15.10.078.06 Battery Charging Station

Means an electrical component assembly or cluster of component assemblies
designed specifically to charge batteries within electric vehicles, which meets or
exceeds any standards, codes, and regulations set forth in Chapter 19.28 RCW
and consistent with rules adopted under RCW 19.27.540.

Section 7. A new Section 15.10.078.06.01 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

15.10.078.06.01 Battery Electric Vehicle (BEV)

Any vehicle that operates exclusively on electrical energy from an off-board
source that is stored in the vehicle’s batteries, and produces zero emissions or
pollution when stationary or operating.

Section 8. A new Section 15.10.078.08 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

Page 13



15.10.078.08 Battery Exchange Stations

A fully automated facility that will enable an electric vehicle with a swappable
battery to enter a drive lane and exchange the depleted battery with a fully
charged battery through a fully automated process, which meets or exceeds any
standards, codes, and regulations set forth by Chapter 19.27 RCW and consistent
with rules adopted under RCW 19.27.540.

Section 9.

A new Section 15.10.101 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby added

to read as follows:

15.10.101 Charging Levels

Section 10.

Means the standardized indicators of electrical force, or voltage, at which
an electric vehicle’s battery is recharged. The terms 1, 2, and 3 are the
most common EV charging levels, and include the following
specifications:

e Level 1is considered slow charging.

e Level 2 is considered medium charging.
e Level 3 is considered fast or rapid charging or DC fast charge.

Level 1 is present in homes and businesses and typically operates on a 15-
or 20-amp breaker on a 120-volt Alternating Current (AC) circuit and
standard outlet.

Level 2 is expected to become the standard for home and public charging
and typically operates on a 40-amp to 100-amp breaker on a 208 or 240-
volt AC circuit.

Level 3 is primarily for commercial and public applications (e.g., taxi
fleets and charging along freeways) and typically operates on a 60-amp or
higher dedicated breaker on a 480-volt or higher three-phase circuit with
special grounding equipment. Note that the term “Level 37 is
recommended to identify the increased power need in a numerical fashion
(i.e., “3”), but the Level 3 charging level is also sometimes referred to as
“DC Fast” charging and “Rapid” charging (see definition of Rapid
Charging Station).

A new Section 15.10.238 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby added

to read as follows:

15.10.238 Electric Scooters and Motorcycles

Means any 2-wheel vehicle that operates exclusively on electrical energy
from an off-board source that is stored in the vehicle’s batteries and
produces zero emissions or pollution when stationary or operating.

Page 14



Section 11.

A new Section 15.10.239 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby added

to read as follows:

15.10.239 Electric Vehicle

Section 12.

Means any vehicle that operates, either partially or exclusively, on
electrical energy from the grid, or an off-board source, that is stored on-
board for motive purpose. “Electric vehicle” includes: (1) a battery
electric vehicle [BEV]; (2) a plug-in hybrid electric vehicle [PHEV]; (3) a
neighborhood electric vehicle; and (4) medium-speed electric vehicle.

A new Section 15.10.239.02 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby

added to read as follows:

15.10.239.02 Electric vehicle charging station

Section 13.

Means a public or private parking space that is served by battery charging
station equipment that has as its primary purpose the transfer of electric
energy (by conductive or inductive means) to a battery or other energy
storage device in an electric vehicle. An electric vehicle charging station
equipped with Level 1 or Level 2 charging equipment is permitted outright
as an accessory use to any principal use.

A new Section 15.10.239.03 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby

added to read as follows:

15.10.239.03 Electric vehicle charging station — public

Section 14.

Means an electric vehicle charging station that is (1) publicly owned and
publicly available (e.g., Park & Ride parking, public library parking lot) or
(2) privately owned and publicly available (e.g., shopping center parking,
non-reserved parking in multi-family parking lots).

A new Section 15.10.239.04 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby

added to read as follows:

15.10.239.04 Electric vehicle charging station — private

Section 15.

Means an electric vehicle charging station that is (1) privately owned and
has restricted access (e.g., single-family home, multifamily parking,
executive parking, designated employee parking) or (2) publicly owned
and restricted (e.g., fleet parking with no access to the general public).

A new Section 15.10.239.05 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby

added to read as follows:

Page 15



15.10.239.05 Electric Vehicle Infrastructure

Means structures, machinery, and equipment necessary and integral to
support an electric vehicle, including battery charging stations, rapid
charging stations, and battery exchange stations.

Section 16. A new Section 15.10.239.06 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

15.10.239.06 FElectric vehicle parking space

Means any marked parking space that identifies the use to be exclusively
for the parking of an electric vehicle.

Section 17. A new Section 15.10.239.07 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

15.10.239.07 Electric Vehicle Waiting Space

An off-street parking space where an electric vehicle, plug-in hybrid
electric vehicle, electric scooters, and motorcycles wait to use a public
electric vehicle charging station.

Section 18. A new Section 15.10.401 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby added
to read as follows:

15.10.401 Medium-speed Electric Vehicle

Means a self-propelled, electrically powered four-wheeled motor vehicle,
equipped with a roll cage or crush-proof body design, whose speed
attainable in one mile is more than 25 miles per hour but not more than 35
miles per hour and otherwise meets or exceeds the federal regulations set
forth in 49 C.F.R. Sec. 571.500.

Section 19. A new Section 15.10.418 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby added
to read as follows:

15.10.418 Neighborhood Electric Vehicle
Means a self-propelled, electrically powered four-wheeled motor vehicle
whose speed attainable in one mile is more than 20 miles per hour and not

more than 25 miles per hour and conforms to federal regulations under
Title 49 C.F.R. Part 571.500.

Section 20. A new Section 15.10.423 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby added
to read as follows:

Page 16



15.10.423 Non-Electric Vehicle
Any vehicle not defined as an electric vehicle under SMC 15.10.239.

Section 21. A new Section 15.10.470.07 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

15.10.470.07 Plug-in Hybrid Electric Vehicle (PHEV)

Means an electric vehicle that (1) contains an internal combustion engine, and
also allows power to be delivered to the drive wheels by an electric motor; (2) is
able to recharge its battery by connecting to the grid or other off-board electrical
source; and (3) has the ability to travel short distances (typically 10 miles or
more) powered all, or substantially all, by electricity.

Section 22. A new Section 15.10.510.02 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

15.10.510.02 Rapid or DC Fast Charging Station

Means an industrial grade electrical outlet that allow for faster recharging of
electric vehicle batteries through higher power levels, which meets or exceeds any
standards, codes, and regulations set forth by Chapter 19.28 RCW and consistent
with rules adopted under RCW 19.27.540.

Section 23. A new Chapter 15.40 of the SeaTac Municipal Code is hereby added to
read as follows:

Chapter 15.40 — Electric Vehicle Infrastructure

SECTIONS

15.40.010 Purpose

15.40.020 Electric Vehicle Infrastructure — Where Allowed

15.40.030 Battery Charging Station or Rapid Charging Station — Retrofitting in
Existing Development

15.40.040 Electric Vehicle Charging Station Spaces — Allowed as Required Spaces

15.40.050 Off-street Electric Vehicle Charging Station Spaces

15.40.060  Accessible Electric Vehicle Charging Stations

15.40.070 Electric Vehicle Charging Station Spaces - Signage

15.40.080 Stacking Spaces for Electric Vehicle Battery Exchange Stations

15.40.010 Purpose

Page 17



15.40.020

15.15.030

To establish “electric vehicle infrastructure” (EVI) regulations for the City
to allow EVI and to meet the intent of the Revised Code of Washington
(RCW) 35.63.126 requiring the City to allow EVI in all zones except for
residential zones.

Electric Vehicle Infrastructure — Where Allowed

Electric vehicle infrastructure is allowed as specified in the use charts under
SeaTac Municipal Code (SMC) Sections 15.12.060, 15.35.150, and
15.38.150.

Battery Charging Station or Rapid Charging Station — Retrofitting in
Existing Development

A.

Required off-street parking spaces within any existing development
listed within the land use charts listed below may be converted to
battery charging station spaces or rapid charging station spaces for
battery electric vehicles (BEV’s) and plug-in hybrid electric vehicles
(PHEV’s), subject to the restrictions cited in the use charts, provided
that the battery charging and/or rapid charging stations are accessory
to the permitted use/s on the property.

e SMC 15.12.030 - Recreational/Cultural Uses

e SMC 15.12.040 - General Uses

e SMC 15.12.050 - Governmental/Office Uses

e SMC 15.12.060 - Retail/Commercial Uses

e SMC 15.12.070 - Manufacturing Uses

e SMC 15.35.150 - Retail/Commercial Uses (City Center)

e SMC 15.38.150 - Retail/Commercial Uses (S. 154™ Station Area)

At least .65 spaces shall be set-aside as “electric vehicle waiting
spaces” for each Level 3 publicly owned public electric vehicle
charging station provided on site. Waiting spaces for Level 1 and 2
publicly owned public electric vehicle charging stations shall not be
required

The use of any charging station on-site shall not obstruct any vehicular
or pedestrian traffic on-site (such as waiting for a charging station
space within a drive-aisle or a designated pedestrian crossing) or
within a public right-of-way (ROW).

Battery or rapid charging station spaces shall be designated for

charging electric vehicles only as provided under SMC 15.40.070.
Non-electric vehicles or non charging BEV’s of PHEV’s shall not be

Page 18



allowed. The type of signage designating these spaces shall be
approved by the City Manager or his designee.

15.40.040 Electric Vehicle Charging Station Spaces — Allowed as Required Spaces

A.

Electric vehicle charging station spaces shall be allowed to be used in
the computation of required off-street parking spaces as provided
under SMC 15.15.030, provided; that the electric vehicle charging
station/s is accessory to the primary use of the property.

If a publicly owned and publicly available Level 3 electric vehicle
charging station/s is provided on-site, .65 “electric vehicle waiting
spaces” shall also be provided for each electric vehicle charging
station. These spaces shall be in addition to the off-street parking
spaces required under SMC 15.15.030.

15.40.050 Off- street Electric Vehicle Charging Station Spaces

A.

B.

Number. No minimum number of charging station spaces is required.

Location and Design Criteria. The provision of electric vehicle
parking will vary based on the design and use of the primary parking
lot. The following required and additional locational and design
criteria are provided in recognition of the various parking lot layout
options.

1. Where provided, parking for electric vehicle charging purposes is
required to include the following:

a.  Signage. Signage, as required under SMC 15.40.080 for
each charging station space, shall be posted indicating the
space is only for electric vehicle charging purposes. Days
and hours of operations shall be included if time limits or
tow away provisions are to be enforced.

b.  Maintenance. Charging station equipment shall be
maintained in all respects, including the functioning of the
charging equipment. A phone number or other contact
information shall be provided on the charging station
equipment for reporting when the equipment is not
functioning or other problems are encountered.

c.  Accessibility. Where charging station equipment is
provided within an adjacent pedestrian circulation area,
such as a sidewalk or accessible route to the building
entrance, the charging equipment shall be located so as not

Page 19



to interfere with accessibility requirements of WAC 51-50-
005s.

d.  Lighting. Where charging station equipment is installed,
adequate site lighting shall exist, unless charging is for
daytime purposes only.

2. Parking for electric vehicles should also consider the following:

a.  Notification. Information on the charging station,
identifying voltage and amperage levels and any time of
use, fees, or safety information.

b.  Signage. Installation of directional signs at the parking lot
entrance and at appropriate decision points to effectively
guide motorists to the charging station space(s).

C. Data Collection. To allow for maintenance and notification, owners
of any private new electric vehicle infrastructure station that will be
publicly available (see definition “electric vehicle charging station —
public™), shall provide information on the station’s geographic
location, date of installation, equipment type and model, and owner
contact information. This information shall be submitted to the
Department of Planning and Community Development.

15.40.060  Accessible Electric Vehicle Charging Stations

Where electric vehicle charging stations are provided in parking lots or
parking garages, accessible electric vehicle charging stations shall be
provided as follows:

A. Accessible electric vehicle charging stations shall be provided in the
ratios shown on the following table.

‘Numberof Minimum Accessible :
| EV Charging | EV Charging
, Stations : Stations
1-50 1
51-100 2
101-150 3
151-200 4
201-250 S
251-300 6

Page 20



B.  Accessible electric vehicle charging stations should be located in close
proximity to the building or facility entrance and shall be connected to
a barrier-free accessible route of travel. It is not necessary to designate
the accessible electric vehicle charging station exclusively for the use
of disabled persons. Below are two options for providing for
accessible electric vehicle charging stations.

Figure 15.40.060a - Off-street accessible electric +

% ,ﬁi{ A Winpslslons
LG e iy o N e ‘
Designated £ i } |
Acopssibly Spane - { - i ; RSP |
wilh 611 ¢ 56" pgutar L Regular Regular 1 Stiping of barrlsr s i
accessitle shle ‘;’g;&g i ‘;ﬁ;z‘;g i F;:;;:?g Ciute ot reruired L

A ! : L

k | ]

& 7 | |

URURE SR NI SRS e

Accessible EV Charging Station e

*» includes charging equipment, signage, i
and barrier free routes to charging
equipment and the building.

* The barrier free area adjacent to the
Accessible BV Station shail be striped and

be @ minimum of 44° wide. L iy
/ Rasgisar

: i
EV Charging Station Parking !
« Charging equipment and signags ey l ;

Puget Sound area parking garage.

Photo by ECOtality North America.

Y )
Désignezt@d
Sivessible Bpace |
ith S0 or 95" i;eg&:im [ 29@&3:
el arklng | Parking
3@33"“@'? ff"l" Space | Bpave
‘ |
i %‘ i
Regular
Parking
Becessible BV Charging Station Spuce

* includes charging squipment, signage.
and barrier free routes to charghng
equipmant and the building. ﬁ”ﬁgﬁ“

* The barrier free area adjacent o the ;;;a;g
Designated Acupssible Space shall be
siriped and be 60" or 98" wide.

EV Charging Station
« Charging equipment and signage = === == Beach CA.

Photo by LightMoves.

15.40.070  Electric Vehicle Charging Station Spaces - Signage

Page 21



A. Off- street public electric vehicle charging station spaces shall provide

the following signage.

Figure 15.40.070a Directional — Off-street Parking Lot or Parking
Garage

ELEC’FRlC
| VEHICLE
CHARGENG

127 x 127

1237 X 63)

S

Comment: The directional sign for an on-site parking lot or parking
garage should be used in the parking facility with a directional arrow at

all decision points.

Page 22



Figure 15.40.070b - Off-street EV Parking — Parking Space with
Charging Station Equipment

| ELECTRIC
VEHICLE

CHARGING

STATION

127 x 127

s

EXCEPTFOR|
ELECTRIC
VEHICLE
CHARGING |

CHARGING| _

7AM T0 BPM

Comment: Combination sign identifying space as an electric vehicle
charging station, prohibiting non-electric vehicles, with charging time
limits. The use of time limits is optional. The blue/white and red/black
signs define that only an electric vehicle that is charging can use the
spaces. The green sign defines time limits for how long an electric
vehicle can be in the space during the specified hours. Outside of the
specified hours, electric vehicles can charge for an indefinite period of
time.

Page 23



15.40.080 Stacking Spaces for Electric Vehicle Battery Exchange Stations

Electric vehicle battery exchange stations shall provide three (3) stacking
spaces. A stacking space shall be an area measuring eight (8) feet by twenty
(20) feet with direct forward access to the battery exchange bay. A stacking
space shall be located to prevent any vehicles from extending onto the
public right-of-way, or interfering with any pedestrian circulation, traffic
maneuvering, or other required parking areas. Stacking spaces may not be
counted as required off-street parking spaces.

Section 24.  The City Clerk is directed to forward a copy of this Ordinance to the
Washington State Department of Community, Trade and Economic Development within
ten (10) days after adoption, and to the King County Assessor.

Section 25.  If any provision of this Ordinance or its application to any person or
circumstance is held invalid, the remainder of the Ordinance or the application of the
provision to other persons or circumstances shall not be affected.

Section 26. The Ordinance shall be effective five (5) days after passage and
publication.

ADOPTED this Z4¥ day of Pty ber, 2010, and signed in authentication

thereof on this o’s’é% day of Od;‘dé% ,2010.

CITY OF SEATAC

C ij & )Mmd

derson, Mayor

ATTEST:

/@Z Lt

Krristma Gregg, Clty Clerk {f {J

Approved as to Form:

Mah s Mairande Bedtrto

Mary Miraifte Bartolo, City Attorney

[Effective Date_ //—06 ~/O ]

[Electric Vehicle Infrastructure]

Page 24



ORDINANCE NO. _10-1025

An ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of SeaTac,
Washington, amending portions of the City of SeaTac
Comprehensive Plan.

WHEREAS, pursuant to the requirements of the Washington State Growth Management
Act, the City of SeaTac is required to develop and adopt a Comprehensive Plan!which plan is
required to include various elements for land use, housing, transportation, capital facilities and
utilities, and which may include other elements such as, community image, economic vitality,

environmental management, parks, recreation and open space, and human services; and

WHEREAS, the City adopted its Comprehensive Plan in December, 1994, after study,

review, community input and public hearings; and

WHEREAS, the State Growth Management Act (RCW 36.70A.130) requires that cach
comprehensive land use plan and development regulations be subject to continuing review and

evaluation by the county or city that adopted them; and

WHEREAS, the State Growth Management Act provides for amendments to the

Comprehensive Plan no more than once per year; and

WHEREAS, the City Council authorized, by Resolution No. 97-001, a process for

amending the Comprehensive Plan; and

WHEREAS, it is necessary to update the Comprehensive Plan Capital Facilities
Element, 6-year Capital Facilities Plan, and other sections as identified through public process;

and

WHEREAS, procedures for amending the Plan have been implemented in 2010,

including efforts to solicit public input, acceptance of proposals for Comprehensive Plan



amendments, evaluation according to preliminary and final criteria; and

WHEREAS, the environmental impacts of the proposed amendments have been
assessed, and a Mitigated Determination of Nonsignificance, File No. SEP10-00006, was issued

August 20, 2010; and

WHEREAS, after a public hearing on October 19, 2010 to consider proposed
amendments to the Comprehensive Plan, the Planning Commission recommended adoption of
proposed amendments to the Comprehensive Plan, and made its recommendation to the to the

City Council; and

WHEREAS, after consideration of testimony received at the Public Hearing sessions, the
Department of Planning and Community Development has recommended to the City Council
adoption of the proposed amendments to the Comprehensive Plan as shown in the Final Docket

Staff Report; and

WHEREAS, copies of these proposed amendments were filed with the Washington
Department of Commerce not less than sixty days prior to final action, pursuant to RCW

36.70A.106 and WAC 365-195-620; and

WHEREAS, all of the foregoing recitals are deemed by the City Council to be findings

of fact;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SEATAC,
WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN as follows:

Section 1. The City of SeaTac Comprehensive Plan, adopted on December 20, 1994,

and amended annually in subsequent years, is hereby amended as set forth in Exhibit A.

A copy of the amendments shall be maintained on file with the Office of the City Clerk
for public inspection.

Page 2



Section 2. The City Clerk is directed to transmit a complete and accurate copy of this
Ordinance to the Washington Department of Commerce, Growth Management Services
Division within ten days after final adoption, pursuant to RCW 36.70A.106 and WAC
365-195-620. The City Clerk is also directed to transmit a complete and accurate copy of
this Ordinance to the Puget Sound Regional Council (PSRC), pursuant to RCW
36.70A.100 and RCW 36.70A.210. The Clerk is further directed to transmit a copy of
this Ordinance, together with copies of other Ordinances amending development
regulations adopted within the preceding twelve months, to the King County Assessor by
the ensuing 31% day of July, pursuant to RCW 35A.63.260.

Section 3. If any provision of this act or its application to any person or circumstance
is held invalid, the remainder of the act or the application of the provision to other
persons or circumstances shall not be affected.

Section 4. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after passage
and publication.

ADOPTED this a ﬂfh day of November, 2010 and signed in authentication

thereof this ali {’b day of November, 2010.

CITY OF SEATAC

bod Ao, [ AR
erson, Mayor
ATTEST:

stina Gregg, City Clerk

Approved as to Form:

Moo I iande Batdot

Mary Mix%ltefBartolo, City Attorney

[Effective Date: /QZ [;[ / /{ 2 ]

[2010 Comprehensive Plan Amendments]

Page 3



Exhibit A

2010 Comprehensive Plan Amendments



Map Amendments



Map Amendment #A-1



2010 Proposed Amendments to the Comprehensive Plan
Land Use Plan Map

Map Amendment #A-1

Shaded Area Proposed for Map Change

/
[
.

S 200TH 8T

INTERNATlONAL BLVD

32NDAVE S

S 2018T ST

30THAVE S
s

— ~ N
S 202ND ST
\
Current Land Use Designation: Proposed Land Use Designation:
RESIDENTIAL LOW DENSITY RESIDENTIAL HIGH DENSITY
Current Zoning Designation: Proposed Zoning Designation:
UH-1,800

UL-7,200

City of SeaTac Department of Planning and Community Development
May 10, 2010




Map Amendment #A-2



&

2010 Proposed Amendments to the Comprehensive Plan

Land Use Plan Map
Map Amendment #A-2

Shaded Area Proposed for Map Change

1]

S 187TH 8T

T —

LT

S 188TH ST

33RDAVE S

33RDAVE S

(New YMCA)

J

34THAVE S

— /

37THAVE S

Current Land Use Designation: Proposed Land Use Designation:
RESIDENTIAL LOW DENSITY OFFICE/COMMERCIAL/MIXED USE

Current Zoning Designation: Proposed Zoning Designation:
UL-5,000 O/CIMU (OFFICE/COMMERCIAL/MIXED USE)

- City of SeaTac Depariment of Planning and Community Development
May 10, 2010



Map Amendment #A-3



“

2010 Proposed Amendments to the Comprehensive Plan
Land Use Plan Map

Map Amendment #A-3

Shaded Area Proposed for Map Change

| 7 '

i H
i !

[
/ f ]
Y B
/ / ! ” :
/ i I Se— 1Y —
/ / | . -
/ / | % &
f | 5 =
,~”“" m
I | ]
S 172ND ST

]
32ND AVE S

Current Land Use Designation:
COMMERCIAL MEDIUM DENSITY

Current Zoning Designation:

Proposed Land Use Designation:
COMMERCIAL HIGH DENSITY

Proposed Zoning Designation:

CB-C
(COMMUNITY BUSINESS IN URBAN CENTER)

O/CM (OFFICE/COMMERCIAL MEDIUM)

City of SeaTac Department of Planning and Community Development
May 10, 2010




Map Amendment #A-4

Not Adopted



Map Amendment #B-1



J Airport

/;:;71} Airport Transition ST

Commercial Parking/
Auto Rental/Sales

Employee Parking

B oo
B nouenn

Institutionat

Mobile Home

Multi-Famity

B oriceprotessionet
; . Open Space/Park/Recreation

Public/Quasi-Public Facility

| Single-Family

l Vacant

] E‘:] City Center Boundary
G Urban Center Boundary
S City Limits

A" Future SR-509 Right-of-Way

& Boorgy

szt

Ee] . RB00 Fest <
FTETTy

kel 05 Miles
e Freossd Depaae 1, WG

&

s Gty ot S R

ETHAVES

T

e, Bk pusposns

SGUTHCENER Piey

sﬁiﬁ-ﬂ“ o

o

7L dYIN « NYTd IAISNIHINANO



Map Amendment #B-2

Withdrawn

(There are no changes to this map this year.
This was a “placeholder” amendment to allow
for updating this map if new information about
wetlands or streams came to the City through

studies required by permit processes.)

Map Amendment #B-3

Withdrawn

(There are no changes to this map this year.
This was a “placeholder” amendment to allow
for updating this map, anticipating new
information about Wellhead Protection Areas
from the Highline Water District.)



Subarea Plan
Amendments



Subarea Plan
Amendment #S-1



Rescind SeaTac/Airport

Station Area Plan






Amend sections of the City Center Plan to
incorporate policies in revised Station Area Plan

as follows:

1. Prohibit New Surface Park-and-Fly
Operations

2. Remove the Collector Streets from Figure
5.1 (Map)

And, in the absence of a map showing future
street locations

3. Update policies for new development to
provide adequate vehicular and pedestrian
access and circulation

AND

4. Include updated description/background
information regarding rail station location



Council Amended the Ordinance at the
November 29, 2010 Special Council
Meeting to also incorporate the following
two policies into the City Center Plan:
5. Create parking management practices to

discourage
“hide-&-ride” parking

AND

6. Reduce traffic mitigation fees (traffic
impact reduction allowance) to encourage
desired developments



1. Prohibit New Surface Park-and-
Fly Operations



City Center Plan

Components of the Plan

Amendments to Implement the Recommendation “City Center
Plan and regulations be amended to specify no new surface

park-and-fly allowed:”

Land Use

Policy LU-1A: Promote a
pedestrian-friendly and
transit supportive land use
pattern for future
development projects.

Provide for phased
implementation of the City
Center Plan consistent with
the adopted Capital Facilities
Plan, phasing of regional
projects, and timing of
private-sector developments.

Evaluate the zoning map and
phasing plan to rezone
properties in conjunction
with the King County TDR
program.

Adopt development
standards that require
pedestrian-oriented site
design and pedestrian-
friendly building design.

commercial susface-parking

{park-and-flv) uses enby-as

Preclude parking uses
immediately adjacent to
International Boulevard.

Work with the Port of Seattle
and businesses to serve the
long-term parking market.

Adopt development
standards that require a
maximum building setback
along International
Boulevard of twenty feet,
and of ten feet along other
public or private streets.

City Council

City Council

City Council

City Council

City Council

City Council

City Council

Immediate

Immediate/As
needed

Immediate

Immediate

Immediate

Short-term

Immediate

DECEMBER 1999

DRAFT 2010 AMENDMENTS 11/17/10




City Center Plan Components of the Plan

Policy LU-14: Continued e Require public agencies that | City Council Long-term
provide new high capacity
transit service to locate
transit stops and/or stations
within % mile of all areas
within the City Center area
when possible.

DECEMBER 1999 DRAFT 2010 AMENDMENTS 11/17/10 5-31



City Center Plan

Components of the Plan

Economic Vitality

Policy EV-14: Create a
favorable business climate
through segregating
incompatible land uses,
providing business incentives,
and forming public/private
partnerships.

Adopt development
standards that segregate
hotel/motel and residential
uses to minimize potential
conflicts and reduce
potential permitting
conflicts.

Partner with the Southwest
King County Chamber of
Commerce to improve
marketing efforts.

City Council
City Staff

City Council
City Staff

Immediate

Short Term

Policy EV-1B: Facilitate a
community-oriented business
district by providing for
appropriate residential and
commercial development.

Provide zoning sufficient to
encourage small-scale
commercial uses to develop
near "Main Street" in close
proximity to high-density
residential areas.

Require interconnected
arterials and collector streets

to enhance access to and
through blocks.

Provide on-street parking on
32" (Main Street) to
enhance retail business.

Partner with Sound Transit
and the Port of Seattle to
enhance pedestrian mobility
through provision of
pedestrian overpasses,
moving sidewalks, and/or
automated people mover
systems.

City Council

City Staff

City Council
City Staff

City Council
City Staff

City Council
City Staff

Short Term

Immediate

Immediate

Short Term

DECEMBER 1999

DRAFT 2010 AMENDMENTS 1‘1/ 17/10




City Center Plan

Components of the Plan

Policy EV-1C: Encourage
multiple use facilities for
visitors and residents through
parking restrictions and
incentive-based programs.

Adopt development
standards that limit parking
uses.

Restrict parking uses
immediately adjacent to
International Boulevard.

Adopt development
standards for parking
facilities that require pre-
design to accommodate non-
parking uses, are safe and
attractive at all hours, and
that incorporate safe and
convenient pedestrian
access.

Permit-Prohibit surface low-
intensitv-commercial surface
parking (park-and-flv} uses

Ixioy intaeima lhaoio
ES RV By L ARV S TLER o)

Adopt development
standards that include
incentives for commercial
parking uses through
provision of public
amenities.

Permit flexibility in mixed
use development through
vertical or horizontal
configurations.

City Council
City Staff

City Council
City Staff

City Council
City Staff

City Council
City Staff

City Council
City Staff

City Council
City Staff

Immediate
Immediate

Immediate

Immediate

Immediate

Immediate

DECEMBER 1999

DRAFT 2010 AMENDMENTS 11/17/10

5-52




2. Remove the Collector Streets from
Figure 5.1 (Map)

Note: The following language will be included
in the notes section of this map in the revised
version.

“New local access streets will be developed as
new development occurs, resulting over time
in a network of connected streets that provide
for vehicular and pedestrian access and
circulation.”



v:,ﬁ

R

C

63

R T
St Ly

"

22

£

XAL

"a%4

o

Akt

s

ey
¥,

K2

L0 2as
o

R

S,
R
e

I
XX

TR
K

R

KB

o)

%

>,

Lol

&
-

X2
Ty ——
ZAR AR
LR
=

s

A

Sy

A

o,

gp

2SS

LEGEND
smamn L/GHT RAIL ROUTE
[T UGHT RAIL STATION

o,

X 24

5%

game  MINOR ARTERIAL

R Phiecror

e TRAILSIPEDESTRIAN
IMPROVEMENTS

FEDESTRIAN CONNEGTIONS

724 IMC = INTERMODAL CENIER
SXEEE NEAT= NORTHEND
KL AIATION TERMINAL

WETLANDSISTORMWATER
FACILITIES WATH PUBLIC
ACCESS

PLAZAJOPEN SPACE

INTERSECTION WITH
PEDESTRIAN EMPHASIS

AND OPEN SPACE

QPEN TU ALL VEHICLES

-

LOCAL STREET CLOSURE

FUTURE CITY GF
SEATAC CITY HALL

' AUTOMATED PEOPLE MOVER

ZONING CHANGES

e B o L B e

1 CB-C - COMMUNITY BUSINESS
WITHIN URBAN CENTER

oM

ol

OFFICE { COMMERGIAL/
MIXED USE

«‘3:&\?’
&5

SGAE  NOTE: SRS508/SQUTH
ACCESS EXPRESSWAY
QPEN TO ALL TRAFFIC
WITH ACCESS TO AND
FROM 15,
HALF INTERSECTION AT S.

1 200TH ST.

REGIQNAL ACCESS - YEAR
2020 WITH LOCAL ACCESS
AT §. 200THST.

[

UHS00 - SUBJECT TO
. PROPERYY-SPECIFIC
! CONDITIONS

H

14wy

g et

\

28thAve S

i
£

o

- Main Street
(modified)

.

[N

YEAR 2020 Figure 5.1



3. Update policies for new
development to provide adequate
vehicular and pedestrian access and
circulation



City Center Plan Components of the Plan

Amendments to Implement the Recommendation “In the
absence of a map showing a future street network, City
Center Plan be amended to include policy for new
development to provide adequate vehicular and pedestrian
access and circulation:”

Land Use/Zoning

GOAL 1

To create a vibrant City Center that encourages high-quality development
and is linked to mass transit facilities.

Policy LU-1A: Promote a pedestrian-friendly and transit-supportive land use
pattern for future development projects.

Discussion

Developments that include a mix of uses in close walking distance of each other will encourage people to
park once and walk to various uses. Developments with safe and clear pedestrian connections, urban-scale
blocks with pedestrian amenities, active street edges rather than blank facades, and proximity to transit
service will reduce the need to use automobiles.

Policy LU-1B: Encourage high-intensity commercial uses to locate along/near
International Boulevard with more community-oriented uses to be located in the eastern
portions of the City Center.

Discussion

The area along International Boulevard should continue to serve as a regional commercial area catering to
high intensity Airport needs. These areas can take advantage of regional traffic flow on International
Boulevard and the short distance to Airport facilities. Main Street (32" Avenue) will provide accessibility
for neighborhood-scale (medium intensity) commercial and residential uses as well as some Airport-
related commercial uses. This pedestrian-friendly street is intended to be lined with a mixture of
community-oriented retail and commercial uses, a mixture of housing types for various income levels,
and provide civic gathering spaces and parks.

Figure 5.1 shows the zoning along Main Street as Office/Commercial Medium (O/CM),
Office/Commercial Mixed-Use (O/C/MU), or Townhouse. As noted in the preceding paragraph, Main
Street is intended to provide access to neighborhood scale services in the eastern portlons of the City
Center. The circulation concept for the City Center relies on the notion that werapdoestions-on-the-man
14n7« iaatt A{«( NP > T eTmas e o smcle oheft 1 evedlue ouar

SARGE O . o
pe ¥ - W AW IRt L) ;,'g FOF AV SSNBEE DRI RS S 3 RS 8 2 4~ 4

Hme new éowi access streets will be developed as new development occurs, resulting over time in 2

DECEMBER 1999 DRAFT 2010 AMENDMENTS 11/17/10 5-25



City Center Plan Components of the Plan

network of connected streets that provide for vehicular and pedestrian access and circulation {(internal and
external) that serves the needs of the business, residential, and vigitor communities. Figures 5.1a and 5.1b
illustrate alternatives for providing access through the Bow Lake Center area. In keeping with the intent
of Policy LU-1B, the zoning shown adjacent to Main Street in Figure 5.1 would shift with the street
location alternative chosen as this area develops.

High intensity commercial areas along International Boulevard are anticipated to include hotels, offices,
Park-&-Fly garages, services, retail, transit, and entertainment uses. There is no change in the extent of
the “high intensity” commercial area. Unappealing parking garages are to be discouraged as a dominant
land use in the City Center. Development standards
could require parking structures to be set back from

International Boulevard or require that an active
building be placed in front of the structure. This
may limit the parking capacity of parcels fronting
International Boulevard. In addition, parking could
be increased in exchange for public benefits such as
open space, public access routes, and improved
aesthetics.

The types of buildings allowed in the high intensity
commercial areas include a mix of large and medium
sized hotels, office buildings, and parking garages.

Large hotels may develop from ten to fourteen

stories with stand-alone parking structures. These
may be limited by FAA height restrictions.

Medium sized hotel/motel projects with surface
parking lots as well as parking underneath the
rooms may be up to four stories.

i
we—

oe—

Large office buildings may be eight to twelve stories
high with a structured parking garage. These may
be limited by FAA height restrictions.

DECEMBER 1999 DRAFT 2010 AMENDMENTS 11/17/10 5-26



City Center Plan Components of the Plan

TRANSPORTATION/ROADS
GOAL 1

To provide safe and efficient vehicular access to, from and through the City
Center.

Policy T-1A: Create a new “Main Street” along 32" Avenue South and provide adequate
connections to existing and future City Center streets.

Discussion

An alternative north-south arterial is necessary to allow City Center residents and employees to move
through the City Center area without being entirely dependant upon access to International Boulevard. As
a state route, International Boulevard will continue to carry large volumes of regional traffic. A system of
smaller collector streets will allow local traffic to reach the major arterials that provide regional access (S.
188™ St. and International Boulevard). Main Street, with several existing and potential east-west
connections to International Boulevard, will become the primary local traffic artery for the City Center.
This route will be designed to accommodate local traffic needs only, and will have a relatively low design
speed and insufficient capacity to serve as a bypass to International Boulevard for pass-through regional
traffic.

Typical minor arterial street section.

DECEMBER 1999 DRAFT 2010 AMENDMENTS 11/17/10 5-39



City Center Plan Components of the Plan

Policy T-1B: Ensure adequate vehicular access from the City Center to International
Boulevard and other local and regional facilities.

Discussion

Good access to major transportation modes and significant commercial developments is key to realizing
the development potential of much of the City Center. Multiple access ways will improve the ability to
move people, goods, and services throughout the City Center as well as access facilities outside of the
City Center.

Policy T-1C: Create a ﬂewwcmmecie& network of public and private collector streets to

promote provide-vehicularand-pedestrian access_and provide vehicular circulation.
Discussion

Fhe e Center o Mas-ceperal! ’y; . e
bransheu-the CiteContepares— =-tThe exact locatlon of future coﬂector streets is not specnﬁed»@\%
the eral consistency-with<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>